

Pace

RFQ# 421228

WHITE=NO BID

| | | TOTAL | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|-------------------------|--------|-------------|------------------------|------------------------|---------------------|-------|-------------------|--------------------|---------|-------------|----------|---------------------|-------|-----------------------|--------|-----------------|---------|----------|---------|--|
| | | 0 | | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | |
| Green=Disqualified | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Sku | Winning bid | Rome Truck - NO BID | Vehicle Maintenance | Interstate Power | CBM | Suburban Truck | MW Bus - NO BID | Prevost | Area Diesel | Eldorado | Diesel Emissions | Kirks | Hydraulic Electric | Gillig | Mohawk | Coffman | Muncie | Noepart | |
| NO # of Bids | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 7 | 81156 | 0.60 | | | | | | | 1.58 | | | 8.50 | | 1.40 | 1.14 | 0.60 | | 57.05 | 1.24 | |
| Gillig | 232425 | - | | | | | | | stock | | | unapproved part | | stock | stock | unapproved part | | 21d | stock | |
| 6 | 81313 | 36.40 | | | | 36.40 | | | 97.02 | 87.27 | | | | | | 39.70 | 88.46 | 48.08 | | |
| CBM | 232438 | - | | | | stock | | | 60d | stock | | | | | | unapproved part | stock | stock | | |
| 3 | 81378 | 18.49 | | | | | | | | | 80.76 | | | | | 18.49 | | 22.42 | | |
| Mohawk | 232430 | - | | | | | | | | | 1w | | | | | stock | | 30d | | |
| 6 | 81441 | 40.00 | | | | 44.37 | | | | 42.77 | | | | 40.00 | | 52.40 | 44.57 | 43.50 | | |
| Hydraulic Electric | 232426 | - | | | | stock | | | | stock | | | | stock | | unapproved part | stock | stock | | |
| 5 | 81444 | 59.40 | | | | | | | 109.23 | | | | | | 73.00 | 59.40 | | 75.57 | 72.08 | |
| Mohawk | 232430 | - | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | 2w | stock | | 60d | 6w | |
| 4 | 81503 | 10.97 | | | | | | | | 19.24 | | | | | | 10.97 | 20.19 | 23.89 | | |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | unapproved part | stock | 21d | | |
| 5 | 81516 | 8.68 | | | | 11.87 | | | | 8.68 | | | | | | 11.84 | 9.45 | 9.35 | | |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | - | | | | stock | | | | stock | | | | | | 5w | stock | stock | | |
| 9 | 81521 | 15.98 | | 19.84 | 19.35 | | 19.35 | | 38.83 | | | | 20.00 | | | 19.14 | 18.99 | 15.98 | 18.22 | |
| Availability - Neopart | 232453 | - | | stock | 20d | | stock | | 60d | | | | | | | 5w | stock | 60d | stock | |
| 4 | 81533 | 11.69 | | | | | | | | 43.16 | | | | | | 11.69 | 43.66 | 12.65 | | |
| Mohawk | 232430 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | stock | stock | stock | | |
| 2 | 81534 | 38.70 | | | | | | | | | 60.00 | | | | | | | 38.70 | | |
| Availability - Eldorado | 232436 | - | | | | | | | | | 1w | | | | | | | 120d | | |
| 3 | 810026 | 899.69 | | | | | | | | 899.69 | | | | | | | 961.07 | 1,030.05 | | |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | | 90d | 21d | | |
| 4 | 810027 | 497.88 | | | | | | | | 497.88 | | | | | | | 526.32 | 542.32 | 541.03 | |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | | stock | 30d | stock | |

Pace

RFQ# 421228

WHITE=NO BID

| | | TOTAL | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|--------------------|--------|-------------|------------------------|------------------------|---------------------|-----|-------------------|--------------------|---------|-------------|----------|---------------------|-------|-----------------------|--------|--------------------|---------|--------|---------|
| | | 0 | | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 |
| Green=Disqualified | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | SKU | Winning bid | Rome Truck - NO BID | Vehicle Maintenance | Interstate Power | CBM | Suburban Truck | MW Bus - NO BID | Prevost | Area Diesel | Eldorado | Diesel Emissions | Kirks | Hydraulic Electric | Gillig | Mohawk | Coffman | Muncie | Noepart |
| NO # of Bids | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 2 | 810180 | 6.33 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 6.33 | 7.40 | |
| Coffman | 232424 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | stock | 21d | |
| 3 | 810181 | 2.37 | | | | | | | | 2.37 | | | | | | | 2.43 | 2.82 | |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | | stock | 30d | |
| 2 | 810220 | 420.84 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 420.84 | 492.25 | |
| Coffman | 232424 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 90d | 30d | |
| 2 | 810262 | 9.40 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 9.40 | 11.08 | |
| Coffman | 232424 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | stock | 30d | |
| 3 | 810303 | 401.69 | | | | | | | | 401.69 | | | | | | | 734.16 | 479.75 | |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | | 90d | 21d | |
| 4 | 810304 | 30.06 | | | | | | | | 31.69 | | | | | | 30.06 | 33.16 | 38.95 | |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | unapproved part | stock | 30d | |
| 3 | 810305 | 160.69 | | | | | | | | 160.69 | | | | | | | 172.86 | 191.15 | |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | | stock | 84d | |
| 2 | 810359 | 197.34 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 197.34 | 231.95 | |
| Coffman | 232424 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | 90d | 30d | |
| 3 | 810360 | 202.69 | | | | | | | | 202.69 | | | | | | | 222.50 | 242.95 | |
| Area Diesel | 232437 | - | | | | | | | | stock | | | | | | | stock | 21d | |