



		RFQ# 421201																			
Pace																					
WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																				
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	MW Bus - NO BID	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	Rome Truck - NO BID	Neopart	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman	Gillig	Area Diesel	Suburban Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Muncie	Kirks	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	Transit Parts 101	Mohawk	Eldorado	
NO # of Bids																					
Eldorado	232436																			stock	
1	140076	742.00																		742.00	
Eldorado	232436	-																		14w	
6	120548	1.29						19.58	2.31		2.35			2.77		1.93			1.29		
Vehicle Maintenance	232417							stock	stock		stock			21d		stock			unapproved part		
1	100247	2.79							2.79												
Coffman	232424								stock												
5	1210003	21.87					22.55		21.87					22.50		28.00			23.94		
Coffman	232424	-					stock		stock					30d		stock			3w		
4	1010001	8.75			11.42					8.75				10.61			11.08				
Gillig	232425	-			stock					stock				30d			60d				
5	1010002	3.64						3.65					3.64	11.43	6.55	11.89					
Hydraulic Electric	232426	-						stock					stock	60d	stock	stock					
3	1210011	78.38						78.38										212.00		168.14	
Aftermarket Parts	232420	-						stock										4w		stock	
3	1010016	2,210.83						3,340.10	2,309.50	2,210.83											
Area Diesel	232437	-						5w	90d		stock										
4	1010018	19.25						20.58	38.21				19.25	43.86							
Hydraulic Electric	232426	-						stock	stock				14d	stock							
3	1210024	181.00						187.55										181.00		251.98	
TP101	232428	-						14w										4w		stock	
6	1210030	290.00						351.75	301.03		299.18		290.00	347.55					362.59		
Hydraulic Electric	232426	-						8w	stock		stock		14d	2 only, need 3					3w		
8	1010028	6.36		8.00				12.77	10.98		11.17		8.00	12.85	8.50				6.36		
Rex Sales	232448	-		stock				stock	stock		stock		stock	30d	stock				unapproved part		

Pace

RFQ# 421201

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	MW Bus - NO BID	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	Rome Truck - NO BID	Neopart	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman	Gillig	Area Diesel	Suburban Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Muncie	Kirks	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	Transit Parts 101	Mohawk	Eldorado
7	1010029	18.44		24.00				47.22	37.54		38.58		35.50	40.12					18.44	
	Rex Sales	232448	-	stock				5w	stock		stock		14d	30d					unapproved part	
7	1010030	88.65					116.90	117.28	96.47		90.86		91.00	94.52					88.65	
	Area Diesel	232437	-				stock	5w	stock		stock		stock	stock					unapproved part	
6	1010032	57.60					76.01	136.93	111.44		113.34		75.00						57.60	
	Hydraulic Electric	232426	-				stock	6w	stock		stock		14d						unapproved part	
4	1010035	91.14						117.50	92.73		91.14			109.05						
	Area Diesel	232437	-					7w	stock		stock			30d						
6	1210070	45.90					56.64	62.81	45.90	59.50						56.95			52.68	
	Coffman	232424	-				stock	6w	7d	4w						stock			2w	
6	1210071	179.55						237.97	193.67		187.69		185.00	202.80					179.55	
	Mohawk	232430	-					5w	stock		stock		14d	stock					stock	
5	1210087	60.95						78.42	65.26		64.52		60.95	76.40						
	Hydraulic Electric	232426	-					7w	stock		stock		14d	30d						
4	1210092	28.45						33.47	28.85		28.45			33.70						
	Area Diesel	232437	-					5w	stock		stock			30d						
4	1210093	33.91						42.50	34.35		33.91			40.15						
	Area Diesel	232437	-					7w	stock		stock			30d						
2	1210097	17.49							17.49					20.15						
	Coffman	232424	-						stock					21d						
2	1010060	2,153.69							2,277.03		2,153.69									
	Area Diesel	232437	-						stock		stock									
7	1010061	876.98		925.00			1,030.40	1,373.50	1,048.67		876.98				884.00				935.00	
	Area Diesel	232437	-	stock			10d	9w	stock		stock				stock				2w	
4	1210113	626.01						841.53	649.65		626.01			763.05						

Pace

RFQ# 421201

WHITE=NO BID

		<b>TOTAL</b>																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

	Sku	Winning bid	MW Bus - NO BID	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	Rome Truck - NO BID	Neopart	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman	Gillig	Area Diesel	Suburban Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Muncie	Kirks	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	Transit Parts 101	Mohawk	Eldorado
--	-----	-------------	-----------------	-----------	------------------	---------------------	---------	-------------------	---------	--------	-------------	----------------	--------------------	--------	-------	---------------------	---------	-------------------	--------	----------

NO # of Bids

Area Diesel	232437	-						5w	stock		stock			30d						
1	1010069	512.95						512.95												
Aftermarket Parts	232420	-						22w												
1	1210130	179.92																		179.92
Eldorado	232436	-																		stock
2	1210132	555.78						555.78		739.44										
Aftermarket Parts	232420	-						7w		12w										
4	1010078	513.28						675.80	539.64		513.28			590.75						
Area Diesel	232437	-						9w	90d		stock			21d						
-	1210138	-																		
		-																		
2	1010084	3,144.97							3,144.97		3,658.09									
Coffman	232424	-							90d		stock									
4	1010086	1,252.85						1,584.35	1,252.85		1,339.97			1,378.25						
Coffman	232424	-						stock	90d		stock			60d						