

Pace

RFQ# 421199

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Rome Truck NO BID	Neopart	Coffman	Kirks	Action Truck Parts	Suburban Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Area Diesel	CBM	Muncie	Prevost	TP101	Mohawk	Eldorado
5	81298	48.50				57.55						48.50	70.10	74.23		66.74	
CBM	232438	-				14d						stock	stock	60d		stock	
3	81378	18.49											22.42			18.49	58.07
Mohawk	232430	-											30d			stock	stock
1	81417	18.83															18.83
Eldorado	232436	-															stock
1	81423	25.33															25.33
Eldorado	232436	-															stock
3	81472	3.99					4.19	8.00					3.99				
Muncie	232427	-					stock	stock					30d				
3	81499	21.44				21.72						21.44	23.94				
Area Diesel	232437	-				stock					stock		stock				
6	81533	11.69	13.61			43.65			28.31		43.16		12.65			11.69	
Mohawk	232430	-	stock			stock			stock		stock		45d			stock	
5	810027	496.99			540.18	523.53				503.00	496.99		618.85				
Area Diesel	232437	-			stock	stock				stock	stock		30d				
2	810050	104.22													104.22		118.76
TP101	232428	-													3w		3w
3	810063	149.69					233.95				149.69		178.30				
Area Diesel	232437	-					stock				stock		30d				
6	810065	9.66				47.08			31.65		46.75	10.95	55.10			9.66	

Pace

RFQ# 421199

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Rome Truck NO BID	Neopart	Coffman	Kirks	Action Truck Parts	Suburban Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Area Diesel	CBM	Muncie	Prevost	TP101	Mohawk	Eldorado
Eldorado	232436	-															8w
2	810220	419.52				419.52							492.25				
Coffman	232424	-				90d							30d				
5	810277	30.29	38.63			30.69		42.00					33.14			30.29	
Availability - Coffman	232424	-	stock			stock		30d					stock			6w	
1	810299	353.83															353.83
Eldorado	232436	-															6w
3	810309	4.50				16.34							5.65			4.50	
Muncie	232427	-				stock							stock			unapproved part	
2	810358	55.65				55.65							66.10				
Coffman	232424	-				stock							30d				