

Pace

RFQ# 421194

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																			
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																					
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	MW Bus - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Battery Service	Neopart	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	P&G Keene	Coffman	Gillig	Action Truck Parts	Hydraulic Electric	Rome Truck - NO BID	Muncie	TP101	Prevost	Mohawk	Kirks	Eldorado
5	71925	4.94							15.40			14.99		10.99		12.78			4.94		
Mohawk	232430	-							stock			stock		stock		stock			stock		
2	71733	80.18							80.18									109.34			
Aftermarket Parts	232420	-							stock									60d			
4	71294	0.14			0.20				0.67							0.15			0.14		
Mohawk	232430	-			stock				stock							stock			stock		
1	72125	101.06																			101.06
Eldorado	232436																				4w
3	71287	0.21			0.43				0.85										0.21		
Availability - Vehicle Maintenance	232417	-			stock				8w										8w		
5	72121	31.51							65.31			55.53				62.45			31.51		59.36
Prevost	232429	-							5w			8w				MOQ		stock			stock
6	71441	6.23							7.15			7.08	8.50			6.23			6.89		15.41
Muncie	232427	-							19w			stock	stock			stock			2w		stock
5	70220	7.95							20.58			15.25				11.33			7.95		35.79
Mohawk	232430	-							stock			stock				stock			stock		stock
5	72057	3.25			3.54				4.12			7.99		3.25					13.36		
Hydraulic Electric	232426	-			stock				stock			stock		stock					stock		
5	72059	398.80							548.08							398.80		693.69	512.23		775.18
Muncie	232427								5w							stock		60d	stock		8w
2	71306	0.36							14.76										0.36		
Mohawk	232430								5w										stock		
2	71357	10.92							10.92												15.88
Aftermarket Parts	232420								stock												stock
6	72135	56.91						59.38	56.91			56.99				61.10		79.80			109.96
Aftermarket Parts	232420						7w		6w			10w				45d		60d			stock

Pace

RFQ# 421194

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																				
	0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																					
	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	MW Bus - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Battery Service	Neopart	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	P&G Keene	Coffman	Gillig	Action Truck Parts	Hydraulic Electric	Rome Truck - NO BID	Muncie	TP101	Prevost	Mohawk	Kirks	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																					
3	71489	220.20												235.00		220.20					239.00
Muncie	232430	-												14d		30d					stock
5	72056	10.45			23.19				16.90		44.66					21.85			10.45		
Aftermarket Parts	232420				stock				stock		stock					45d				unapproved part	
6	72094	14.91			14.91				19.30							21.13		17.28	23.86		25.04
Vehicle Maintenance	232417				stock				5w							30d		60d	2w		3w
5	71442	6.27							11.02				9.00			6.27			7.22		15.41
Muncie	232427	-							stock							30d				stock	stock
1	72144	39.62																			39.62
Eldorado	232436	-																			6w
6	72194	71.10					71.31		71.10				77.00			73.03		95.39			131.44
Aftermarket Parts	232420	-					7w		8w				8w			45d		75d			3w
1	72204	15.65																			15.65
Eldorado	232436	-																			stock
4	72216	144.14							151.00				144.14					227.31			313.23
Gillig	232425	-							9w				stock					stock			6w
3	72264	365.70	588.87						717.04												365.70
Eldorado	232436	-	12w						13w												3w
2	72301	275.00				275.00			300.26												
Battery Service	232419	-				1w			5w												
2	72301	300.00				300.00			300.26												
Battery Service	232419	-				1w			5w												
5	72347	47.05			47.97		59.23		56.81							47.05		59.11			
Muncie	231427	-			stock		6w		3w							stock		60d			
7	72388	36.75					63.15		52.37							65.70		84.86	36.75		76.32
Availability - Gillig	232425	-					7w		9w				stock			42d		75d	4w		stock

Pace

RFQ# 421194

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																					
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0		
Green=Disqualified																							
	NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	I/O Controls	MW Bus - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Battery Service	Neopart	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	P&G Keene	Coffman	Gillig	Action Truck Parts	Hydraulic Electric	Rome Truck - NO BID	Muncie	TP101	Prevost	Mohawk	Kirks	Eldorado	
	1	710006	18.59							18.59													
		Aftermarket Parts	232420	-						stock													
	3	710052	2,585.65														2,585.65					3,096.00	3,317.80
		Muncie	232427	-													60d					stock	14w
	1	710076	290.61																				290.61
		Eldorado	232436	-																			4w
	1	710077	49.99																				49.99
		Eldorado	232436	-																			4w
	3	710128	588.87	588.87						761.85			600.00										
		I/O Controls	232415	-	12w					14w			6w										
	6	710149	269.48						377.26	380.60		331.99	269.48				379.21				359.20		
		Gillig	232425	-					stock	stock		stock	stock				30d				8d		
	1	710156	31.73																				31.73
		Eldorado	232436	-																			4w
	1	710157	37.31																				37.31
		Eldorado	232436	-																			4w
	6	710161	29.68							47.90							32.49	54.60	62.31	43.25			29.68
		Eldorado	232436	-						9w							30d	4w	60d	6w			4w
	6	710170	2,729.66							3,227.48	2,729.66						3,500.65		4,227.86		3,094.00	5,671.81	
		P&G Keene	232422	-						10w	stock						30d		60d		no lead given	6w	
	2	710180	3.50														3.50						10.73
		Muncie	232427	-													30d						stock
	3	710285	1.10							2.13								1.10					1.44
		TP 101	232428	-						11w								3w					1w
	4	710293	3.95							6.15					6.45			3.95					12.72
		TP 101	232428	-						20w					30d			3w					8w

Pace

RFQ# 421194

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																					
	0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																						
	Skus	Winning bid	I/O Controls	MW Bus - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Battery Service	Neopart	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	P&G Keene	Coffman	Gillig	Action Truck Parts	Hydraulic Electric	Rome Truck - NO BID	Muncie	TP101	Prevost	Mohawk	Kirks	Eldorado	
NO # of Bids																						
1	710321	468.73																				468.73
Eldorado	232436	-																				6w
3	710365	41.23			41.23				41.35					47.00								
Vehicle Maintenance	232417	-			stock				24w					14d								
2	710384	615.78							766.28		615.78											
Coffman	232424	-							5w		90d											
2	710386	115.85									115.85						123.15					
Coffman	232424	-									7d						60d					