

Pace

RFQ# 421118

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Neopart	CBM	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	MW Bus - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	P&G	Suburban Truck	Muncie	Kirks	Gillig	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Coffman
NO # of Bids																	
-	81297	-															
NOT AWARDED		-															
4	81089	3.33				3.33						4.90			5.43		4.09
Vehicle Maintenance	232253	-				stock						30d			5w		stock
3	81209	12.29				23.87						21.12	12.29				
Availability - Vehicle Maintenance	232253	-				stock						30d	4 only, no lead on bal of 8				
4	81289	2.29										3.25			3.60	2.29	2.71
Coffman	232257											30d			5w	unapproved part	stock
8	110136	68.46	82.92			68.46	149.25				82.92	79.52	70.00		105.49	77.75	
Vehicle Maintenance	232253	-	20d			stock	60d				stock	30d	stock		7w	21d	
4	81298	48.25				48.25									85.05	64.74	56.76
CBM	232263	-				stock									7w	stock	stock
6	100223	59.24		64.98	135.69							106.08			109.57	59.24	95.09
Neopart	232252	-		stock	stock							stock			6w	unapproved part	stock
3	120502	90.03										90.03		95.00	111.94		
Muncie	232259	-										stock		stock	5w		
-	110142	-															
NOT AWARDED		-															
3	81378	18.49										22.41			34.22	18.49	
Mohawk	232260											30d			stock	stock	
3	81384	5.21										6.12			6.99		5.21

Pace

RFQ# 421118

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Neopart	CBM	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	MW Bus - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	P&G	Suburban Truck	Muncie	Kirks	Gillig	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Coffman
NO # of Bids																	
Coffman	232257											30d			7w		stock
5	81390	250.00								320.00		359.53	250.00		481.14		395.19
Kirks	232267									stock		45d	stock		5w		90d
3	81430	283.08													353.82	351.58	283.08
Coffman	232257														5w	stock	stock
-	140076	-															
NOT AWARDED		-															
4	81441	42.82			47.14										51.24	57.40	42.82
Coffman	232257				stock										stock	8w	stock
4	81503	12.15										22.89			25.73	12.15	19.50
Coffman	232257											7 only, need 10			stock	unapproved part	stock
4	81507	2.69										5.96			6.58	2.69	4.96
Coffman	232257	30.00										30.00			stock	unapproved part	stock
3	81518	5.83										6.31			6.94		5.83
Coffman	232257	-										30d			stock		stock
4	81519	64.00										90.42	64.00		109.21	84.50	
Kirks	232267	-										stock	stock		4w	6w	
4	81533	11.69										12.75			25.65	11.69	42.38
Mohawk	232260	-										45d			stock	stock	90d
2	81534	32.47										38.83			32.47		

Pace

RFQ# 421118

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Neopart	CBM	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	MW Bus - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	P&G	Suburban Truck	Muncie	Kirks	Gillig	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Coffman
NO # of Bids																	
Aftermarket Parts	232258	-										120d			3w		
3	1110000	44.50				49.51						44.50			49.63		
Muncie	232259	-				9w						21d			stock		
6	1210003	17.80		22.55		19.11						21.95			31.36	17.80	21.87
availability - Coffman	232257	-		stock		9w						30d			9w	unapproved part	stock
5	1010003	14.66										32.65	16.60		36.84	14.66	27.35
Kirks	232267	-										30d	stock		5w	unapproved part	stock
2	810026	969.05													1,185.93		969.05
Coffman	232257	-													4w		90d
2	810027	499.53													666.27		499.53
Coffman	232257	-													9w		stock
4	810031	1.91										9.38			9.48	1.91	8.01
Coffman	232257	-										30d			4w	unapproved part	stock
6	1010015	945.00		1,227.60								1,270.65	945.00		1,538.19	968.00	999.03
Kirks	232267	-		stock								45d	stock		13w	stock	stock
2	1010016	2,218.00													3,158.72		2,218.00
Coffman	232257	-													7w		90d
4	810045	380.00		380.00								630.00			697.94		535.98
Neopart	232252	-		stock								30d			7w		stock
4	810046	350.00		350.00											549.79	541.83	386.08
Neopart	232252	-		stock											7w	21d	stock

Pace

RFQ# 421118

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Neopart	CBM	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	MW Bus - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	P&G	Suburban Truck	Muncie	Kirks	Gillig	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Coffman
NO # of Bids																	
-	1310009	-															
NOT AWARDED		-															
2	810064	4,097.16													4,604.25		4,097.16
Coffman	232257	-													7w		stock
5	810065	9.66			10.87							53.95			55.03	9.66	44.94
CBM	232263	-			stock							30d			stock	unapproved part	stock
2	810078	396.35													608.94		396.35
Coffman	232257	-													5w		90d
2	810079	396.35													591.64		396.35
Coffman	232257	-													7w		90d
1	1210035	2.20													2.20		
Aftermarket Parts	232258	-													stock		
3	810086	81.50										87.05			97.90		81.50
Coffman	232257	-										30d			11w		stock
4	810098	239.34										284.45			317.29	298.54	239.34
Coffman	232257	-										stock			6w	stock	stock
5	1010034	38.21		48.75								49.35			49.82	38.21	42.07
Coffman	232257	-		stock								21d			14w	unapproved part	stock
2	810101	209.50													251.30		209.50
Coffman	232257	-													7w		90d

Pace

RFQ# 421118

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																		
	NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Neopart	CBM	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	MW Bus - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	P&G	Suburban Truck	Muncie	Kirks	Gillig	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Coffman
	3	810102	2.99										3.50			3.63		2.99
Coffman		232257	-										30d			5w		stock
	3	1010043	69.50										78.00			87.19		69.50
Coffman		232257	-										90d			6w		stock
	-	1210074	-															
NOT AWARDED			-															
	-	1210078	-															
NOT AWARDED			-															
	4	810154	6.47										9.60			10.65	6.47	8.15
Coffman		232257	-										30d			8w	unapproved part	stock
	3	810157	36.11										45.01			47.72		36.11
Coffman		232257	-										stock			9w		stock
	3	810159	31.95										64.16			70.46		31.95
Coffman		232257	-										30d			9w		stock
	-	810166	-															
NOT AWARDED			-															
	-	1210083	-															
NOT AWARDED			-															
	3	810197	141.77										154.80			165.80		141.77
Coffman		232257	-										30d			7w		stock

Pace

RFQ# 421118

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Neopart	CBM	Vehicle Maintenance	Prevost	MW Bus - NO BID	Rome Truck - NO BID	P&G	Suburban Truck	Muncie	Kirks	Gillig	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Coffman
NO # of Bids																	
3	810207	135.99										147.10			165.33		135.99
Coffman	232257	-										30d			7w		90d
3	810209	19.59										21.00			22.87		19.59
Coffman	232257	-										30d			5w		stock
4	810218	4.13										5.37			5.99	4.13	4.56
Coffman	232257	-										30d			13w	unapproved part	stock
3	810231	247.45										254.25			276.95		247.45
Coffman	232257	-										30d			stock		stock
3	1010060	2,245.80										2,628.55			3,221.66		2,245.80
Coffman	232257	-										30d			7w		stock
6	1010061	890.00		993.60								1,160.00	923.00		1,374.42	890.00	1,029.01
Mohawk	232260	-		stock								30d	stock		9w	stock	stock
4	810241	3.17										3.72			4.17	4.19	3.17
Coffman	232257	-										30d			stock	no lead time given	stock
4	1010068	587.00										728.17	587.00		1,329.39		1,060.76
Kirks	232267	-										stock	stock		stock		90d
3	810282	572.66										609.73			684.94		572.66
Coffman	232257	-										30d			7w		stock
3	1210132	403.40										476.90		405.63	403.40		
Aftermarket Parts	232258	-										65d		16w	stock		
3	1010076	90.49										99.99			114.63		90.49

