

Pace

RFQ# 421113

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																	
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	CBM - NO BID	I/O Controls	Prevost	Kirks	MW Bus	Rome Truck	P&G	Suburban Truck	Gillig	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Mohawk
9	72079	197.26		216.50				301.00	226.00	205.00		197.26		197.99		221.92	223.88	288.32
P&G	232255	-		stock				stock	stock	5d		stock		stock		stock	stock	7w
-	72125	-																
NOT AWARDED		-																
4	71875	4.75									8.75					4.82	4.75	5.10
Aftermarket Parts	232258	-									stock					stock	MOQ	stock
1	72102	74.97														74.97		
NOT AWARDED																30w		
4	71441	6.23												7.08		7.14	6.23	6.75
Muncie	232259	-												no lead time given		5w	30d	stock
4	70220	7.95												15.25		20.86	11.45	7.95
Mohawk	232260	-												stock		stock	stock	stock
4	72057	3.11			3.11									8.25		4.23		13.36
Vehicle Maintenance	232253	-			stock									stock		stock		7w
4	72143	10.50		10.62				14.27								10.50	10.95	
Aftermarket Parts	232258	-		8w				60d								stock	21d	
-	71540	-																
NOT AWARDED		-																
3	72142	9.42		9.42												9.50	9.52	
Neopart	232252			8w												8w	45d	
5	72135	56.91		59.38				79.80						56.99		56.91	61.10	
Aftermarket Parts	232258			8w				60d						8w		13w	45d	
2	71789	0.30														0.51	0.30	

Pace

RFQ# 421113

WHITE=NO BID

	TOTAL																	
	0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	CBM - NO BID	I/O Controls	Prevost	Kirks	MW Bus	Rome Truck	P&G	Suburban Truck	Gillig	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Mohawk
2	710384	600.99													600.99	794.31		
Coffman	232257	-													90d	5w		
1	710385	313.18														313.18		
Aftermarket Parts	232258	-														stock		