

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Diesel Emissions	Kirks	Neopart	MW Bus - NO BID	Area Diesel	CBM	Suburban Truck	P&G	Prevost	Vehicle Maintenance	Interstate Power	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado
3	71733	80.19										109.34				80.19	87.25		
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-										60d				stock	6w		
4	130684	5.57												5.88	5.57	6.65		5.63	
Coffman	232204	-												20d	stock	8w		6w	
3	71287	0.21											0.43			0.87		0.21	
Availability - Vehicle Maintenance	232203	-											stock			8w		10w	
4	71105	0.07										0.10		1.39		0.11		0.07	
Mohawk	232234	-										stock		10d		stock		stock	
4	70220	7.95														20.97	15.25	7.95	36.81
Mohawk	232234	-														stock	stock	stock	1w
4	72143	10.50				10.62						14.27				10.50			24.52
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-				8w						60d				stock			6w
1	71539	36.81																	36.81
Eldorado	232235	-																	1w
8	120488	13.44			22.19				17.69	16.90			13.44	16.90	17.04	20.05		17.87	
Vehicle Maintenance	232203	-			stock				11w	stock			stock	14d	stock	no lead time given		7w	
4	71100	0.07										0.48		1.08		0.11		0.07	
Mohawk	232234	-										stock		10d		3w		stock	
5	72135	56.91				59.38						79.80				56.91	57.99		110.55
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-				8w						60d				90d	10w		6w
4	81061	34.30							47.45						87.68	104.42		34.30	
Mohawk	232234	-							unapproved part						stock	stock		stock	
5	72094	17.28								21.10		17.28				19.74		23.86	30.66
Prevost	232202	-								stock		stock				5w		3w	2w
3	110100	2.23														2.23	2.25	3.45	
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-														stock	stock	stock	
4	71442	7.08														11.34	7.08	7.16	30.66
Gillig	232229	-														stock	stock	stock	1w
1	72120	110.55																	110.55
Eldorado	232235	-																	1w
1	71278	1.17														1.17			
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-														stock			
3	72109	706.47														1,326.87	1,075.00		706.47

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Diesel Emissions	Kirks	Neopart	MW Bus - NO BID	Area Diesel	CBM	Suburban Truck	P&G	Prevost	Vehicle Maintenance	Interstate Power	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado
Eldorado	232235	-														10w	6w		6w
6	81313	34.78							34.78			97.02	72.73		85.88	74.90			42.00
Availability - Aftermarket Parts	232205	-							no lead time given			60d	10d		stock	stock			unapproved part
4	72156	21.46				21.59						29.30				21.46	23.05		
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-				8w						60d				stock	10w		
2	72164	1,175.00														1,353.91	1,175.00		
Gillig	232229	-														14w	6w		
4	72167	37.36				38.02						51.10				37.36	39.99		
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-				stock						60d				8w	10w		
-	110142	-																	
		-																	
2	81376	1.56													1.56	1.96			
Coffman	232204	-													stock	5w			
2	81377	2.85													2.85	3.44			
Coffman	232204	-													stock	5w			
3	100226	1,160.00				1,209.60									1,940.43			1,160.00	
Mohawk	232234	-				10d									90d			2w	
5	100227	935.00			935.00	970.10									1,029.44	1,367.74		940.00	
Kirks	232198	-			stock	10d									stock	123w		2w	
1	120526	425.00	425.00																
Triangle Radiator	232196	-	3d																
4	72216	151.00										227.31				151.00	155.00		331.76
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-										stock				stock	stock		stock
1	81417	24.52																	24.52
Eldorado	232235	-																	stock
1	140076	688.16																	688.16
Eldorado	232235	-																	4w
5	81444	59.40				72.08						109.23				76.50	71.00	59.40	
Mohawk	232234	-				4w						stock				stock	5w	stock	
2	72270	5.34											6.61					5.34	
Mohawk	232234	-											stock						3w
2	72301	221.00								221.00						307.47			
Suburban Truck	232200	-								90d						5w			

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Diesel Emissions	Kirks	Neopart	MW Bus - NO BID	Area Diesel	CBM	Suburban Truck	P&G	Prevost	Vehicle Maintenance	Interstate Power	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado
3	81505	169.16										232.62				188.54	169.16		
Gillig	232229	-										75d				7w	stock		
4	81533	11.69											12.98		42.38	25.79		11.69	
Mohawk	232234	-											7d		stock	stock		stock	
6	1210003	17.20				22.55				19.90			17.20		21.87	31.55			18.24
Vehicle Maintenance	232203	-				stock				unapproved part			2w		stock	9w		unapproved part	
1	710041	178.50														178.50			
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-														13w			
3	1210009	34.90						34.95							34.90	45.17			
Coffman	232204	-						stock							stock	9w			
1	1010005	299.61																	299.61
Eldorado	232235	-																	6w
1	1210011	171.99																	171.99
Eldorado	232235	-																	stock
1	1210012	147.41																	147.41
Eldorado	232235	-																	stock
6	1010011	963.54		1,542.00	999.00	1,144.00									963.54	1,491.32		1,210.00	
Coffman	232204	-		stock	stock	stock									7d	6w		30d	
4	810027	499.53				555.00		499.63							499.53	670.26			
Coffman	232204	-				stock		stock							stock	9w			
5	1010014	3.65			3.65								5.50		7.75	10.02			4.10
Kirks	232198	-			stock								7d		stock	stock			unapproved part
3	810031	1.91													8.01	9.48		1.91	
Coffman	232204	-													stock	4w		unapproved part	
3	810048	16.01													16.01	20.94			23.94
Coffman	232204	-													stock	7w			3w
4	810078	325.00		325.00		367.02									392.96	612.53			
Diesel Emissions	232197	-		stock		4w									90d	5w			
3	810079	392.96				405.99									392.96	595.02			
Coffman	232204	-				stock									90d	7w			
1	1010027	44.31																	44.31
Eldorado	232235	-																	stock
3	1210038	1,938.29						1,938.29							2,274.30	2,795.53			

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Diesel Emissions	Kirks	Neopart	MW Bus - NO BID	Area Diesel	CBM	Suburban Truck	P&G	Prevost	Vehicle Maintenance	Interstate Power	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado
								stock							stock	10w			
3	1010029	19.23													36.84	48.07		19.23	
															stock	stock		unapproved part	
5	810098	239.34						240.42	343.90						239.34	319.20		298.54	
								stock	stock						stock	stock		stock	
2	810101	209.50													209.50	251.30			
															90d	6w			
2	810102	2.99													2.99	3.65			
															stock	5w			
2	810110	350.57													350.57	519.99			
															90d	5w			
1	710154	3.01																	3.01
																			stock
3	810123	54.54													54.54	67.77		72.18	
															stock	5w		stock	
2	810130	449.19													449.19	558.96			
															stock	5w			
5	710168	406.39				520.00					406.39	625.53				505.99	462.03		
						no lead time given					stock	60d				7w	4w		
4	1210070	45.42							59.14						45.42	66.93		53.18	
									11w						14d	6w		4w	
1	810178	161.38													161.38				
															stock				
1	710206	163.68																	163.68
																			stock
3	810182	101.38						101.38							102.76	129.90			
								stock							stock	5w			
3	810184	60.26						60.26							61.08	72.57			
								stock							stock	4w			
3	810187	8.08						8.08							8.67	9.95			
								stock							stock	4w			
3	810206	10.49						11.15							10.49	12.43			
								stock							stock	5w			

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Diesel Emissions	Kirks	Neopart	MW Bus - NO BID	Area Diesel	CBM	Suburban Truck	P&G	Prevost	Vehicle Maintenance	Interstate Power	Coffman	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado
1	810215	21.50																	21.50
Eldorado	232235	-																	2w
1	710247	231.90																	231.90
Eldorado	232235	-																	6w
2	810220	402.14													402.14	593.79			
Coffman	232204	-													stock	5w			
2	810227	1,142.58													1,142.58	1,414.56			
Coffman	232204	-													90d	5w			
1	1210106	156.99																	156.99
Eldorado	232235	-																	4w
1	1210107	6.00																	6.00
Eldorado	232235	-																	4w
1	1210108	92.16																	92.16
Eldorado	232235	-																	4w
3	810241	3.16													3.16	4.19		4.19	
Coffman	232204	-													stock	stock		4w	
2	710260	472.83														472.83	479.97		
Aftermarket Parts	232205	-														14w	4w		
2	810279	281.22													281.22	374.42			
Coffman	232204	-													stock	7w			
-	710365	-																	
		-																	
1	710366	844.92																	844.92
Eldorado	232235	-																	6w
3	810347	6.24						6.24							6.46	8.15			
Area Diesel	232199	-						stock							stock	stock			
3	810348	3.30						3.35							3.30	4.38			
Coffman	232204	-						stock							stock	7w			
3	810349	3.13						3.13							3.53	4.08			
Area Diesel	232199	-						stock							stock	5w			
2	810356	29.53													29.53	36.26			
Coffman	232204	-													stock	4w			
1	1110006	47.33														47.33			

