

Pace

RFQ# 421031

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0			0	0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Suburban Truck	P&G	Kirks	Area Diesel	Rex Sales	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Interstate Power	Prevost	Gillig	Muncie	DES	Aftermarket Parts
6	130628	1.40									1.40	3.11	3.58		4.43	3.45		4.28
Coffman		-									unapproved part	stock	stock		stock	21d		stock
1	130744	18.64																18.64
Aftermarket Parts		-																5w
6	130473	0.09							0.32		0.12		1.75	0.37		0.09		0.11
Muncie		-							stock		3w		10d	stock		stock		stock
6	130611	231.52									239.72	231.52	350.78		292.31	253.87		280.22
Coffman											stock	stock	stock		stock	stock		stock
5	140064	32.00									32.00			89.54	115.11	74.00		85.60
Mohawk		-									stock			stock	4w	21d		stock
4	110100	2.23									3.00				2.25	2.58		2.23
Aftermarket Parts		-									stock				stock	stock		stock
8	110136	68.68							88.77		124.37	68.68	78.75	82.92	149.25	79.59		106.10
Vehicle Maintenance		-							stock		4w	stock	stock	stock	60d	30d		7w
9	81343	7.65							7.80	23.00	7.95	7.65	8.42	13.20		27.25	8.00	29.30
Vehicle Maintenance		-							stock	stock	stock	stock	unapproved part	stock		30d	stock	4w
4	81367	1.72											1.73			2.10		2.23
Area Diesel		-											stock			30d		6w
4	81397	539.92											539.92			647.00		720.07
Coffman													stock			30d		5w
5	81431	695.69											1,056.00			1,254.95		1,328.34
Area Diesel									stock		stock		stock			30d		5w
5	81433	20.50											32.77	22.64		20.50		30.56

Pace

RFQ# 421031

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0				0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0				0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Suburban Truck	P&G	Kirks	Area Diesel	Rex Sales	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Interstate Power	Prevost	Gillig	Muncie	DES	Aftermarket Parts	
Muncie							stock				5w	stock				stock		5w	
4	81441	42.77					42.77				54.40	42.82						51.24	
Area Diesel							stock				5w	stock						stock	
6	81444	57.00							72.75		57.00			109.23	71.00	75.57		76.50	
Mohawk		-							6w		stock			stock	2w	45d		8w	
3	81445	16.33													19.50	16.33		16.88	
Muncie															2w	14d		7w	
4	81518	5.28					5.28					5.85				6.33		6.98	
Area Diesel							stock					stock				21d		stock	
7	81533	11.49		29.12			41.90			13.16	11.49	41.71				15.80		25.94	
Mohawk		-		Stock			stock			stock	stock	stock				stock		stock	
-	810000	-																	
		-																	
4	810007	419.85			454.65	535.60										641.00		419.85	
Aftermarket Parts		-			stock	stock										30d		16w	
3	1310001	702.53									875.33		4,141.69					702.53	
Aftermarket Parts		-									4w		90d					stock	
4	810023	45.56					45.67					45.56				55.25		59.20	
Coffman		-					stock					7d				30d		5w	
-	1210012	-																	
		-																	
3	810027	499.53					499.63						499.53					674.30	
Coffman		-					stock					stock						9w	

Pace

RFQ# 421031

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Suburban Truck	P&G	Kirks	Area Diesel	Rex Sales	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Interstate Power	Prevost	Gillig	Muncie	DES	Aftermarket Parts
9	1010014	2.29				2.29	7.67	2.98	7.55	5.61	4.10					9.10	5.50	9.18
Kirks		-				stock	stock	stock	stock	stock	unapproved part					30d	stock	stock
4	810030	1.43									1.43	2.35				2.79		2.84
Coffman		-									unapproved part	stock				30d		stock
8	1010015	950.00				950.00		1,273.54	1,259.50		975.00	970.64				1,218.80	1,450.00	1,547.19
Kirks		-				stock		stock	stock		stock	60d				30d	stock	13w
2	1010016	2,218.00										2,218.00						3,199.21
Coffman		-										90d						7w
3	1210020	40.63													40.63	42.94		42.82
Gillig		-													stock	stock		stock
1	810050	95.54																95.54
Aftermarket Parts		-																7w
1	810051	98.02																98.02
Aftermarket Parts		-																5w
10	1210033	24.17		26.57		27.00			33.58	24.17	24.76	24.44	26.57	48.54		39.73		28.66
Vehicle Maintenance		-		stock		stock			4w	stock	stock	stock	10d	60d		30d		stock
4	810071	641.69					641.69					650.12				766.84		1,033.64
Area Diesel		-					stock					stock				30d		9w
4	810073	106.87					106.87				135.38	106.96						134.60
Area Diesel		-					stock				4w	90d						5w
5	810078	325.00							371.84		570.70	392.96					325.00	616.15
Diesel Emissions		-							stock		5w	90d					stock	5w
3	810079	392.96							405.99			392.96						598.44



Pace

RFQ# 421031

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																	
	0				0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0			0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Suburban Truck	P&G	Kirks	Area Diesel	Rex Sales	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Interstate Power	Prevost	Gillig	Muncie	DES	Aftermarket Parts
4	810130	379.19					380.90					379.19				450.62		562.08
Coffman		-					stock					stock				30d		5w
-	1210074	-																
		-																
-	1210078	-																
		-																
1	810165	1,090.83																1,090.83
Aftermarket Parts		-																11w
5	810173	13.62					20.72				13.62	23.25				24.65		24.83
Area Diesel		-					stock				unapproved part	stock				21d		5w
-	810198	-																
		-																
3	810220	402.14										402.14				478.35		597.14
Coffman		-										stock				30d		5w
6	810271	35.00				35.00	82.95			35.74	86.98					84.39		93.28
Kirks		-				stock	stock			stock	5w					30d		8w
3	810301	545.20										831.42				545.20		606.19
Muncie		-										90d				21d		9w
-	1210130	-																
		-																
1	810313	0.13																0.13
Aftermarket Parts		-																5w
4	1010075	89.46					89.46					89.54				105.99		114.63

Pace

RFQ# 421031

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																	
	0				0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0			0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Skus	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Suburban Truck	P&G	Kirks	Area Diesel	Rex Sales	Neopart	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	Coffman	Interstate Power	Prevost	Gillig	Muncie	DES	Aftermarket Parts
Area Diesel		-					stock					stock				30d		5w
4	810323	60.46					60.46					68.38				71.80		80.28
Area Diesel		-					stock					stock				21d		11w
3	1010080	876.57										876.57				969.75		1,063.02
Coffman		-										90d				30d		9w
3	1010082	847.75					847.75					876.57				969.75		
Area Diesel		-					stock					stock				21d		