

Pace

RFQ# 421027

WHITE=NO BID

		<b>TOTAL</b>										
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Coffman	P&G	Neopart	Prevost	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Suburban Truck
--------------	-----	-------------	---------------------	-------	---------	-----	---------	---------	--------	-------------------	--------	----------------

3	<b>70629</b>	0.83							0.83	1.30	2.35	
	Muncie	-							stock	stock	stock	
2	<b>71089</b>	0.05							0.05	0.05		
	Aftermarket Parts	-							30d	stock		
4	<b>71733</b>	79.90						95.15	79.90	80.18	90.88	
	Availatiliby - Aftermarket Parts	-						stock	35d	stock	stock	
7	<b>72079</b>	197.26		227.00		197.26	215.44	301.00	224.16	222.53	197.99	
	P&G			stock		stock	stock	stock	30d	stock	stock	
4	<b>72121</b>	31.51						31.51	62.50	65.31	55.53	
	Prevost	-						60d	28d	5w	6w	
2	<b>71105</b>	0.10						0.10		0.10		
	Prevost	-						stock		stock		
3	<b>71441</b>	6.23							6.23	7.14	7.08	
	Muncie	-							stock	5w	stock	
4	<b>72143</b>	10.50					10.62	14.27	10.93	10.50		

Pace

RFQ# 421027

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Coffman	P&G	Neopart	Prevost	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Suburban Truck
Aftermarket Parts		-					8w	60d	35d	stock		
1	71540	61.67							61.67			
Muncie		-							stock			
2	71178	0.05							0.05	0.05		
Muncie									stock	5w		
-	71539	-										
1	71785	2.50								2.50		
Aftermarket Parts										5w		
3	72056	21.85			42.31				21.85	55.28		
Muncie					stock				42d	stock		
4	72078	1,796.91		2,059.00		1,796.91				2,186.01	2,043.22	
P&G		-		stock		stock				stock	stock	
3	72109	1,075.00							1,250.00	1,334.50	1,075.00	
Gillig									90d	10w	4w	

Pace

RFQ# 421027

WHITE=NO BID

		<b>TOTAL</b>										
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Coffman	P&G	Neopart	Prevost	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Suburban Truck
--------------	-----	-------------	---------------------	-------	---------	-----	---------	---------	--------	-------------------	--------	----------------

2	<b>72148</b>	114.05								129.45	114.05	
										5w	stock	
3	<b>72162</b>	27.85						62.31	27.85	50.54		
								75d	stock	6w		
-	<b>72163</b>	-										
2	<b>72184</b>	5.38							5.38	5.39		
									stock	stock		
2	<b>72212</b>	2.44								2.44	2.99	
										15w	stock	
3	<b>72295</b>	29.00						48.48	29.00	40.92		
								60d	30d	stock		
2	<b>72301</b>	221.00								309.28		221.00
										5w		60d
2	<b>72301</b>	221.00								309.28		221.00

Pace

RFQ# 421027

WHITE=NO BID

		<b>TOTAL</b>										
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Coffman	P&G	Neopart	Prevost	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Suburban Truck
--------------	-----	-------------	---------------------	-------	---------	-----	---------	---------	--------	-------------------	--------	----------------

Suburban Truck		-								5w		60d
-	<b>72366</b>	-										
		-										
3	<b>710010</b>	0.20						0.30	0.20	0.32		
Muncie		-						stock	stock	5w		
2	<b>710020</b>	31.95							31.95	53.99		
Muncie		-							42d	6w		
4	<b>710043</b>	261.16		278.00		261.16		394.55		299.54		
P&G		-		stock		stock		75d		14w		
3	<b>710046</b>	31.45						38.30	31.45	32.02		
Muncie		-						75d	30d	9w		
-	<b>710105</b>	-										
		-										
5	<b>710120</b>	381.17		468.00		381.17		577.37	423.98	469.83		
P&G		-		stock		stock		60d	30d	stock		

Pace

RFQ# 421027

WHITE=NO BID

		<b>TOTAL</b>										
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Coffman	P&G	Neopart	Prevost	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Suburban Truck
--------------	-----	-------------	---------------------	-------	---------	-----	---------	---------	--------	-------------------	--------	----------------

2	<b>710128</b>	600.00								791.53	600.00	
	Gillig	-								14w	6w	
-	<b>710129</b>	-										
		-										
4	<b>710151</b>	368.00		368.00		374.00			372.72	370.49		
	Kirks	-		stock		stock			stock	stock		
3	<b>710161</b>	32.49						62.31	32.49	49.65		
	Muncie	-						60d	30d	9w		
3	<b>710166</b>	223.16			231.00				223.16	285.17		
	Muncie	-			7d				stock	stock		
-	<b>710206</b>	-										
		-										
1	<b>710215</b>	170.90								170.90		
	Aftermarket Parts	-								stock		
2	<b>710218</b>	459.25							581.50	459.25		

Pace

RFQ# 421027

WHITE=NO BID

		<b>TOTAL</b>										
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Kirks	Coffman	P&G	Neopart	Prevost	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Suburban Truck
--------------	-----	-------------	---------------------	-------	---------	-----	---------	---------	--------	-------------------	--------	----------------

Aftermarket Parts		-							21d	stock		
2	<b>710282</b>	<b>31.23</b>							<b>31.23</b>	60.53		
Muncie		-							35d	11w		
	<b>710365</b>	<b>-</b>										
		-										
-	<b>710366</b>	<b>-</b>										
		-										
3	<b>710380</b>	<b>613.65</b>			<b>613.65</b>				735.90	788.57		
Coffman		-			7d				63d	7w		
1	<b>710383</b>	<b>12.07</b>								<b>12.07</b>		
Aftermarket Parts		-								stock		