

Pace

RFQ# 420994

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	Gillig	Prevost	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Kirks	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman	Mohawk	Eldorado
6	130684	5.17				5.88					8.96		5.83	6.73	5.17	6.25	
Coffman	232123	-				20d					7d		30d	8w	stock	stock	
7	130581	40.17				40.17	48.50				41.89		49.21	60.67	44.19	47.62	
Interstate Power	232118	-				stock	stock				7d		30d	6w	stock	stock	
7	130611	161.00				263.08	302.39				161.00		253.87	282.50	231.52	200.73	
MW Bus	232122	-				stock	stock				7d		stock	stock	stock	unapproved part	
1	110135	36.81															36.81
Eldorado	232117																stock
5	110085	16.55								83.06			98.88	101.73	91.46	16.55	
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock			30d	stock	90d	unapproved part	
4	110100	2.23					2.50						2.58	2.23		2.60	
Aftermarket Parts	232113	-					stock						stock	stock		stock	
9	110136	68.77	68.89			82.92		129.35	69.58			68.77	79.59	106.71		80.94	99.00
Kirks	232112	-	stock			14d		60d	stock			stock	30d	7w		3w	6w
5	81066	40.57								96.74			41.99	71.76	97.34	40.57	
Mohawk	232115	-							stock				stock	5w	stock	stock	
2	130745	13.89				13.89								19.67			
Interstate Power	232118	-				10d								5w			
3	110058	2.86											5.71	4.95		2.86	
Mohawk	232115												30d	stock		stock	
6	81313	42.00						86.00		84.72			48.08	75.32	85.70	42.00	

Pace

RFQ# 420994

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	Gillig	Prevost	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Kirks	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman	Mohawk	Eldorado
Muncie	232116							60d		stock			stock	stock	stock	unapproved part	
5	100230	58.09		88.06						89.07				112.82	90.09	58.09	
Neopart	232119			stock						stock				stock	stock	unapproved part	
5	81422	1.50								1.97			2.38	2.40	1.90	1.50	
Coffman	232123									stock			30d	stock	stock	unapproved part	
4	81431	695.69		950.00						695.69				1,335.93	1,056.00		
Area Diesel	232120	-		stock						stock				5w	stock		
6	81444	57.00		72.08			71.00	101.43					75.57	76.50		57.00	
Mohawk	232115			6w			2w	stock					30d	stock		2w	
5	120548	1.31	1.98							2.22				3.07	2.25	1.31	
Vehicle Maintenance	232109		stock							stock				stock	stock	unapproved part	
4	81497	1,859.34								1,859.34			2,290.71	3,263.37	1,919.48		
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock			60d	5w	stock		
4	110150	20.41								20.41			25.43	24.99	20.47		
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock			30d	5w	stock		
8	1210002	19.81	28.73			25.85			35.37			30.00	27.70	24.75	24.85	19.81	
Mohawk	232115	-	stock			14d			stock			stock	stock	3w	stock	stock	
7	1210003	19.01	19.01	22.56					19.90				22.19	266.80	21.87	24.30	
Availability - Coffman	232123	-	6w	stock					unapproved part				30d	4w	stock	3w	
5	1010003	14.88								27.41			32.68	37.30	27.35	14.88	

Pace

RFQ# 420994

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	Gillig	Prevost	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Kirks	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman	Mohawk	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																	
Coffman	232123	-								stock			30d	stock	stock	unapproved part	
4	810025	595.97		645.00						595.97				1,288.53	743.50		
Area Diesel	232120	-		4w						stock				5w	stock		
2	810026	989.68												1,192.90	989.68		
Coffman	232123	-												4w	90d		
3	810027	499.63								499.63				678.55	504.97		
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock				9w	90d		
5	1010014	3.60								7.66		3.60		9.18	7.50	4.40	
Kirks	232112	-								stock		stock		stock	stock	unapproved part	
6	1010015	935.00		1,236.60								935.00	1,231.46	1,556.29	983.26	1,000.00	
Kirks	232112	-		stock								stock	45d	13w	stock	stock	
2	1010016	2,218.00												3,283.40	2,218.00		
Coffman	232123	-												7w	90d		
3	1010018	20.58											43.86	20.58	36.71		
Aftermarket Parts	232113	-											stock	stock	stock		
2	810050	95.54												95.54			142.13
Aftermarket Parts	232113	-												7w			6w
5	810060	29.45								29.45			36.94	46.62	35.69	30.25	
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock			stock	stock	stock	unapproved part	
3	810064	3,450.09								3,450.09				4,793.47	4,087.16		
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock				7w	stock		



Pace

RFQ# 420994

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	Gillig	Prevost	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Kirks	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman	Mohawk	Eldorado
4	810130	380.90								380.90			450.62	565.24	383.25		
	Area Diesel	232120	-							stock			30d	5w	stock		
5	810132	110.12								110.12			130.29	140.29	111.39	137.73	
	Area Diesel	232120	-							stock			30d	8w	14d	3w	
4	1210070	45.42						50.75						55.22	45.42	53.18	
	Coffman	232123	-					60d						6w	7d	4w	
3	1210077	315.38											378.99	609.42	315.38		
	Coffman	232123	-										30d	9w	90d		
3	810155	265.22												302.62	265.22	318.82	
	Coffman	232123	-											4w	90d	4w	
3	810179	45.36								45.36				60.22	45.88		
	Area Diesel	232120	-							stock				stock	stock		
4	810184	60.26								60.26			71.30	72.97	66.16		
	Area Diesel	232120	-							stock			30d	4w	stock		
4	810203	2,563.09								2,595.69			2,997.73	3,773.48	2,563.09		
	Coffman	232123	-							stock			30d	5w	stock		
4	810213	50.06								63.04			63.50	65.13	50.06		
	Coffman	232123	-							stock			30d	stock	7d		
5	1210096	106.27								106.27			125.72	144.57	107.49	132.56	
	Area Diesel	232120	-							stock			stock	7w	stock	21d	

Pace

RFQ# 420994

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	Gillig	Prevost	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Kirks	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman	Mohawk	Eldorado
	NO # of Bids																
4	1010052	89.46								89.46			106.90	114.28	90.49		
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock			30d	6w	7d		
2	1010060	2,245.80												3,240.61	2,245.80		
Coffman	232123	-												7w	90d		
5	1010061	886.00		993.60								886.00		1,928.79	1,029.02	925.00	
Kirks	232112	-		10d								stock		9w	14d	4w	
1	1210107	6.00															6.00
Eldorado	232117	-															2w
1	1210108	92.16															92.16
Eldorado	232117	-															2w
4	1210113	626.20								626.20			740.81	851.92	630.05		
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock			30d	4w	14d		
6	810280	949.24					949.99	1,221.72					955.53	1,106.42	949.24	1,312.82	
Mohawk	232115	-					stock	60d					45d	stock		7w	8w
1	1210130	599.95															599.95
Eldorado	232117	-															stock
1	1210131	625.52												625.52			
Aftermarket Parts	232113	-												stock			
4	1010078	513.30								513.30			586.55	694.49	536.16		
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock			21d	9w	stock		
3	810351	1,250.92											1,335.00	1,702.84	1,250.92		

Pace

RFQ# 420994

WHITE=NO BID

	TOTAL																
	0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	Gillig	Prevost	Suburban Truck	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Kirks	Muncie	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman	Mohawk	Eldorado
Coffman	232123	-											30d	5w	14d		
4	810352	32.27								37.46			37.68	77.89	32.27		
Coffman	232123	-								stock			30d	4w	7d		
2	810353	411.45											494.76		411.45		
Coffman	232123	-											21d		90d		
2	810354	129.35											155.38		129.35		
Coffman	232123	-											30d		90d		
3	810355	99.04								99.04			124.07		99.77		
Area Diesel	232120	-								stock			21d		stock		