

Pace

RFQ# 420957

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
--	--	---	--	--	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---

Green=Disqualified

	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	MW Bus - NO BID	Interstate Power	Area Diesel	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Prevost	Neopart	Mohawk	Coffman	Rex Sales	Aftermarket Parts	Kirks	Gillig	Muncie	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																		
	3	130756	592.41		592.41						885.33			737.08				
Interstate Power		232063	-		90d						4w			5w				
	5	130613	2.74		14.62						2.74	12.86		17.78			14.05	
Mohawk		232057	-		stock						stock	stock		7w			21d	
	8	120488	12.79		16.90		12.79	16.90			19.45	17.04		20.20	27.00		16.49	
Vehicle Maintenance		232053	-		20d		stock	stock			stock	7d		5w	stock		30d	
	4	81089	1.50				4.04				1.50	4.04		5.49				
Area Diesel		232050					stock				unapproved part	stock		5w				
	3	81311	87.66				92.74					87.66		111.58				
Coffman		232052	-				stock					stock		5w				
	8	110136	68.89		82.92		68.89	69.58	129.35		87.75			107.34	88.34			100.00
Vehicle Maintenance		232053	-		20d		stock	stock	60d		30d			7w	stock			stock
	1	81366	79.82															79.82
Eldorado		232062	-															stock
	5	81378	18.99								18.99	26.21		34.41			22.42	85.97
Mohawk		232057	-								stock	2d		6w			30d	stock
	3	81412	30.72											32.58		35.99		30.72
Eldorado		232062	-											23w		4w		stock
	5	100230	58.09				89.07			91.06	58.09	89.33		113.47				
Area Diesel		232050					stock			stock	unapproved part	stock		5w				
	1	81417	24.52															24.52
Eldorado		232062																stock
	4	81431	531.25				531.25					800.34		1,343.61			1,255.00	

Pace

RFQ# 420957

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																	
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	MW Bus - NO BID	Interstate Power	Area Diesel	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Prevost	Neopart	Mohawk	Coffman	Rex Sales	Aftermarket Parts	Kirks	Gillig	Muncie	Eldorado
Area Diesel	232050					stock						stock		5w			30d	
3	110144	24.52												40.80			41.09	24.52
Eldorado	232062													stock			stock	2w
6	81444	57.00							101.43	72.08	57.00			76.50		71.00	75.57	
Mohawk	232057	-							stock	6w	stock			8w		2w	45d	
5	81485	58.50				58.50					59.17	59.17		74.95			69.21	
Area Diesel	232050					stock					stock	stock		5w			21d	
4	81499	20.82				20.82						20.94		25.77			23.94	
Area Diesel	232050					stock						stock		6w			stock	
4	110152	199.76				199.76						232.69		265.22			237.00	
Coffman	232052	-				1only, need 5						stock		11w			30d	
5	81519	55.50				99.10					84.50	78.53		109.86	55.50			
Kirks	232066	-				stock					8w	7d		4w	stock			
3	81534	32.51												32.83			32.51	61.39
Muncie	232061	-												14w			21d	stock
7	1210003	18.38					19.01	19.90		21.55	18.38	21.87		38.65			22.19	
Availability - Neopart	232064	-					6w	unapproved part		stock	unapproved part	stock		stock			30d	
1	1010006	22.48																22.48
Eldorado	232062	-																stock
2	1210011	78.38												78.38				171.99
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-												stock				stock
9	1010011	810.96				810.96			1,611.22	1,144.00	1,220.00	1,113.01	1,280.00	1,993.79	825.00		1,212.50	

Pace

RFQ# 420957

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	MW Bus - NO BID	Interstate Power	Area Diesel	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Prevost	Neopart	Mohawk	Coffman	Rex Sales	Aftermarket Parts	Kirks	Gillig	Muncie	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																		
Availability - Kirks	232066	-				1 only, need 2			60d	10d	3w	14d	stock	4w	stock		30d	
8	1010012	1,202.00				1,809.36				1,459.05	1,238.90	1,801.18	1,386.00	2,820.77	1,202.00		1,462.23	
Kirks	232066	-				stock				10d	stock	stock	stock	5w	stock		30d	
2	1210016	599.95												729.81				599.95
Eldorado	232062	-												18w				stock
2	810026	989.68										989.68		1,192.90				
Coffman	232052	-										90d		4w				
4	810027	499.63				499.63						505.59		674.12			600.83	
Area Diesel	232050	-				stock						90d		7w			30d	
7	1010015	940.00								1,236.60	1,060.00	983.26	1,284.00	1,565.50	940.00		1,231.46	
Kirks	232066	-								stock	stock	stock	stock	13w	stock		21d	
3	1010016	2,218.00										2,218.00		3,261.94			2,678.90	
Coffman	232052	-										90d		7w			30d	
3	1010018	20.70										37.18		20.70			43.86	
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-										stock		stock			stock	
4	1210020	40.63												42.93		40.63	43.75	79.82
Gillig	232060	-												stock		stock	stock	stock
2	810051	99.97												123.99				99.97
Eldorado	232062	-												5w				4w
3	810064	2,995.69				2,995.69						4,157.16		4,728.69				
Area Diesel	232050	-				stock						stock		7w				
5	810065	9.66				45.19					9.66	44.94		55.34			53.95	
Coffman	232052	-				stock					unapproved part	stock		stock			30d	

Pace

RFQ# 420957

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

Sku

Winning bid

Rome Truck - NO BID

MW Bus - NO BID

Interstate Power

Area Diesel

Vehicle Maintenance

Suburban Truck

Prevost

Neopart

Mohawk

Coffman

Rex Sales

Aftermarket Parts

Kirks

Gillig

Muncie

Eldorado

NO # of Bids

5	810070	801.10				801.10				1,008.60		888.24		1,168.78				1,050.50	
Area Diesel	232050	-				stock				stock		stock		7w				30d	
4	810071	601.09				601.09						650.12		1,039.86				767.05	
Area Diesel	232050	-				stock						stock		9w				30d	
3	810078	392.96										392.96		623.53				474.75	
Coffman	232052	-										90d		5w				30d	
4	810079	392.96				396.86						392.96		601.90				469.50	
Coffman	232052	-				stock						stock		7w				30d	
4	1210038	1,938.29				1,938.29						2,250.30		2,813.00				2,337.93	
Area Diesel	232050	-				stock						stock		10w				stock	
6	1010028	6.30										6.30	10.61	8.45	13.06	15.00		13.21	
Rex Sales	232065	-										unapproved part	90d	stock	5w	stock		30d	
6	1010029	20.23				36.41						20.23	36.65	20.54	48.36			40.12	
Rex Sales	232065	-				stock						unapproved part	stock	stock	5w			30d	
3	810101	209.50										268.07	209.50		251.30				
Coffman	232052	-										4w	90d	6w					
5	810110	336.37				650.00						533.37	336.37		526.29			370.45	
Coffman	232052	-				stock						stock	90d	stock				210d	
5	810125	42.00				91.60						42.00	100.41	121.47				110.60	
Area Diesel	232050	-				stock						unapproved part	stock	7w				30d	
5	1210071	187.86				187.86						233.05	188.43	246.47				224.65	
Area Diesel	232050	-				stock						unapproved part	stock	5w				30d	

Pace

RFQ# 420957

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																	
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	MW Bus - NO BID	Interstate Power	Area Diesel	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Prevost	Neopart	Mohawk	Coffman	Rex Sales	Aftermarket Parts	Kirks	Gillig	Muncie	Eldorado
4	1210077	315.38									501.05	315.38		505.57			380.75	
	Coffman	232052	-								2w	90d		9w			30d	
1	1210078	620.95																620.95
	Eldorado	232062	-															26w
5	810154	6.47				8.06					6.47	8.12		10.71			9.60	
	Mohawk	232057	-			stock					stock	stock		8w			stock	
4	810181	2.30				2.30						2.31		3.00			2.75	
	Area Diesel	232050	-			stock						stock		6w			30d	
1	810198	610.99																610.99
	Eldorado	232062	-															6w
5	810208	0.16				1.28					0.16	1.42		1.54			1.55	
	Area Diesel	232050	-			stock					unapproved part	stock		5w			30d	
5	810221	25.34				25.34					34.01	25.78		32.48			30.33	
	Area Diesel	232050	-			stock					5w	7d		7w			21d	
4	810227	849.69				849.69						1,132.96		1,422.65			1,340.35	
	Area Diesel	232050	-			stock						90d		5w			21d	
4	810231	213.61				213.61						237.45		278.59			254.45	
	Availability - Coffman	232052	-			1 only, need 2						stock		stock			30d	
3	1010060	2,245.80										2,245.80		3,279.19			2,599.45	
	Coffman	232052	-									stock		7w			30d	
7	1010061	875.00							993.60	915.00	970.32	1,090.00	1,951.75	875.00			1,160.00	
	Kirks	232066	-						stock	stock	stock	stock	stock	9w	stock		30d	

Pace

RFQ# 420957

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																	
	0				0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0		0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	MW Bus - NO BID	Interstate Power	Area Diesel	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Prevost	Neopart	Mohawk	Coffman	Rex Sales	Aftermarket Parts	Kirks	Gillig	Muncie	Eldorado
1	1210137	61.88										61.88						
Coffman	232052	-										7d						