

Pace

RFQ# 420955

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Rome Truck Parts	Interstate Power	Coffman	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Neopart	Suburban Truck Parts	Prevost	P&G	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Muncie	Eldorado
7	72139	322.32		389.00		366.27	322.32							347.20	383.89	350.00	354.04	
Coffman	232052	-		7d		stock	stock							3w	5w	stock	30d	
4	71733	80.18										95.15			80.18	87.25	80.50	
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-										60d			stock	6w	30d	
6	71875	4.75			8.75							7.52		5.19	4.82		4.75	18.37
Muncie	232061	-			stock							75d		stock	stock		stock	stock
5	72121	31.51													65.48	58.04	62.62	104.43
Prevost	232055											60d			5w	6w	30d	stock
6	70220	7.95			18.88									7.95	17.32	15.25	11.55	36.81
Mohawk	232057	-			16w									stock	stock	stock	stock	stock
4	72057	3.21						3.21						13.56	4.26	8.99		
Vehicle Maintenance	232053	-						stock						stock	stock	stock		
6	72143	10.50								10.62		13.28			10.50	11.25	10.93	24.52
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-								7w		60d			stock	stock	45d	stock
4	71969	0.06				0.21								0.06	0.11		0.11	
Mohawk	232057	-				14d								stock	7w		stock	
5	72135	56.91								59.38					56.91	61.99	61.10	110.55
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-								7w					stock	8w	45d	stock
4	72058	3.83						4.13						3.83	5.00			122.84
Availability - Vehicle Maintenance	232053							stock						3w	stock			4w
5	71091	0.07				0.52						0.54		0.07	0.17		0.28	
Mohawk	232057					5d						60d		stock	stock		60d	
7	72094	15.05									22.81	15.05		23.99	19.85	29.82	21.15	30.66
Prevost	232055										stock	stock		3w	5w	6w	30d	1w
5	71442	6.98												7.20	11.61	7.08	6.98	30.66

Pace

RFQ# 420955

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Rome Truck Parts	Interstate Power	Coffman	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Neopart	Suburban Truck Parts	Prevost	P&G	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Muncie	Eldorado
Availability - Gillig	232060													stock	25w	stock	30d	stock
1	72129	8.86													8.86			
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-													stock			
4	72109	706.47													1,342.21	1,110.00	1,250.00	706.47
Eldorado	232062														10w	4w	90d	6w
1	72122	6.70																6.70
Eldorado	232062																	1w
5	72156	21.46								21.59		26.45			21.46	24.05	22.22	
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-								7w		60d			stock	8w	45d	
5	72162	27.92										56.25		27.92	51.75		32.50	36.81
Mohawk	232057	-										60d		stock	6w		stock	stock
4	72216	151.00										210.00			151.00	158.87		331.76
Availability - Gillig	232060	-										stock			6w	stock		stock
2	72301	221.00									221.00				303.92			
Suburban Truck	232054	-													5w			
4	72342	3.93						9.35							11.82		7.39	3.93
Eldorado	232062	-						stock							7w		21d	2w
7	72388	36.75								63.15		78.80		36.75	52.37	38.00	64.98	67.61
Mohawk	232057	-								7w		stock		stock	9w	stock	45d	stock
-	72389	-																
		-																
1	710008	190.61																190.61
Eldorado	232062	-																stock
6	710046	31.46						31.46			31.59	35.58			32.55		31.80	42.95
Vehicle Maintenance	232053	-						stock			stock	60d			9w		30d	stock

Pace

RFQ# 420955

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																	
	0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0		0		0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Rome Truck Parts	Interstate Power	Coffman	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Neopart	Suburban Truck Parts	Prevost	P&G	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Muncie	Eldorado
4	710052	2,236.02							2,616.00				2,236.02				2,589.30	2,597.12
P&G	232056	-							stock				stock				60d	3w
2	710097	35.14															35.14	38.01
Availability - Eldorado	232062	-															3only, need 15	stock
1	710111	272.83																272.83
Eldorado	232062	-																2w
6	710119	2,777.04							3,300.00			3,794.47	2,777.04		3,479.43	3,100.00	3,135.60	
P&G	232056	-							stock			60d	stock		stock	stock	60d	
2	710128	600.00													812.64	600.00		
Gillig	232060	-													14w	6w		
1	710130	92.41																92.41
Eldorado	232062	-																6w
1	710156	35.57																35.57
Eldorado	232062	-																stock
6	710168	406.39							520.00			564.71	406.39		509.02	462.03	485.60	
P&G	232056	-							stock			60d	stock		7w	4w	30d	
6	710170	2,498.00							3,096.00			3,816.82	2,729.66		3,264.47		3,282.02	2,498.00
Availability - P&G	232056	-							stock			60d	stock		10w		30d	3w
1	710206	210.86																210.86
Eldorado	232062	-																6w
3	710213	2,269.16					2,269.16								3,067.64		2,425.79	
Coffman	232052	-					14d								5w		90d	
2	710242	245.00		245.00												262.55		
MW Bus	232051	-		14d												6w		
3	710243	83.08		85.00											83.08	104.49		

Pace

RFQ# 420955

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Area Diesel	MW Bus	Rome Truck Parts	Interstate Power	Coffman	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Neopart	Suburban Truck Parts	Prevost	P&G	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts	Gillig	Muncie	Eldorado
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-		14d											7w	4w		
3	710245	16.73		17.06											16.73	21.03		
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-		14d											13w	4w		
1	710263	442.96													442.96			
Aftermarket Parts	232058	-													stock			
1	710278	1,344.55															1,344.55	
Eldorado	232062	-															6w	
-	710282	-																
		-																
4	710292	19.80									20.53				19.99		19.80	36.81
Muncie	232061	-									stock				stock		30d	1w
2	710293	6.15													6.15			14.00
Availability - Eldorado	232062	-													20w			stock
-	710340	-																
		-																
5	710381	1,377.44	1,377.44				1,476.58							2,764.00	2,867.18		1,629.69	
Area Diesel	232050	-	stock				stock							3w	9w		30d	