

		TOTAL																										
White = No Bid																												
Green = Disqualified																												
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake & Supply Co.	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM	Chicago Parts & Sound	Coffman Truck Sales	Eldorado	General Truck Parts	Gillig	Global Petroleum Products	HECS	Illinois Auto Central	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk Manufacturing	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program	
2	20705	43.15				No Bid													43.20			43.15						
NFI Parts 232084																			Stock			Stock						
5	40615	38.00							82.69		81.70												87.48	73.54				
Mohawk Manufacturing 232082									Stock		2-4 Weeks											5 Weeks	60 Days					
5	290616	113.89									113.89		118.00								115.62	123.81	148.70					
Gillig 232078											Stock		Stock								Stock	Stock	60 Days					
2	60342	2.17																		2.17		2.74						
Mohawk Manufacturing 232082																			Stock			1 Stock	Balance 10 Weeks					
2	60735	893.20							893.20													2,780.91						
Eldorado 232077									6-8 Weeks													9 Weeks						
4	151458	164.25							302.35		164.25											170.51	244.46					
Gillig 232078									Stock		Stock											5 Weeks	60 Days					
3	290471	9.98							21.55							9.98						10.10						
Kirk's Automotive 232080									Stock							Stock						15 Weeks						
5	290653	17.00									18.00		17.00							32.61		18.27	23.25					
HECS 232079											Stock		Stock							May 17th		4 Weeks	60 Days					
5	250601	29.72									29.92						35.78	30.79				29.72	35.06					
Neopart 232083											1-2 Weeks						Stock	10 Days				7-10 Days	5 Weeks					
2	30376	45.72																		169.95		45.72						
NFI Parts 232084																				June 30th		10 Weeks						
4	290427	22.18									29.25		24.00									22.18	26.64					
Neopart 232083											2-4 Weeks		Stock									2-3 Weeks	3 Weeks					
5	290537	157.56									158.00		157.56									158.13	167.83	207.20				
HECS 232079											Stock		Stock									2-3 Weeks	3 Weeks	60 Days				
6	40953	8.30									13.67									8.30		32.20	11.46	18.10		30.96		
Mohawk Manufacturing 232082											Stock									Stock		Stock	60 Days		Stock			
5	290289	9.60									12.95		9.60									9.91	9.66	11.45				
HECS 232079											2-4 Weeks		Stock									2-3 Weeks	9 Stock Balance 3 Weeks	7 Stock Balance 60 Days				
3	290643	11.17							18.85																15.50		11.17	
Vehicle Maintenance Program 232086									Stock																Stock		Stock	
3	290658	102.51																				110.94	131.44					
Gillig 232078											Stock											1 Stock Balance 7 Weeks	Stock					
4	150830	0.35									0.74											0.42	0.55					
Mohawk Manufacturing 232082											Stock									June 10th		Stock	Stock					
5	41035	0.99							18.28												6.33	4.07	7.70					
Mohawk Manufacturing 232082									1 Week											Stock		2-3 Weeks	Stock	Stock				

		TOTAL																										
White = No Bid																												
Green = Disqualified																												
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake & Supply Co.	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM	Chicago Parts & Sound	Coffman Truck Sales	Eldorado	General Truck Parts	Gillig	Global Petroleum Products	HECS	Illinois Auto Central	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk Manufacturing	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program	
2	41169	38.89																	41.16			38.89						
NFI Parts 232084		-																	Stock			3 Weeks						
4	290420	601.68									620.20										601.68	626.10	633.60					
Neopart 232083											2-4 Weeks										2-3 Weeks	1 Stock Balance 5 Weeks	60 Days					
2	10278	0.49																	0.49			1.60						
Mohawk Manufacturing 232082		-																	Stock			13 Weeks						
6	40134	51.49									57.11								70.80			75.58	69.93		113.13		51.49	
Vehicle Maintenance Program 232086		-									1-2 Weeks								Stock			Stock	Stock		Stock			Stock
4	41019	0.99																	0.99		2.18	2.34	2.74		Stock			
Mohawk Manufacturing 232082																			Stock		Must be ordered in multiples of 20 Stock	Stock	3 Stock Balance 60 Days					
QTY. 14																												
5	41240	81.36									83.36								94.88		88.40	81.36	111.62					
Gillig 232078		-									Stock								May 17th		Stock	6 Weeks	60 Days					
6	20707	90.39							149.00		92.00										90.39	92.95	131.62		103.15			
Neopart 232083		-							Stock		2 Weeks										Stock	6 Weeks	60 Days		Stock			
6	20708	90.39							149.00		92.00										90.39	92.95	131.62		103.15			
Neopart 232083		-							Stock		2 Weeks										Stock	6 Weeks	60 Days		Stock			
1	30150	13.75							13.75																			
Eldorado 232077		-							Stock																			
4	290673	924.37							1,250.00		925.00											924.37	1,172.84					
NFI Parts 232084		-							4 Weeks		4 Weeks											Stock	90 Days					
1	250709	76.73							76.73																			
Eldorado 232077		-							Stock																			
5	250718	569.29									570.00											569.29	677.89					
Neopart 232083		-									1-2 Weeks								602.44	595.00		7-10 Days	Stock					
5	250733	831.37									831.37								875.69	845.00		836.75	907.80					
Gillig 232078		-									1-2 Weeks								Stock	10 Days		7-10 Days	Stock					
4	41288	86.99							248.35		86.99											94.41	97.62					
Gillig 232078		-							4 Weeks		Stock											4-6 Weeks	Stock					
1	60792	184.66							184.66																			
Eldorado 232077		-							Stock																			
1	290685	7.31							7.31																			
Eldorado 232077		-							1 Week																			
6	41293	82.47							118.75		98.61											82.47	90.06	102.73				
Neopart 232083		-							Stock		4-6 Weeks								86.92			Stock	6 Weeks	75 Days				
2	41294	1,394.50							1,396.45														1,394.50					
NFI Parts 232084		-							6 Weeks													Stock						
4	250784	203.19									203.19												231.21	262.63				
Gillig 232078		-									Stock								212.00			7 Weeks	60 Days					
2	290695	62.80							91.75														62.80					
Eldorado 232077		-							Stock														25 Weeks					
4	290696	10.79							37.75													11.00	10.79	15.33				
NFI Parts 232084		-							Stock													Not an approved OEM.	3-4 Weeks	5 Weeks	Stock			







Pace RFQ 420953 Due: 05/04/2021

		TOTAL																									
White = No Bid																											
Green = Disqualified																											
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake & Supply Co.	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM	Chicago Parts & Sound	Coffman Truck Sales	Eldorado	General Truck Parts	Gillig	Global Petroleum Products	HECS	Illinois Auto Central	Interstat e Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk Manufaturi ng	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
1	2910068	102.92																				102.92					
NFI Parts 232084		-																				Stock					
2	110063	130.00									130.00							DQ	DQ			161.96					
Gillig 232078	OUT OF STOCK	-									1-2 Weeks							Not an approved OEM.	Not an approved OEM.			Stock					