
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Rex 
Welding

Rex Sales MW Bus - 
NO BID

Prevost Area Diesel Eldorado Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Coffman Gillig CBM Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

                                    4 120419 1.23                          1.23             1.24 1.69                       1.50 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 7w  30d 

                                    1 110135 32.35                      32.35 

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock 

                                    4 81183 9.59                          9.59             9.65 12.81                   11.50 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 6w  21d 

                                    9 110136 68.68                      82.92           68.89         129.35           99.00           68.68           69.58           77.58 107.97                 79.60 

Kirks 231926  5w  stock  60d  stock  stock  stock  14d 7w  30d 

                                    4 110134 2.08                          2.08             2.08 2.79                       2.50 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 6w  30d 

                                    5 81298 56.76                      63.46           74.45           56.76 58.06                   63.90 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                    2 120498 395.00                  425.00         395.00 

Rex Welding 231923 -                 3d  10d 

                                    3 100223 64.00                      93.29 64.00         109.87       

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 30d stock 6w

                                    4 120502 85.00                      93.99 85.00         112.53                 90.03 

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 stock stock 5w  21d 

                                    4 81347 4.22                          4.22             4.23 6.20                       5.10 

Area Diesel 231925  stock  stock 13w  20d 

                                    4 81377 2.80                          2.80             2.80 3.46                       3.40 

Area Diesel 231925  stock  stock 5w  30d 

                                    5 100231 120.00                  136.72         136.11 120.00       175.19               160.25 

Hydraulic Electric 231919  stock  stock stock stock  stock 

                                    1 81417 21.50                      21.50 

Eldorado 231913  stock 

Pace RFQ# 420892



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Rex 
Welding

Rex Sales MW Bus - 
NO BID

Prevost Area Diesel Eldorado Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Coffman Gillig CBM Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 420892

                                    4 81431 747.00              1,050.35 747.00       1,351.38       1,284.50 

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 stock 14d 5w  30d 

                                    5 81444 71.00                      72.00         101.43           71.00 76.50                   75.57 

Gillig 231917  6w  stock  2w 8w  30d 

                                    3 81466 9.69                          9.69 12.99                   11.75 

Coffman 231912  stock 9w  30d 

                                    4 81507 4.96                          4.98             4.96 6.62                       6.00 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock  stock  7w  30d 

                                    5 81516 7.94                          7.94             8.43             8.98 11.00                     9.35 

Rex Sales 231924 -                 stock  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                    5 81518 5.00                          5.29             5.73 5.00           7.02                       6.35 

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 stock  stock 21d 7w  20d 

                                    3 81534 32.83                      57.21 32.83                   32.89 

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 stock  6w  21d 

                                    1 81536 597.57                  597.57 

Eldorado 231913 -                 6w 

                                    1 810000 37.75                      37.75 

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock 

                                    6 810010 161.25                  543.62         306.56         315.00         541.48 804.32               161.25 
Availability - Area 
Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock  7w  30d 5w  60d 

                                    5 1010002 3.65                        12.94             6.55 3.72           3.65                       5.74 

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 1w  stock stock stock  21d 

                                    4 810019 233.14                  233.14         252.22 307.67               278.90 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock stock  30d 

                                    1 1010005 279.18                  279.18 

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Rex 
Welding

Rex Sales MW Bus - 
NO BID

Prevost Area Diesel Eldorado Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Coffman Gillig CBM Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 420892

                                    1 1010006 20.95                      20.95 

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock 

                                    3 1010004 199.32                  199.32 232.51               215.99 

Coffman 231912 -                 30d 4w  30d 

810025 645.00                  645.00         648.69         743.50 1,303.87   

Neopart 231922 -                 3w  stock  stock 5w

                                    3 1210016 620.95                  620.95         632.18 753.97       

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock  8w 10w

                                    2 810026 989.68                  989.68 1,199.96   

Coffman 231912 -                 30d 4w

                                    3 810027 505.59                  505.59 674.85               607.50 

Coffman 231912 -                 14d stock  30d 

                                    4 810028 64.13                    134.95           64.13 78.59                 107.00 

Gillig 231917 -                 2w  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 810031 7.87                          7.92             7.87 9.48                       9.40 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock  stock 4w  30d 

                                    6 1010015 945.00              1,236.60     1,249.00         945.00         975.89 1,574.81       1,009.10 

Kirks 231926 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 13w  30d 

                                    3 1010016 2,218.00          2,218.00 3,283.40       2,690.90 

Coffman 231912 -                 30d 7w  30d 

                                    5 1010018 17.39                      19.60           36.91 17.39         20.82                   43.86 

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 stock  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                    4 810064 2,591.43          2,591.43     3,600.00 4,860.04       4,550.15 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 7w  30d 

                                    5 810070 686.19                  686.19         890.97 845.00       1,175.82       1,050.05 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 14d 7w  30d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Rex 
Welding

Rex Sales MW Bus - 
NO BID

Prevost Area Diesel Eldorado Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Coffman Gillig CBM Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 420892

                                    3 1010024 60.30                      60.30 72.70                   65.55 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock 7w  30d 

                                    3 1010026 12.36                      20.69 16.00                   12.36 

Muncie 231920 -                 14D 14d  stock 

                                    1 1010027 41.29                      41.29 

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock 

                                    4 1010028 8.76                          8.76           10.61 13.13                   12.50 

Coffman 231912 -                
 unapproved 

part  30d stock  30d 

                                    4 810094 17.15                      17.15           17.26 23.05                   21.48 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 9w  30d 

                                    3 810101 209.50                  209.50 251.99               232.73 

Coffman 231912 -                 30d  6w  stock 

                                    4 810102 2.98                          3.12             2.98 3.67                       3.50 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock  stock 5w  30d 

                                    4 1010036 89.45                      89.45           90.01 118.78               106.55 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock  7w  30d 

                                    4 810125 91.49                      91.49         100.41 122.21               110.60 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock  7w  30d 

                                    3 810130 379.19                  379.19 571.66               453.00 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock  5w  30d 

                                    6 1210070 46.57                      50.75           46.57           56.89 48.30         55.83                   60.00 

Coffman 231912 -                 60d  stock  11w 60d stock  21d 

                                    5 1210071 185.00                  187.88         186.82 185.00       247.94               224.65 

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 stock  stock stock 5w  30d 

                                    1 1210078 620.95                  620.95 

Eldorado 231913 -                 10w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Rex 
Welding

Rex Sales MW Bus - 
NO BID

Prevost Area Diesel Eldorado Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Coffman Gillig CBM Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 420892

                                    5 810155 265.22                  287.54         265.22 270.00       306.05               292.38 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock  stock  stock stock  100d 

                                    1 810166 48.55                      48.55 

Eldorado 231913 -                 2w 

                                    1 810170 6.51                          6.51 

Eldorado 231913 -                 1w 

                                    5 810173 20.72                      20.72           24.07 21.00         25.03                   24.80 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock stock 5w  21d 

                                    3 810220 401.71                  401.71 575.99               478.89 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock 5w  30d 

                                    5 810221 24.75                      25.35           25.15 24.75         32.67                   30.33 

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 stock  stock 14d stock  21d 

                                    4 1010052 89.46                      89.46           89.54 120.22               107.20 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 6w  30d 

                                    4 1010055 89.46                      89.46           89.54 115.98               108.25 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 15w  30d 

                                    4 810229 13.13                      13.13           13.22 18.56                   15.45 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 7w  stock 

                                    4 810230 3.02                          3.02             3.52 3.97                       3.59 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 5w  30d 

                                    4 810231 213.61                  213.61         228.86 280.25               254.45 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock stock  30d 

                                    3 1010060 2,187.32          2,187.32 3,298.82       2,599.45 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock 7w  30d 

                                    7 1010061 886.18                  993.60         977.80         886.18         887.00         993.04 1,963.44           890.00 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 9w  14d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Rex 
Welding

Rex Sales MW Bus - 
NO BID

Prevost Area Diesel Eldorado Kirks Suburban 
Truck

Coffman Gillig CBM Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 420892

                                    4 810271 36.30                      42.51 36.30         94.44                   84.55 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock 14d stock  30d 

                                    3 810279 252.14                  252.14         281.81         337.10 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock  21d 

                                    1 1210130 620.95                  620.95 

Eldorado 231913 -                 10w 

                                    3 810316 11.50                      11.50           12.65           13.99 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  30d  30d 

                                    4 810340 3.86                          3.86             3.86 5.11                       4.65 

Area Diesel 231925 -                 stock  stock 5w  30d 


	420892

