
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid IO Controls Neopart Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks Rome 
Truck Parts - 

NO BID

Coffman MW Bus Eldorado P&G Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Gillig CBM - NO 
BID

Aftermarket 
Parts

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie

                                    3 71089 0.05                          0.35             0.05 0.25           

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 5d  stock 21d

                                    4 71733 80.50                      95.15           87.25           82.65 80.50         

Muncie 231920 -                 60d  4w  stock 30d

                                    3 71000 0.30                          0.59             0.30 0.40           

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 stock  stock 
 21 only, 
need 50 

                                    3 71216 0.45                          0.61             0.45 0.90           

Hydraulic Electric 231919  stock  stock 60d

                                    5 72121 31.51                      91.75           31.51           62.19           65.66 61.98         

Prevost 231916 -                 stock  60d  6w  5w 30d

                                    4 70220 11.55                      32.35           15.25           21.09 11.55         

Muncie 231920 -                 stock  stock  stock  30d 

                                    6 72143 10.50                      10.62           21.55           13.28           11.25           10.50 10.93         

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 7w  6w  60d  4w  stock 45d

                                    6 72135 56.91                      59.38           97.15           72.05           56.99           56.91 61.10         

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 stock  6w  60d  5w  stock 45d

                                    4 71175 0.50                          3.67             0.72             0.50 1.00           

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 10d  stock  stock stock

                                    1 72077 48.55                      48.55 

Eldorado 231913  stock 

                                    6 72094 14.91                      14.91           83.81           26.95           15.05           19.96 24.00         

Vehicle Maintenance 231911  stock stock  1w  stock  5w 30d

                                    4 71442 6.98                        26.95             8.10           11.83 6.98           

Vehicle Maintenance 231911  stock  stock  25w 30d

                                    2 71278 0.90                          0.99 0.90           

Muncie 231920  stock stock

Pace RFQ# 420891



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid IO Controls Neopart Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks Rome 
Truck Parts - 

NO BID

Coffman MW Bus Eldorado P&G Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Gillig CBM - NO 
BID

Aftermarket 
Parts

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 420891

                                    4 71087 0.06                          0.63             0.07             0.06 0.90           

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 5d  stock  stock stock

                                    5 72109 620.84              1,121.75         620.84     1,120.00     1,350.01 1,250.00   

Eldorado 231913  12w  6w  4w  10w 90d

                                    4 72156 21.46                      21.49           26.45           21.46 22.22         

Aftermarket Parts 231918  7w  60d  stock  45d 

                                    4 72162 32.35                      32.35           56.25           52.06 32.50         

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock  75d  6w  stock 

                                    1 72163 431.95                  431.95 

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock 

                                    1 72177 29.02                      29.02 

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock 

                                    1 72185 9.67                          9.67 

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock 

                                    1 72190 26.95                      26.95 

Eldorado 231913 -                 4w 

                                    4 72295 30.60                      32.35           42.60           41.40 30.60         

Muncie 231920 -                 stock  60d  stock  30d 

                                    2 72301 221.00                  221.00         305.69 

Suburban Truck 231915 -                 5w  5w 

                                    2 72381 310.10                  421.15 310.10       

Muncie 231920 -                 4w 90d

                                    2 710004 21.50                      21.55           21.50 

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 1w  10d 

                                    4 710026 450.00                  545.95         601.20         450.00         513.53 

Gillig 231917 -                 stock  60d  3w  5w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid IO Controls Neopart Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks Rome 
Truck Parts - 

NO BID

Coffman MW Bus Eldorado P&G Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Gillig CBM - NO 
BID

Aftermarket 
Parts

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 420891

                                    7 710043 261.16                  321.00         265.00         261.16         341.93         285.00         302.92 293.38       

P&G 231914 -                 stock  3w  stock  75d  4w  14w 30d

                                    6 710046 29.62                      29.62           37.75           31.59           35.58           32.73 32.32         

Vehicle Maintenance 231911 -                 stock  stock  stock  75d  9w 30d

                                    2 710048 57.65                      57.65           65.64 

Coffman 231912 -                 stock  5w 

                                    4 710052 2,236.02          2,710.00     3,435.99     2,236.02 2,589.30   

P&G 231914 -                 stock  4w  stock 60d

                                    3 710064 6.75                          9.67             8.96             6.75 

Hydraulic Electric 231919 -                 stock  5w  14d 

                                    1 710105 761.43                  761.43 

Eldorado 231913 -                 6w 

                                    7 710120 381.17                  469.00         385.00         381.17         521.24         400.00         472.66 423.98       

P&G 231914 -                 stock  3w  stock  60d  stock  stock 30d

                                    4 710151 372.72                  374.00         497.33         374.95 372.72       

Muncie 231920 -                 stock  stock  stock stock

                                    1 710157 33.20                      33.20 

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock 

                                    4 710161 32.35                      32.35           56.25           50.90 32.88         

Eldorado 231913 -                 stock  60d  9w  30d 

                                    1 710182 27.71                      27.71 

Eldorado 231913 -                 1w 

                                    1 710183 32.35                      32.35 

Eldorado 231913 -                 1w 

                                    1 710190 177.25                  177.25 

Eldorado 231913 -                 4w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid IO Controls Neopart Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Kirks Rome 
Truck Parts - 

NO BID

Coffman MW Bus Eldorado P&G Suburban 
Truck

Prevost Gillig CBM - NO 
BID

Aftermarket 
Parts

Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie

Pace RFQ# 420891

                                    1 710283 4.38                          4.38 

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 25w 

                                    1 710321 390.64                  390.64 

Eldorado 231913 -                 4w 

                                    1 710341 335.48                  335.48 

Eldorado 231913 -                 4w 

                                    1 710369 38.34                      38.34 

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 13w 

                                    1 710370 27.62                      27.62 

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 13w 

                                    1 710371 21.74                      21.74 

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 13w 

                                    1 710372 21.74                      21.74 

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 13w 

                                    1 710373 38.34                      38.34 

Aftermarket Parts 231918 -                 13w 

                                    3 710374 16.16                      18.75           16.31 16.16         

Muncie 231920 -                 4w  9w 60d


	420891

