
Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig Global 

Petroleum 

Products

HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

5 250657 147.50                   147.50    161.99      154.21          148.03        178.15 

Gillig 231892  2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  Stock 

6 41236 138.48                 433.67          159.54        146.19          145.03          138.48        143.58 

Neopart 231897 -                 4 Weeks  2-4 Weeks 

 3 Stock 

Balance 

Apr 28th  21 Days  3-4 Weeks  5 Weeks 

6 41237 88.07                   281.33            97.08          93.15            89.54            88.07          89.68 

Neopart 231897 -                4 Weeks Stock  Apr 28th  30 Days  3-4 Weeks  6 Weeks 

1 151851 5.89                         5.89 

NFI Parts 231898  Stock 

6 40108 2.90                           3.60            2.95              2.90              5.51            2.93            3.05 

Muncie 231896 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 41131 48.00                     48.52            48.00            87.05          92.03          96.16 

Muncie 231896 LOW STOCK  May 12th  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 60734 2.37                            4.10              2.61            2.88            2.44                  2.37 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231900

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                 Stock 

 Must 

purchase in 

multiples of 

20 - 1 Stock 

Balance 45 

Days  11 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

2 30375 44.70             DQ            44.70          45.45 

Muncie 231896 -                

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  Stock 

4 250653 395.75                   446.50      465.00          395.75        512.99 

Muncie 231896  Stock 14 Days  Stock  Stock 

6 40106 2.05                           6.75            2.05              2.49              6.62            6.51          13.64 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231895  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 4 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  Stock 

3 20701 334.75                 334.75          368.49        450.43 

ElDorado 231891  Stock  60 Days  11 Weeks 

6 40958 38.75                   106.83            38.75  DQ            46.15            39.94          44.80          54.25 

Gillig 231892  1 Week  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

7 40798 100.25                 115.00          120.00        129.96          100.25          103.97        115.86        106.77 

Muncie 231896 -                 Stock  1-2 Weeks  Apr 14th  Stock  Stock 

 5 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  Stock 

2 30376 45.99                       45.99          51.51 

Muncie 231896  Stock  10 Weeks 

5 290537 158.13                   158.50     160.00          185.20          158.13        167.83 

Neopart 231897  Stock  Stock 

 3 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days 

 6 Stock 

Balance 2-3 

Weeks  Stock 

4 290289 9.66                      9.90            25.65              9.91            9.66 

NFI Parts 231898  Stock  21 Days  2-3 Weeks  Stock 

3 290647 90.33                   134.95            96.49          90.33 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock  30 Days  7 Weeks 

RFQ 420872 Due: 03/25/2021



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig Global 

Petroleum 

Products

HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420872 Due: 03/25/2021

3 290644 34.99                     59.35            56.04                34.99 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231900 -                 Stock  21 Days  Stock 

5 41213 122.96                 130.00          122.96  DQ          180.22          265.13        130.36 

Gillig 231892 -                 Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  21 Days  2-3 Weeks  Stock 

5 41217 84.99                   161.95          85.41            91.85          84.99        140.94 

NFI Parts 231898  Stock  Stock 

 3 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  Stock 

4 60561 41.27            118.90                  41.27          129.95        144.04 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231895 -                7 Days  Stock  21 Days  5 Weeks 

5 10405 121.80                 194.35          121.80        122.70          168.05        135.78 

Gillig 231892 -                 Stock  2-4 Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 40632 0.13                         0.13              0.30              0.45            0.34            0.37 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231895   Stock  Stock 

 Must be 

ordered in 

multiples of 

50 Stock  Stock  Stock 

1 60348 4.69                         4.69 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231895 -                 Stock 

4 60375 9.17                          17.00  DQ            20.57            9.17                12.34 

Suburban Truck Parts 

231899 -                

 per foot 14 

Stock 

Balance 1 

month 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  60 Days 

 per foot 

Stock 

 per foot 

Stock 

5 60739 13.45                        29.99          13.45            25.32          21.27          27.01 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231895 -                 Stock  Apr 29th  45 Days  5 Weeks  Stock 

5 10365 69.20                       73.78          69.40            73.75          69.20        140.94 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 10366 69.20                       73.78          69.40            72.65          69.20        140.94 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 60376 10.40             DQ            20.86          10.40                13.07 

Suburban Truck Parts 

231899

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  60 Days 

 per foot 

Stock  Stock 

3 151964 27.70                     37.75            31.55          27.70 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock 

 10 Pc Min 

Buy 21 Days  Stock 

1 30411 209.95                 209.95 

ElDorado 231891 -                 Stock 

5 20707 92.03                   172.75          100.68          109.19            92.03          93.21 

Neopart 231897 -                 Stock  2 Weeks  30 Days  Stock  6 Weeks 

4 10411 109.00                 151.15          109.00          109.22        111.78 

Gillig 231892 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  13 Weeks 

3 290666 25.25                     26.95            25.25          28.96 

Muncie 231896

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                 Stock  30 Days  7 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig Global 

Petroleum 

Products

HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420872 Due: 03/25/2021

1 20712 410.35                 410.35 

ElDorado 231891 -                 Stock 

6 41266 904.21             1,271.95          904.21          920.00          923.52        952.27    1,563.32 

Gillig 231892 -                 6 Weeks  Stock  Stock  4-6 Weeks 

 1 Stock 

Balance 12 

Weeks  Stock 

2 290671 17.83                       18.46                17.83 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231900

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND  30 Days  Stock 

1 60770 59.35                     59.35 

ElDorado 231891

SOUTH HAS LOW 

STOCK -                 Stock 

1 152006 16.15                     16.15 

ElDorado 231891 -                 Stock 

7 41271 28.18                     68.73            31.14          52.46            28.18            31.69          34.95          47.22 

Muncie 231896 -                 2 Weeks  Stock  Apr 14th  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

4 290673 925.00             1,200.00          925.00       1,018.81        939.35 

Gillig 231892 -                 4 Weeks  2-4 Weeks  21 Days  6 Weeks 

4 250714 54.32                       57.51            65.65            54.32          63.25 

Neopart 231897

NORTH SHORE HAS 

0 ON HAND -                 Stock  Stock  3-4 Weeks  8 Weeks 

4 250716 53.08                       56.23            64.94            53.08          65.48 

Neopart 231897 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

4 290679 53.00                       54.30       53.00            62.92          56.70 

HECS 231893 -                

 11 Stock 

Balance 4-6 

Weeks  Stock  21 Days  4 Weeks 

2 41294 1,394.50         1,396.45    1,394.50 

NFI Parts 231898

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                 10 Weeks  Stock 

3 250784 203.19                   203.19          221.72        232.57 

Gillig 231892 -                 Stock  30 Days  Stock 

7 41332 130.00                 130.00          310.00        377.72          426.50          317.61        299.95        317.58 

ElDorado 231891 -                 Stock  2-4 Weeks  Apr 14th  30 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 290695 61.99                     91.75            61.99          62.80 

Muncie 231896 -                 Stock  Stock  24 Weeks 

6 290696 8.80              8.80           10.10                37.75  DQ            27.05            11.00          11.06 

Autex Automotive 

Devices 231888 -                 1 Day  Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  3-4 Weeks  5 Weeks 

5 152074 10.48                     16.15            11.53          10.48            10.68          12.53 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231895 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  4 Weeks 

3 290700 161.48                 248.35          163.40        161.48 

ElDorado 231891 -                 Stock  67 Days  25 Weeks 

3 290701 161.48                 248.35          163.40        161.48 

Muncie 231896 -                 Stock  Stock  25 Weeks 

1 30483 119.31                 119.31 

ElDorado 231891  2 Weeks 

1 110003 237.55                 237.55 

ElDorado 231891 -                 4 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig Global 

Petroleum 

Products

HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420872 Due: 03/25/2021

4 2510000 318.56                   495.00          595.55          318.56        525.86 

Neopart 231897 -                

 1 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks  45 Days  3-4 Weeks  Stock 

6 410001 783.98             1,100.00    1,348.96          799.25          783.98        788.38        890.06 

Neopart 231897

NORTH HAS 2 

CORES -                

 225.00 

Core 

Charge 

Stock  Apr 14th 

 302.50 

Core Charge 

21 Days 

 300.00 

Core Charge 

Stock 

 275.00 

Core 

Charge 

Stock 

 275.00 

Core 

Charge 

Stock 

6 410002 783.98             1,100.00    1,348.96          799.25          783.98        788.38        890.06 

Neopart 231897

NORTH HAS 2 

CORES -                

 225.00 

Core 

Charge 

Stock  Apr 14th 

 302.50 

Core Charge 

30 Days 

 300.00 

Core Charge 

Stock 

 275.00 

Core 

Charge 

Stock 

 275.00 

Core 

Charge 

Stock 

6 410006 143.29                 145.00          147.52  DQ          143.29          147.29        143.46        293.01 

Muncie 231896 -                 Stock  1-2 Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  30 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 410007 111.52                 133.00          112.00  DQ          130.31          111.52        127.23 

Neopart 231897 -                 Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  21 Days  Stock  Stock 

6 410010 130.00                 160.00          130.00  DQ          159.30          155.93        139.63        290.36 

Gillig 231892 -                 Stock  1-2 Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  21 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

2 1510007 19.13                     26.95          19.13 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock  Stock 

3 1510008 13.00                     13.60       13.00          13.37 

HECS 231893 -                 Stock  14 Days  Stock 

1 210002 323.95                 323.95 

ElDorado 231891 -                 Stock 

1 1510011 237.55                 237.55 

ElDorado 231891 -                 2 Weeks 

3 410020 215.00           DQ          215.00          240.91        265.91 

Muncie 231896 -                

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 610009 2.49                         6.97              4.26            2.49 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 4 Weeks  30 Days 

 25 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks 

5 410023 55.42                       65.59            55.42            55.51          62.55          60.21 

Muncie 231896 -                 4-6 Weeks  Stock  Stock  5 Weeks  Stock 

5 410024 231.52                   257.65          231.52          232.92        250.98        347.08 

Muncie 231896 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 410025 55.40                       65.59            55.42            55.40          63.56          61.19 

Neopart 231897 -                 4-6 Weeks  Stock  Stock  5 Weeks  Stock 

5 610014 12.15            13.75     13.67                    17.96            12.15          16.64 

Muncie 231896 -                Stock  Stock  Apr 28th  Stock  7 Weeks 

4 610018 40.12            40.12     44.72            DQ            47.50          53.27 

Area Diesel Service 

231887 -                Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  30 Days  5 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig Global 

Petroleum 

Products

HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420872 Due: 03/25/2021

1 610017 75.55                     75.55 

ElDorado 231891 -                 2 Weeks 

6 610019 71.50            138.25               71.50          72.34            72.62          72.72          76.59 

Kirk's Automotive 

231894 -                Stock  3 Weeks  Stock  30 Days  7 Weeks  Stock 

1 310009 131.91                 131.91 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock 

4 610025 31.20            31.20     31.29                      36.99          38.42 

Area Diesel Service 

231887 -                Stock  Stock  30 Days 

 14 Stock 

Balance 7 

Weeks 

6 610026 69.00            69.69     146.90           69.00           135.00  DQ          166.03        127.73 

HECS 231893 -                Stock 9 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

Not an 

aproved 

OEM  Stock 

 Up To 19 

Weeks 

2 310013 102.17           DQ          210.10        102.17 

NFI Parts 231898 -                

 Not an 

aproved 

OEM 

 2 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days 

 1 Stock 

Balance 13 

Weeks 

1 110019 43.15                     43.15 

ElDorado 231891 -                 2 Weeks 

7 610033 625.69          625.69   685.79             690.00           650.00    1,138.73          815.99        921.15 

Area Diesel Service 

231887 & Kirk's 

Automotive 231894

NORTHWEST HAS 4 

CORES HERITAGE 

HAS 0 CORES -                

 230.00 

Core 

Charge 

(855.69) 

Stock 

 200.00 Core 

Charge 

(885.79) 

Stock 

 No Core 

Charge 

Stock 

 20.00 Core 

Charge 

(670.00) 3 

Weeks  Apr 14th 

 316.25 

Core Charge 

(1132.24) 

60 Days 

 230.00 

Core 

Charge 

(1151.15) 

5 Weeks 

1 610036 3,801.55         3,801.55 

ElDorado 231891 -                 Stock 

5 410034 206.91                   206.91        241.73          216.11          208.12        221.22 

Gillig 231892 -                 4 Weeks  Apr 28th  30 Days  3-4 Weeks 

 2 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks 

4 410035 376.45                   460.50          383.75          376.45        430.67 

Neopart 231897 -                 6 Weeks 

 1 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  3-4 Weeks  6 Weeks 

1 110022 32.35                     32.35 

ElDorado 231891 -                 2 Weeks 

1 310018 11.66                     11.66 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock 

3 610055 37.74            37.74            DQ            44.50          46.66 

Coffman Truck Sales 

231890 -                

 18 Stock 

Balance 7 

Days 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM 

 10 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days 

 2 Stock 

Balance 7 

Weeks 

3 2510040 43.50                       48.29            43.71          43.50 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 2-3 Weeks  60 Days  6 Weeks 

4 610058 44.52            91.69     97.64            DQ          108.50          44.52 

NFI Parts 231898 -                Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM 

 2 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  Stock 

2 610061 5.35                       17.85            5.35 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock  Stock 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig Global 

Petroleum 

Products

HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420872 Due: 03/25/2021

1 1510112 18.77                     18.77 

ElDorado 231891 -                 1 Week 

1 1510113 20.64                     20.64 

ElDorado 231891

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                 4 Weeks 

1 1510014 15.09                     15.09 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 5 Weeks 

1 1510122 23.85                     23.85 

ElDorado 231891 -                 1 Week 

3 1510130 36.00                     37.75       36.00          36.15 

HECS 231893 -                 Stock  14 Days  Stock 

1 1510141 22.71                     22.71 

ElDorado 231891 -                 1 Week 

5 2510067 918.33                   918.50    961.26      935.00          918.33        976.87 

Neopart 231897 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  7 Weeks 

1 110039 0.25                         0.25 

ElDorado 231891 -                 1 Week 

1 2910031 283.15                 283.15 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock 

5 610088 34.78            101.96   34.78       101.39          DQ          122.75          59.66 

CBM 231889

SOUTH HAS LOW 

STOCK -                Stock Stock 10 Days

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  21 Days  5 Weeks 

1 1510176 2.55                         2.55 

ElDorado 231891 -                 1 Week 

1 1510177 4.92                         4.92 

ElDorado 231891 -                 1 Week 

1 610102 1,144.32         1,144.32 

ElDorado 231891 -                 4 Weeks 

5 310048 53.06                       55.85  DQ            53.06            54.82          56.60          69.70 

Muncie 231896 -                 Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 610111 32.55            34.85     32.55                    38.54            35.50          39.34 

Coffman Truck Sales 

231890 -                Stock Stock

 2 Stock 

Balance 

Apr 28th  30 Days  9 Weeks 

4 610117 1.81              1.81        1.82               DQ              2.20            2.44 

Area Diesel Service 

231887 -                Stock Stock

 Not an 

approved 

OEM 

 2 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  3 Weeks 

4 610123 35.26            35.26     39.54                      41.91          45.44 

Area Diesel Service 

231887

SOUTH HAS LOW 

STOCK -                Stock Stock  45 Days  9 Weeks 

4 410105 15.08                     52.99            15.09            15.08          17.09 

Neopart 231897 -                 4 Weeks  Stock  4-6 Weeks  15 Weeks 

1 1510282 508.80                 508.80 

ElDorado 231891 -                 3 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig Global 

Petroleum 

Products

HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420872 Due: 03/25/2021

0 1510284 -                

Did not award - Need 

to verify OEM part 

number. -                

 Need to 

verify 

correct 

part 

number 

2 1510287 174.75                 294.28          174.75 

Muncie 231896 -                 4 Weeks  21 Days 

1 310053 16.12                     16.12 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 Stock 

1 2910065 343.18                 343.18 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 5 Weeks 

1 1510288 15.32                     15.32 

NFI Parts 231898 -                

 2 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks 

1 1510289 29.76                     29.76 

NFI Parts 231898 -                 4 Weeks 


