
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Kirks Eldorado Suburban 

Truck
Area Diesel CBM Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Hyraulic 

Electric
Gillig Transit 

Parts
Aftermarket 

Parts
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie Coffman

                                  1 110138 5.89                         5.89 

Eldorado 231862 -                 stock 

                                  8 110136 68.89                     82.92          75.45          99.00          69.58          68.89        129.35        108.61          79.60 

Vehicle Maintenance 231882 -                 14d  stock  stock  stock  stock  60d  7w  30d 

                                  6 81313 35.38                     83.11          84.72          35.38          76.18          48.08          70.57 

CBM 231867 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 100223 59.00                     59.00        110.17          92.89 

Hydraulic Electric 231875  stock  6w  5d 

                                  4 81342 9.38                         9.38          12.16          11.35          10.39 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  7w  30d  stock 

                                  5 81345 124.00                142.98        124.00        192.16        173.00        141.58 

Hydraulic Electric 231875 -                 stock  stock  5w  stock  stock 

                                  3 81351 445.22                447.23        541.10        445.22 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  30d  stock 

                                  3 81378 22.42                     46.69          33.85          22.42 

Muncie 231876 -                 1w  stock  30d 

                                  4 81384 5.16                         5.16            7.08            6.15            5.17 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                  4 81402 25.99                     25.99          33.50          30.50          26.07 

Area Diesel 231881 stock  7w  stock  stock 

                                  1 81423 43.15                     43.15 

Eldorado 231862  stock 

                                  4 81422 1.50                         1.97            2.41            2.40            1.50 

Coffman 231886 stock  7w  30d  stock 

                                  4 81430 283.08                305.71        355.84        338.00        283.08 

Coffman 231886  stock  5w  30d  7d 

                                  1 140076 604.75                604.75 

Eldorado 231862 -                 4w 

Pace RFQ# 420867



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Kirks Eldorado Suburban 

Truck
Area Diesel CBM Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Hyraulic 

Electric
Gillig Transit 

Parts
Aftermarket 

Parts
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie Coffman

Pace RFQ# 420867

                                  2 120535 250.62                275.75        250.62 

Muncie 231876  2w  stock 

                                  4 81441 40.76                     40.76          42.25          51.24          42.73 

Area Diesel 231881 stock  stock  stock  7d 

                                  5 81444 71.00                   101.43          71.00          76.50          72.08          75.57 

Gillig 231883 -                 stock  stock  8w  4w  60d 

                                  4 81454 113.78                113.78        151.41        144.63        119.00 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                  3 110150 20.43                     25.27          25.50          20.43 

Coffman 231886 -                 5w  21d  stock 

                                  4 81516 8.28                         8.28          11.06            9.35            9.12 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 110154 349.00                349.00 

Eldorado 231886 -                 8w 

                                  5 81519 55.64                     55.64          56.85        110.51          81.50          78.53 

Kirks 231879 -                 stock  8w  4w  21d  7d 

                                  3 81534 32.83                     57.20          32.83          32.89 

Aftermarket Parts 231881 -                 1w  stock  21d 

                                  3 1110000 37.55                     38.15          37.55          49.97 

Kirks 231879 -                 6w  stock  5w 

                                  7 1210002 24.85                     25.85          27.55          25.85          27.66          25.25          27.70          24.85 

Coffman 231886 -                 14d  stock  stock  stock  4w  21d  stock 

                                  7 1210003 17.60                     19.90          19.90          17.60          39.12          20.54          22.44          21.87 

Vehicle Maintenance 231882 -                 14d 
 unapproved 

part  stock  7w  stock  30d  stock 

                                  2 810018 28.28                     93.84          28.28 

Muncie 231876 -                 5w  21d 

                                  5 1010002 3.72                         6.50          18.90            3.72            3.74            5.74 

Hydraulic Electric 231875 -                 stock  1w  stock  stock  21d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Kirks Eldorado Suburban 

Truck
Area Diesel CBM Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Hyraulic 

Electric
Gillig Transit 

Parts
Aftermarket 

Parts
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie Coffman

Pace RFQ# 420867

                                  1 1010006 20.95                     20.95 

Eldorado 231862 -                 stock 

                                  1 1010007 466.00                466.00 

Eldorado 231862 -                 8w 

                                  3 1210016 600.00                600.00        632.18        759.00 

Eldorado 231862 -                 stock  8w  10w 

                                  2 810026 989.68             1,207.11        989.68 

Coffman 231886 -                 4w  30d 

                                  2 810027 505.59                734.20        505.59 

Coffman 231886 -                 9w  30d 

                                  3 810030 2.32                         2.85            2.79            2.32 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  30d  stock 

                                  4 810031 7.87                         7.92            9.51            9.40            7.87 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  4w  30d  stock 

                                  3 1310005 2.66                         3.06            2.66            2.70 

Muncie 231876 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 1010015 945.00                945.00     1,584.24     1,236.60        950.00        983.26 

Kirks 231879 -                 stock  13w  stock 
 1 ONLY, 
need 3  stock 

                                  4 1010016 2,174.34          2,174.34     3,327.18     2,690.90     2,218.12 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  7w  30d  30d 

                                  2 1210020 42.93                     70.15          42.93 

Aftermarket Parts 231872 -                 stock  8w 

                                  5 810045 360.00                528.78        702.05        360.00        630.03        529.22 

Neopart 231885 -                stock  7w  stock  30d  stock 

                                  6 810046 356.00                380.91        356.00        551.30        369.72        357.93        378.38 

Hydraulic Electric 231875 -                 stock  14d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 810050 98.00                   122.44        122.02        105.99          98.00 

Muncie 231876 -                 4w  3w  7w  30d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Kirks Eldorado Suburban 

Truck
Area Diesel CBM Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Hyraulic 

Electric
Gillig Transit 

Parts
Aftermarket 

Parts
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie Coffman

Pace RFQ# 420867

                                  3 810051 123.99                126.36        128.15        123.99 

Aftermarket Parts 231872 -                 4w  3q  5w 

                                  3 810053 2.71                         3.55            3.20            2.71 

Coffman 231886 -                 6w  30d  stock 

                                  6 810065 10.87                     30.88          10.87          27.66          55.65          53.90          44.85 

CBM 231867 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                  8 1210033 23.97                     26.57          29.00          26.57          23.97          42.07          28.82          27.99          24.44 

Vehicle Maintenance 231882 -                 14d  stock  stock  stock  60d  stock  30d  10d 

                                  3 810073 101.00                101.00        139.38        106.96 

Hydraulic Electric 231875 -                 14d  7w  30d 

                                  3 810078 380.00                380.00        634.93        388.74 

Hydraulic Electric 231875 -                 14d  5w  30d 

                                  4 1210038 1,945.41          1,945.41     1,960.00     2,848.61     2,026.45 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  14d  10w  30d 

                                  4 1010032 67.00                     67.00        141.82          77.40        107.27 

Hydraulic Electric 231875 -                 14d  6w  stock  30d 

                                  6 1010034 38.00                     39.62          38.00          49.82          47.60          49.49          41.72 

Hydraulic Electric 231875 -                 stock  stock  14w  stock  30d  stock 

                                  2 810101 209.50                252.68        209.50 

Coffman 231886 -                 7w  30d 

                                  4 810130 370.69                370.69        574.93        453.03        377.97 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                  4 810136 4.86                         4.86            6.00            5.40            4.90 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  4w  stock  stock 

                                  5 1210071 182.83                182.83        185.00        249.44        224.75        186.43 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  14d  5w  30d  stock 

                                   - 1210074 -                

-                



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Kirks Eldorado Suburban 

Truck
Area Diesel CBM Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Hyraulic 

Electric
Gillig Transit 

Parts
Aftermarket 

Parts
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie Coffman

Pace RFQ# 420867

                                  4 810143 9.78                       10.48          11.21          10.75            9.78 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  3w  28d  stock 

                                   - 1210078 -                

-                

                                  1 1210086 138.61                138.61 

Transit Parts 231884 -                 4w 

                                  4 810181 2.30                         2.30            3.02            2.75            2.30 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  6w  30d  stock 

                                  4 810189 36.80                     36.80          47.43          45.35          40.18 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  5w  21d  stock 

                                  3 810220 400.85                577.56        479.85        400.85 

Coffman 231886 -                 5w  30d  stock 

                                  4 810229 13.13                     13.13          19.31          15.50          13.15 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  7w  stock  stock 

                                  4 810231 213.61                213.61        283.63        254.54        224.86 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  stock  30d  30d 

                                  4 810241 3.10                         3.12            4.04            3.77            3.10 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                  5 1010070 297.40                298.42        500.00        405.99        356.75        297.40 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  14d  5w  63d  stock 

                                  4 810287 1.46                         1.46            1.93            1.78            1.65 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  4w  30d  stock 

                                  3 810301 453.55                613.58        555.65        453.55 

Coffman 231886 -                 9w  45d  10d 

                                   - 1210130 -                

-                

                                  4 810317 98.20                     98.20        103.00        112.25        106.74 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  14d  30d  14d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power
Kirks Eldorado Suburban 

Truck
Area Diesel CBM Vehicle 

Maintenance
Prevost Hyraulic 

Electric
Gillig Transit 

Parts
Aftermarket 

Parts
Neopart 
Transit

Muncie Coffman

Pace RFQ# 420867

                                  4 810323 40.00                     40.00          81.26          72.00          67.38 

Hydraulic Electric 231875 -                 14d  11w  21d  10d 

                                  3 1010080 872.47             1,075.98        971.35        872.47 

Coffman 231886 -                 9w  21d  30d 

                                  3 1310034 247.36                281.08        275.98        247.36 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  30d  7d 

                                  3 1310035 4.73                         5.37            5.10            4.73 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 1310036 3.85                         4.37            4.18            3.85 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 1310037 2.92                         3.31          62.50            2.92 

Coffman 231886 -                 stock  30d  stock 

                                  2 1310038 618.61                702.97        618.61 

Coffman 231886 -                 20d  7d 

                                  4 810337 51.62                     51.62          69.38          62.50          52.22 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  10w  30d  stock 

                                  4 810338 98.65                     98.65        132.58        119.50        110.04 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  10w  30d  7d 

                                  4 810339 2.10                         2.10            2.89            2.53            2.10 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  6w  30d  stock 

                                  4 810340 3.85                         3.85            5.18            4.65            3.85 

Area Diesel 231881 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock 


	420867

