Pace RFQ# 420866

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Kirks Interstate | Eldorado | MW Bus |10 Controls Gillig Suburban | P&G Keene| Prevost | CBM - NO | Aftermarket | Neopart | Hydraulic Muncie

NO # of Bids Maintenance Power Truck BID Parts Electric

5 71089 0.04 0.17 0.35 4.38 0.05 0.04
Muncie 231876 - stock 5d stock stock 21d

4 71733 80.71 87.25 95.15 82.65 80.71
Availability -
Aftermarket Parts 231872 - 4w 60d stock 35d

3 71875 4.75 18.15 4.77 4.75
Muncie 231876 - stock stock stock

4 71441 6.23 30.95 8.10 7.22 6.23
Muncie 231876 stock stock 5w 30d

4 70220 11.55 32.35 15.25 21.22 11.55

no lead

Muncie 231876 - stock time given stock stock

2 71540 58.89 58.89 61.67

20 ONLY,

Eldorado 231862 - stock need 40

4 72136 41.34 535.70 46.99 41.34 57.82
Aftermarket Parts 231872 - 4w stock 4w 60d

1 71838 0.55 0.55
Aftermarket Parts 231872 - stock

4 72056 16.90 26.28 16.90 25.00
Aftermarket Parts 231872 - stock stock 14d

4 71442 6.34 30.95 8.10 6.94 6.34
Muncie 231876 stock stock stock stock

7 72078 1,796.91 2,059.00 2,952.00 1,964.54 1,796.91| 2,584.94 2,198.36 2,095.53




Pace RFQ# 420866
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-/ ! | . [ | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Kirks Interstate | Eldorado | MW Bus |10 Controls Gillig Suburban | P&G Keene| Prevost | CBM - NO | Aftermarket | Neopart | Hydraulic Muncie
NO # of Bids Maintenance Power Truck BID Parts Electric
P&G Keene 231866 stock 3w stock stock 105d stock 30d
72144 26.95 26.95
Eldorado 231862 stock
72149 70.91 70.91 89.52
10 Controls 231864 8w 11w
72177 29.02 29.02
Eldorado 231862 - stock
72184 5.39 11.83 5.39 5.46
Aftermarket Parts 231872 stock stock stock
72206 4.39 19.41 10.49 4.39
Muncie 231876 stock stock 30d
72216 151.00 291.55 160.60 210.00 151.00
Aftermarket Parts 231872 - stock stock stock stock
72238 1,417.45 1,417.45 1,797.28| 1,775.00 2,325.23
Eldorado 231862 - 12w 8w 8w 14w
72288 70.91 70.91 89.50
10 Controls 231864 - 8w 14w
72289 70.91 70.91 89.50
10 Controls 231864 - 8w 14w
72301 221.00 221.00 307.47
Suburban Truck 231865 - stock 5w




Pace RFQ# 420866
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-/ ! | . [ | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Kirks Interstate | Eldorado | MW Bus |10 Controls Gillig Suburban | P&G Keene| Prevost | CBM - NO | Aftermarket | Neopart | Hydraulic Muncie
NO # of Bids Maintenance Power Truck BID Parts Electric
72382 292.65 484.03 312.50 292.65 292.65
Aftermarket Parts 231872 - 8w 8w 14w 90d
710008 167.51 167.51
Eldorado 231862 - stock
710033 12.84 13.37 13.91 15.62 13.89 12.84
Muncie 231876 - stock stock stock stock stock
710052 2,236.02 2,712.00 3,235.73 2,236.02 2,589.30
P&G Keene 231866 - 1w 3w stock 60d
710057 45.00 59.91 45.00 54.55
Hydraulic Electric 231875 - 13w 14d 21d
710097 33.40 33.40 36.70
3 ONLY,
Eldorado 231862 - stock need 5
710105 761.43 761.43
Eldorado 231862 - 4w
710129 3,799.00 3,799.00
Eldorado 231862 - 8w
710145 70.91 70.91 81.36 81.55
10 Controls 231864 - 8w stock 90d
710149 321.00 366.27 389.00 359.61 386.04 321.00 354.55
Hydraulic Electric 231875 - stock 7d stock stock 14d 21d
710170 2,729.66 3,096.00 3,698.00 3,100.00 2,729.66 | 3,816.82 3,283.13 3,318.75




Pace RFQ# 420866

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-/ ! | . [ | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Kirks Interstate | Eldorado | MW Bus |10 Controls Gillig Suburban | P&G Keene| Prevost | CBM - NO | Aftermarket | Neopart | Hydraulic Muncie
NO # of Bids Maintenance Power Truck BID Parts Electric
no lead

P&G Keene 231866 - time given 4w 4w stock 60d 10w 30d

2 710199 26.95 26.95 70.91
Eldorado 231862 - 4w 8w

1 710278 499.72 499.72
Eldorado 231862 - stock

1 710302 5.44 5.44
Aftermarket Parts 231872 - 5w

1 710338 2,746.20 2,746.20
Aftermarket Parts 231872 - 16w

1 710365 44.10 44.10
Hydraulic Electric 231875 - 14d

1 710366 740.76 740.76
Eldorado 231862 - stock

1 710367 44.06 44.06
Aftermarket Parts 231872 - 19w

2 710368 2.05 3.55 2.05
Muncie 231876 - stock stock




	420866

