Pace RFQ# 420865
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 -
Sku  Winning bid GENFARE TRANSLITE PREVOST FILTER GILLIG MIDWEST GLOBAL NEOPART | ILLINOIS | INTERNATIONAL | SUBURBAN RILCO CBM KIRK'S | MOHAWK | HYDRAULIC | COFFMAN MUNCIE | THE AFTERMARKET | ELDORADO MIDWEST |MYERSTIRE|  KELLER
NO # of Bids ENT. SERVICES BUS PETROLEUM AUTO FILTER TRUCK PARTS ELECTRIC TRUCK PARTS CO. TRANSIT HEARTT
3| 170527 120.00 120.00 202.82 221.58
TRANSLITE ENT. 231857 . s 60D 5W
5 | 200334 3.25 5.83 5.40 3.25 4.05 7.58
MUNCIE 231873 . s 7D 14D s 4w
3| 170528 120.00 120.00 202.82 221.58
TRANSLITE ENT. 231857 . s 60D 5W
1| 230066 450.89 450.89
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 s
4| 180669 164.44 211.43 164.44 186.80 315.19
GILLIG 231859 . s s 14w s
6 | 211005 111 1.15 12.28 129 2.85 111 14.47
MUNCIE 231873 . 20D 1w s 30D 21D
7| 220338 3.56 6.15 5.37 4.65 3.56 4.86 5.52 11.83
S - OEM#
NOT PACE
CBM 231867 - s s s APPROVED 21D s s
4| 220340 608.89 667.55 639.77 608.89 654.26
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - 2w 75D s s
4| 200522 16.00 24.56 16.25 16.00 23.08
MUNCIE 231873 - 4w s s 5W
1| 160590 12.91 1291
ELDORADO 231877 s
4| 160600 9.19 13.55 9.25 9.37 9.19
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 s 2w 21D 6W
7| 210995 405.00 535.72 405.00 430.14 591.97 440.80 511.65 446.73
MIDWEST BUS 231860 4w 7D 1w s 2w 21D s
1| 240058 9.16 9.16
MYERS TIRES 231880 s
2| 910103 1.18 1.23 118
RILCO 231863 - s s
5| 180794 8.70 10.52 1215 10.18 9.25 8.70
S - OEM#
THE AFTERMARKET NOT PACE
PARTS CO. 231874 90D 6W APPROVED 14D s




Sku Winning bid GENFARE TRANSLITE PREVOST FILTER GILLIG MIDWEST GLOBAL NEOPART ILLINOIS INTERNATIONAL SUBURBAN RILCO CBM KIRK'S MOHAWK | HYDRAULIC | COFFMAN MUNCIE THE AFTERMARKET ELDORADO MIDWEST | MYERS TIRE KELLER
NO # of Bids ENT. SERVICES BUS PETROLEUM AUTO FILTER TRUCK PARTS ELECTRIC TRUCK PARTS CO. TRANSIT HEARTT
2| 210968 149.65 149.65 164.90
MUNCIE 231873 65D W
2| 210883 2.75 2.98 2.75
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - S S
5| 210756 4.20 5.45 4.20 4.20 5.05 4.85
AVAIL. / ILLINOIS
AUTO 231861 - S 1w 2W 21D S
3| 220228 12.55 3244 13.50 12.55
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - 6W S W
- | 170623 -
NO BID -
6| 211004 111 115 10.71 1.30 2.83 111 13.48
MUNCIE 231873 - 20D 1w S 3D 21D W
3| 210893 1.54 5.11 1.60 1.54
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - 30D S S
4| 160690 199.90 247.75 199.95 211.15 199.90
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - S S 60D 3w
3| 160593 28.60 29.43 28.60 30.63
MUNCIE 231873 - S 60D 3w
4| 160700 41.45 104.08 41.45 86.50 64.04
GILLIG 231859 - S S 35D 30D
2 | 910005 137 1.37 1.46
RILCO 231863 - S S
4| 210784 59.85 59.85 157.97 65.15 73.88
7D - OEM#
NOT PACE
MUNCIE 231873 - APPROVED 30D 60D 16W
6 | 200913 11.64 14.26 19.22 11.67 16.53 12.30 11.64
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - S 8w S S 21D S
3| 910124 850.00 873.95 850.00 1,724.00
RILCO 231863 - 5D S S
5| 200920 4.59 4.59 33.42 23.50 27.99 3139
S- OEM#
NOT PACE
COFFMAN TRUCK 231871 - APPROVED 30D S S SW
1| 170661 158.91 158.91
TRANSLITE ENT. 231857 - 8w




Sku Winning bid GENFARE TRANSLITE PREVOST FILTER GILLIG MIDWEST GLOBAL NEOPART ILLINOIS INTERNATIONAL SUBURBAN RILCO CBM KIRK'S MOHAWK | HYDRAULIC | COFFMAN MUNCIE THE AFTERMARKET ELDORADO MIDWEST | MYERS TIRE KELLER
NO # of Bids ENT. SERVICES BUS PETROLEUM AUTO FILTER TRUCK PARTS ELECTRIC TRUCK PARTS CO. TRANSIT HEARTT
1| 910130 1.50 1.50
RILCO 231863 - S
1| 180824 225.66 225.66
MIDWEST TRANSIT 231878 - 4D
6 | 200964 6.36 35.15 31.81 6.36 31.65 32.30 59.35
MOHAWK 231869 - S 4W S 21D SW S
4| 220419 3.73 5.16 6.05 3.73 4.08
MUNCIE 231873 - 90D 7D 140D S
1| 211010 344.00 344.00
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - S
6 | 2010004 16.15 26.12 303.10 28.41 28.25 29.77 16.15
ELDORADO 231877 - 60D 4W 2W 30D SW S
6 | 2010016 97.15 170.56 152.09 175.32 160.15 166.02 97.15
ELDORADO 231877 - S S 2W 30D 6w 4W
6 | 2010018 37.04 56.72 45.94 37.04 46.28 53.99 51.80
CBM 231867 - 4W 6W S 30D 70D 6w
5 | 2010020 28.14 44.47 48.02 28.14 49.80 53.51
S- OEM#
NOT PACE
PREVOST 231858 45D 4w APPROVED 30D 5W
5 | 2010021 31.60 151.00 163.08 31.60 168.32 178.61
S- OEM#
NOT PACE
PREVOST 231858 - N 4w APPROVED 30D 5W
3 | 2010022 4.25 6.86 4.25 4.58
2W - OEM#
NOT PACE
MUNCIE 231873 - APPROVED S S
2 | 2210005 1,930.00 1,930.00 1,942.83
AVAIL. / THE
AFTERMARKET PARTS
co. 231874 - 165D S
7 | 2110053 640.00 815.00 709.52 976.47 680.00 640.00 665.49 818.34
HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC | 231870 - 4w 1w S S 14D 140D S
1| 1710052 101.07 101.07
ELDORADO 231877 - 4W
6 | 2010037 446.89 479.92 483.75 446.89 499.80 561.94 496.75
MOHAWK 231869 - 60D 4W 2W 30D SW S
5 | 2010041 1,505.00 1,505.00 1,563.58 2,492.64 29,115.38 3,049.57
30D-
OEM# NOT
PACE
KIRK'S 231868 - N APPROVED 7D 14D S




Sku Winning bid GENFARE TRANSLITE PREVOST FILTER GILLIG MIDWEST GLOBAL NEOPART ILLINOIS INTERNATIONAL SUBURBAN RILCO CBM KIRK'S MOHAWK | HYDRAULIC | COFFMAN MUNCIE THE AFTERMARKET ELDORADO MIDWEST | MYERS TIRE KELLER
NO # of Bids ENT. SERVICES BUS PETROLEUM AUTO FILTER TRUCK PARTS ELECTRIC TRUCK PARTS CO. TRANSIT HEARTT
4 | 1810036 101.00 133.78 102.40 101.00 112.00
HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC | 231870 - 90D 2W S 13W
1| 1610099 281.72 281.72
ELDORADO 231877 - S
1| 2210035 0.91 0.91
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - S
1| 2210036 6.78 6.78
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - 6w
2 | 2210038 4.58 4.58 7.63
MUNCIE 231873 - 60D 6w
4 | 2210045 6.24 6.24 8.58 7.52 7.19
ILLINOIS AUTO 231861 - 1w S 21D ow
6 | 2210046 2.82 4.11 2.98 4.10 2.82 3.55 3.29
MOHAWK 231869 - S 1w S 15D 21D S
1| 2110142 21.89 21.89
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - SW
4 | 2310000 14.19 26.76 14.19 20.19 22.15
CBM 231867 - S S 21D S
3 | 2010068 10.63 10.63 11.43 12.03
COFFMAN TRUCK 231871 - 30D W
- | 1610172 -
NO BID -
- | 1610176 -
NO BID -
4 | 2010081 14.50 18.83 14.50 21.29 23.84
HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC | 231870 - S 14D S S
2| 2110173 104.28 104.28 134.78
MUNCIE 231873 - 45D 3w
3| 2110174 402.63 402.63 554.11 483.83
ILLINOIS AUTO 231861 - 1w S 21D
5| 2110175 93.99 113.07 93.99 12935 112.86 103.50
ILLINOIS AUTO 231861 - 2W EAN S 45D 12w
- | 6710023 -

NO BID




Sku Winning bid GENFARE TRANSLITE PREVOST FILTER GILLIG MIDWEST GLOBAL NEOPART ILLINOIS INTERNATIONAL SUBURBAN RILCO CBM KIRK'S MOHAWK | HYDRAULIC | COFFMAN MUNCIE THE AFTERMARKET ELDORADO MIDWEST | MYERS TIRE KELLER
NO # of Bids ENT. SERVICES BUS PETROLEUM AUTO FILTER TRUCK PARTS ELECTRIC TRUCK PARTS CO. TRANSIT HEARTT
4 | 620058 21.00 27.13 23.43 21.00 22.05
HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC | 231870 - 45D 30D S 8w
1| 6510007 1,652.07 1,652.07
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - 14w
2 | 6510009 2,650.00 2,650.00 2,927.17
GILLIG 231859 - 4w ow
2 | 6510016 2,250.00 2,250.00 2,615.43
GILLIG 231859 - 4w ow
1| 6510017 1,325.00 1,325.00
GILLIG 231859 - 4W
1| 2210037 2.14 2.14
THE AFTERMARKET
PARTS CO. 231874 - 6W




