

Pace

RFQ# 420832

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
	Sku	Winning bid	Prevost	P&G	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Area Diesel	Interstate Power	Kirks	Neopart	Suburban Truck	Transit Parts 101	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	CBM	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman	Gillig
NO # of Bids																				
6	81519	55.64								55.64				111.84		57.30	84.40	81.55	76.53	
Kirks	231822	-								stock				4w		9w	7w	30d	5d	
1	81055	1,432.29					1,432.29													
Eldorado	231801	-					6w													
3	130672	0.37												0.37			0.57	1.00		
Aftermarket Parts	231813	-												7w			3w	21d		
9	110136	68.89	129.35			68.89	100.00		82.92	75.50		69.58		109.25				88.75	77.58	
Vehicle Maintenance	231808		60d			stock	stock		14d	stock		stock		7w					30d	5d
6	81162	3.40	18.29											15.77	6.00		3.40	14.30		13.99
Availability - Hydraulic Electric	231823	-	stock											stock	stock		6w	21d		stock
6	81298	48.25	63.46											58.40		48.25	53.98	63.90	56.76	
CBM	231824	-	stock											stock		stock	stock	stock	stock	
6	81343	7.75						23.26		7.75				29.47			18.89	27.27	12.25	
Kirks	231822	-						stock		stock				4w			stock	30d	stock	
4	81378	1.50					5.55							33.94			1.50	22.42		
Mohawk	231819	-					1w							stock			stock	30d		
5	81422	1.50						1.99						2.42			1.50	2.40	1.90	
Mohawk	231819	-						stock						7w			stock	30d	stock	
3	110152	220.69												268.46				240.00	220.69	
Coffman	231825													11w				30d	21d	
5	81516	8.28						8.28						11.20			10.84	9.35	9.30	
Area Diesel	231821							stock						7w			24d	stock	stock	
6	81533	11.19				12.34						26.81		26.14			11.19	12.62	42.61	
Mohawk	231819					stock						stock		9w			stock	stock	14d	
5	810007	421.15		448.08			421.15			535.64				445.00				636.45		

Pace

RFQ# 420832

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																			
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Prevost	P&G	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Area Diesel	Interstate Power	Kirks	Neopart	Suburban Truck	Transit Parts 101	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	CBM	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman	Gillig
Eldorado	231801			stock			stock			stock				16w				30d		
4	1010004	182.51						182.51						233.86				215.99	204.32	
Area Diesel	231821	-					stock							4w				30d	stock	
2	810026	968.00												1,214.33					968.00	
Coffman	231825													4w					30d	
3	810027	505.59												678.55				614.50	505.59	
Coffman	231825													9w				30d	30d	
5	810031	1.78						7.92						9.61			1.78	9.40	7.87	
Coffman	231825	-					stock							4w		unapproved part		30d	stock	
3	1210024	187.55						237.55						303.00	187.55					
Aftermarket Parts	231813	-					stock							8w	14w					
3	810049	106.17												131.45				125.25	106.17	
Coffman	231825	-												5w				stock	stock	
3	1310008	57.26						62.58						84.25	57.26					
Aftermarket Parts	231813	-					4w							3w	5w					
6	810060	30.25						35.96						47.75	33.00		30.25	34.30	35.80	
Mohawk	231819	-					stock							7w	14d		30d	quoting 8 only, need 12	stock	
7	810070	845.00						885.62			950.00			1,190.16	845.00		1,155.31	1,050.05	881.64	
Hydraulic Electric	231823	-					stock			stock				7w	14d		4w	30d	stock	
5	810071	641.69						641.69						1,046.17	845.00			766.90	645.29	
Area Diesel	231821	-					stock							9w	14d			30d	stock	
4	810073	97.00												140.21	97.00		133.38		106.96	
Hydraulic Electric	231823	-												7w	21d		3w		30d	
5	810078	360.00												530.10	360.00		606.84	469.55	390.00	
Hydraulic Electric	231823	-												5w	stock		3w	30d	30d	

Pace

RFQ# 420832

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
	Sku	Winning bid	Prevost	P&G	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Area Diesel	Interstate Power	Kirks	Neopart	Suburban Truck	Transit Parts 101	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	CBM	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman	Gillig
NO # of Bids																				
5	1010028	6.20						10.55						13.21			6.20	12.50	10.50	
Coffman	231825	-						stock						stock			unapproved part	30d	stock	
6	810093	19.16				19.16				20.65				38.71	19.50	31.75		35.12		
Vehicle Maintenance	231808	-				stock				stock				7w	14d	9w		30d		
6	1010034	38.21						41.59						49.82	40.00		38.21	49.75	41.84	
Mohawk	231819	-						stock						14w	14d		stock	30d	stock	
3	810132	110.22												141.93				131.82	110.22	
Coffman	231825	-												8w				30d	14d	
4	810134	5.09						5.09						6.84				5.68	5.10	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						6w				stock	stock	
5	810135	14.35						14.35						19.29	30.00			17.35	14.44	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						9w	10d			30d	14d	
4	1010043	65.28						65.28						87.72				78.21	65.68	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						6w				90d	stock	
3	1010044	202.24						202.24						289.44					202.41	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						5w					stock	
1	1210082	1.39					1.39													
Eldorado	231801	-					stock													
5	810184	60.26						60.26						73.78	62.00			72.72	65.16	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						4w	stock			30d	stock	
4	810187	8.08						8.08						10.01				9.27	8.77	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						4w				30d	stock	
6	810208	0.16						1.28						1.54	1.25		0.16	1.55	1.47	
Hydraulic Electric	231823	-						stock						5w	stock		unapproved part	30d	stock	
4	810219	83.13						83.13						111.70				100.21	83.19	

Pace

RFQ# 420832

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

	Sku	Winning bid	Prevost	P&G	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Area Diesel	Interstate Power	Kirks	Neopart	Suburban Truck	Transit Parts 101	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	CBM	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman	Gillig
NO # of Bids																				
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						4w				30d	14d	
5	810225	599.99						599.99						778.90	600.00			748.28	796.02	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						7w	stock			30d	stock	
3	810231	224.86												287.09				254.54	224.86	
Coffman	231825	-												stock				30d	30d	
5	810241	3.11						3.11						4.07			4.87	3.77	3.14	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						stock			4w	30d	stock	
4	810282	562.66						599.61						689.14				609.86	562.66	
Coffman	231825	-						stock						7w				30d	stock	
4	810286	24.60						24.71						30.94				29.87	24.60	
Coffman	231825	-						stock						9w				30d	stock	
4	810287	1.46						1.46						1.96				1.78	1.65	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						4w				30d	stock	
3	1010075	90.01												115.30				107.12	90.01	
Coffman	231825	-												5w				30d	stock	
3	1010076	90.01												115.30				107.87	90.01	
Coffman	231825	-												5e				30d	stock	
1	1210134	886.70						886.70												
Eldorado	231801	-						stock												
4	810333	34.84						34.84						43.97				42.14	35.50	
Area Diesel	231821	-						stock						5w				30d	14d	
3	810334	250.57						251.17										299.91	250.57	
Coffman	231825	-						stock										30d	14d	
4	810335	21.00						34.00							21.00			41.12	33.92	
Hydraulic Electric	231823	-						stock							14d			30d	stock	

Pace

RFQ# 420832

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																			
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

	Sku	Winning bid	Prevost	P&G	Rome Truck - NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado	Area Diesel	Interstate Power	Kirks	Neopart	Suburban Truck	Transit Parts 101	Aftermarket Parts	Hydraulic Electric	CBM	Mohawk	Muncie	Coffman	Gillig
--	-----	-------------	---------	-----	---------------------	---------------------	----------	-------------	------------------	-------	---------	----------------	-------------------	-------------------	--------------------	-----	--------	--------	---------	--------

NO # of Bids

3	810336	124.05												167.46				148.84	124.05	
Coffman	231825	-												13w				30d	14d	
4	1310040	21.95							24.94					30.29				24.23	21.95	
Coffman	231825	-							20d					7w				30d	stock	