
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Transit 
Parts 101

CBM Kirks MW Bus Prevost Interstate 
Power

Neopart Eldorado Area Diesel Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Muncie Coffman 
Truck

Suburban 
Truck

                                    6 130473 0.07                           0.32             1.24             5.78             0.07             0.09             0.10 

Mohawk 231757 -                  stock  10d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 81055 132.29                  132.29 

Eldorado 231755 -                  8w 

                                    2 120145 1.25                           1.92             1.25 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                  8w  MOQ 

                                    1 130682 66.98                      66.98 

Aftermarket Parts 231758  stock 

                                    2 81423 43.15                      43.15           57.97 

Eldorado 231755 -                  stock  stock 

                                    3 100238 221.85                  221.85         454.10         514.06 

Transit Parts 101 231767 -                  5w  4w  5w 

                                    1 1010005 279.18                  279.18 

Eldorado 231755 -                 stock

                                    1 1310009 63.70                      63.70 

Eldorado 231755 -                  stock 

                                    1 1010027 41.29                      41.29 

Eldorado 231755 -                  stock 

                                    1 810166 48.55                      48.55 

Eldorado 231755  stock 

                                    1 1010046 256.96                  256.96 

Eldorado 231755  stock 

                                    1 1010047 427.00                  427.00 

Eldorado 231755  6w 

Pace RFQ# 420797



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Transit 
Parts 101

CBM Kirks MW Bus Prevost Interstate 
Power

Neopart Eldorado Area Diesel Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Muncie Coffman 
Truck

Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 420797

                                    2 1110004 72.42                      79.95           72.42 

Muncie 231759  3w  30D 

                                    1 1210130 599.95                  599.95 

Eldorado 231755 -                  stock 

                                    3 1010081 241.34                  359.75         241.34         273.22 

Eldorado 231755  5w  4w  5w 

                                    1 1210136 75.88                      75.88 

Eldorado 231755  4w 

                                    1 810325 12.46                      12.46 

Eldorado 231755 -                  4w 

                                    1 810326 20.58                      20.58 

Eldorado 231755 -                  4w 

                                    4 81138 4.84                           4.84             7.65             6.73             5.66 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  30d  stock 

                                    3 110129 1.52                           2.00             4.81             1.52 

Muncie 231759 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 130612 58.12                      61.55           83.82           58.12           97.34           82.12           73.77 

MW Bus 231746 -                  5d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  4w  stock  stock 

                                    8 110136 68.89                      68.89           73.95         129.35           82.92         113.44         109.91           79.60 69.58         

Vehicle Maintenance 231751 -                  stock  stock  60d  14d  stock  7w  30d  stock 

                                    6 81066 41.99                      42.20           72.66           85.00           41.99           96.82 77.94         

Muncie 231759 -                  stock  5w  2w  stock  stock stock

                                    6 130618 234.06                  265.97         236.44         302.00         255.33         255.35         234.06 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock  4w  6w  stock  stock  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Transit 
Parts 101

CBM Kirks MW Bus Prevost Interstate 
Power

Neopart Eldorado Area Diesel Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Muncie Coffman 
Truck

Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 420797

                                    6 81298 48.25                      48.25           63.46           59.95           58.75           63.65           56.76 

CBM 231768 -                  stock  stock  stock  7w  stock  stock 

                                    4 100223 60.14                      64.98           60.14         110.47           93.85 

Neopart 231753 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  6w  90d 

                                    6 81444 57.00                    101.43           72.00           57.00           76.50           71.00           75.57 

Mohawk 231757 -                  stock  4w  stock  stock  stock  60d 

                                    5 81503 12.33                      19.71           12.33           26.04           22.95           19.29 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  20d  stock 

                                    5 81516 8.28                           8.28           10.99           11.27             9.35             8.98 

Area Diesel 231770 -                  stock  4w  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 81532 1,009.28            1,345.15      1,009.28      1,093.90      1,046.22      1,070.00 

Eldorado 231755 -                  105d  6w  8w  2w  60d 

                                    6 81533 11.19                      12.34           11.19           26.31           12.62           41.71 25.87         

Mohawk 231757 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  10d stock

                                    6 810017 56.14                      67.27           75.74           67.99           67.41           68.79           56.14 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  60d  stock  3w  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 1010002 3.74                           6.55             7.51             3.74           11.43 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                  stock  8w  stock  60d 

                                    2 1210016 759.00               1,090.75         759.00 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                  stock  10w 

                                    3 810027 505.59                  680.42         614.50         505.59 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  9w  30d  7d 

                                    5 810030 1.45                           2.42             1.45             2.86             2.79             2.33 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  30d  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Transit 
Parts 101

CBM Kirks MW Bus Prevost Interstate 
Power

Neopart Eldorado Area Diesel Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Muncie Coffman 
Truck

Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 420797

                                    5 810031 1.81                           8.15             1.81             9.54             9.40             7.87 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  4w  30d  stock 

                                    6 1010015 922.00                  922.00      1,236.60      1,075.00      1,593.79      1,245.45         978.00 

Kirks 231769 -                  stock  stock  stock  13w  14d  stock 

                                    3 1010016 2,218.12            3,428.67      2,693.85      2,218.12 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  7w  30d  14d 

                                    3 810050 107.56                  123.81         107.56         113.14 

Eldorado 231755 -                  3w  stock  7w 

                                    3 810073 106.96                  132.38         141.05         106.96 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  2w  7w  stock 

                                    3 810079 386.62                  608.94         469.50         386.62 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  7w  30d  stock 

                                    5 1010030 92.59                      92.59         114.04         120.04           96.28           92.67 

Area Diesel 231770 -                  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  35d  stock 

                                    1 1210051 572.16                  572.16 

Eldorado 231755 -                  stock 

                                    3 810101 209.50                  268.68         253.37         209.50 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  2w  7w  30d 

                                    4 810110 335.37                  495.31         529.50         370.45         335.37 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  2w  stock  30d  stock 

                                    5 810122 10.89                      27.61           10.89           36.09           29.65           27.21 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 1110002 41.51                      41.51 

Eldorado 231755 -                  4w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Transit 
Parts 101

CBM Kirks MW Bus Prevost Interstate 
Power

Neopart Eldorado Area Diesel Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Muncie Coffman 
Truck

Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 420797

                                    3 810130 378.78                  578.23         453.99         378.78 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  5w  30d  stock 

                                    1 810169 25.49                      25.49 

Eldorado 231755 -                  stock 

                                    5 810179 45.15                      46.12           59.17           60.95           53.69           45.15 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock  3w  stock  30d  stock 

                                    4 810203 2,514.49            2,683.05      3,871.43      2,997.75      2,514.49 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock  5w  30d  30d 

                                    1 810215 21.50                      21.50 

Eldorado 231755 -                  stock 

                                    4 810220 403.00                  403.97         579.15         479.85         403.00 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                    1 810226 25.90                      25.90 

Eldorado 231755 -                  6w 

                                    5 810230 3.08                           3.08             4.06             3.99             3.59             3.22 

Area Diesel 231770 -                  stock  2w  5w  30d  stock 

                                    3 1010060 2,152.22            3,318.70      2,599.55      2,152.22 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  7w  30d  21d 

                                    6 1010061 890.00                  924.00         993.60         960.00      1,975.27         890.00         954.76 

Muncie 231759 -                  stock  stock  stock  9w  stock  stock 

                                    4 810327 2.31                           2.35             3.05             2.75             2.31 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock  7w  30d  7d 

                                    1 810329 37.85                      37.85 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Transit 
Parts 101

CBM Kirks MW Bus Prevost Interstate 
Power

Neopart Eldorado Area Diesel Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Muncie Coffman 
Truck

Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 420797

                                    3 810330 56.40                      56.40           75.54         135.99 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                 
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                    1 810331 960.00                  960.00 

ITEM CANCELLED -                  8w 

                                    3 810332 81.55                      84.24         112.52           81.55 

Muncie 231759 -                  16w  stock  stock 

                                    2 1110005 88.75                    113.44           88.75 

Muncie 231759 -                  stock  30d 

                                    1 1210137 61.88                      61.88 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                  stock 


	420797

