
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Vehicle 
Maintenance

P&G Keene CBM - NO 
BID

Rome 
Truck

Kirks MW Bus Neopart Interstate 
Power

Prevost Area Diesel Northern 
Battery

Eldorado Battery 
Service 
Corp.

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric - 
NO BID

Muncie Coffman Suburban 
Truck

                                  4 71089 0.04                         0.39            0.04            0.05            0.04 

Mohawk 231757 -                 10d  stock  stock  34d 

                                  3 70289 3.97                         3.97            8.84            8.26 

Mohawk 231757 -                 3w  stock  MOQ 

                                  6 71875 4.80                         8.75            7.52          16.15            5.10            4.98            4.80 

Muncie 231759 -                 stock  75d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 72121 31.51                    31.51          91.75          66.02 62.19                  61.98 

Prevost 231754  60d  stock  5w 4w  28d 

                                  5 71105 0.07                         1.16            0.08            0.07            0.11            0.14 

Mohawk 231757 -                 10d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 71441 6.23                       26.95            7.48            7.26 7.08                      6.23 

Muncie 231759 -                 8w  stock  5w  stock  30d 

                                  6 72143 10.50                    10.62          13.28          21.55          10.50 11.25                  10.93 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                 7w 60d  6w  stock 6w  42d 

                                  3 71357 10.92                    15.07          10.95          10.92 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  1 72126 37.75                    37.75 

Eldorado 231755 -                 6w 

                                  4 71100 0.07                         0.90            0.07            0.12            0.10 

Mohawk 231757  10d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 72094 15.05                    15.05          26.95          30.14          20.19          21.15 

Prevost 231754  stock  stock  3w  stock  30d 

                                  5 71442 6.34                       26.95            6.85            6.98 7.08                      6.34 

Muncie 231759  stock  stock  stock stock  30d 

                                  4 72109 620.84             1,190.39        620.84     1,357.91 1,120.00   

Eldorado 231755  12w  stock  10w 4w

                                  4 72192 17.40                    18.65          26.95          17.53          17.40 

Muncie 231759 -                 stock  stock  6w  30d 

                                  4 72184 5.39                         7.77          11.83            5.39            5.46 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 16w  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 72194 71.31                    71.31          82.68        129.55          71.50          73.05 

Pace RFQ# 420796



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Vehicle 
Maintenance

P&G Keene CBM - NO 
BID

Rome 
Truck

Kirks MW Bus Neopart Interstate 
Power

Prevost Area Diesel Northern 
Battery

Eldorado Battery 
Service 
Corp.

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric - 
NO BID

Muncie Coffman Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 420796

Neopart 231753  stock  60d  stock  stock  42d 

                                  3 72208 87.30                    87.30        131.31 115.59      

Mohawk 231757 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 72266 30.35                    30.68          30.35          31.99 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                 7w  stock  42d 

                                  4 72301 221.00                303.87        249.99        311.11        221.00 

Suburban Truck 231764 -                 9d  6w  5w  stock 

                                  4 72301 221.00                303.87        249.99        311.11        221.00 

Suburban Truck 231764 -                 9d  6w  5w  stock 

                                  3 710019 89.40                  118.75          89.40        114.25 

Mohawk 231757 -                 stock  stock  5w 

                                  6 710025 34.50                    34.65          87.85        124.15          34.50 70.89                  35.41 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                 stock  60d  stock  7w  stock  60d 

                                  7 710043 261.16                261.16        321.00        271.00        341.93        304.64 295.00             294.22 

P&G Keene 231752 -                 stock  stock  2w  60d  15w 4w  30d 

                                  2 710052 2,236.02          2,236.02     2,420.04 

P&G Keene 231752 -                 stock  4w 

                                  1 710056 81.43                    81.43 

Eldorado 231755 -                 4w 

                                  4 710057 45.70                    46.47          60.27          54.62          45.70 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                 stock  13w  30d  stock 

                                  1 710061 93.59                    93.59 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                 stock 

                                  1 710105 761.43                761.43 

Eldorado 231755 -                 stock 

                                  3 710115 27.25                    27.25          48.84          43.46 

Vehicle Maintenance 231751 -                 stock  stock  12w 

                                  3 710116 27.25                    27.25          48.84          28.19 

Vehicle Maintenance 231751 -                 stock  stock  5w 

                                  1 710130 82.44                    82.44 

Eldorado 231755 -                 stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Vehicle 
Maintenance

P&G Keene CBM - NO 
BID

Rome 
Truck

Kirks MW Bus Neopart Interstate 
Power

Prevost Area Diesel Northern 
Battery

Eldorado Battery 
Service 
Corp.

Mohawk Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric - 
NO BID

Muncie Coffman Suburban 
Truck

Pace RFQ# 420796

                                  6 710149 322.32                389.00        366.27        388.21 372.31             354.99        322.32 

Coffman Truck 231762 -                 7d  stock  stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                  1 710156 31.73                    31.73 

Eldorado 231755 -                 stock 

                                  2 710161 32.35                    32.35          51.54 

Eldorado 231755 -                 stock  9w 

                                  6 710170 2,729.66          2,729.66     3,099.00     3,816.82     5,136.73     3,302.00     3,280.12 

P&G Keene 231752 -                 stock  stock  60d  6w  10w  30d 

                                  1 710190 99.05                    99.05 

Eldorado 231755 -                 stock 

                                  - 710198 -                

-                

                                  1 710206 146.02                146.02 

Eldorado 231755 -                 stock 

                                  1 710248 977.53                977.53 

Eldorado 231755 -                 6w 

                                  1 710288 34.65                    34.65 

Aftermarket Parts 231758 -                 10w 

                                  1 710299 576.00                576.00 

Eldorado 231755 -                 6w 

                                  1 710304 4.78                         4.78 

Eldorado 231755 -                 4w 

                                  4 710361 35.46                    35.46          37.70 37.99                  35.92 

Neopart 231753 -                 7w  stock 2w  60d 


	420796

