

Pace		RFQ# 420770																	
WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Rome Truck - NO BID	Area Diesel	CBM	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck Parts	Prevost	Kirks	Gillig	MW Bus	Neopart	Coffman Truck	Vehicle Maintenance	Hydraulic Electric	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	
NO # of Bids																			
3	130684	5.80					5.88							5.80			6.82		
Coffman Truck	231722	-					20d							stock			8w		
6	140059	345.00						399.96	448.49		345.00		345.62				366.68	400.75	
Gillig	231715	-						stock	60d		stock		stock				stock	stock	
3	130756	592.41					592.41					625.00					765.40		
Interstate Power	231730	-					stock					5d					stock		
3	130473	0.09					1.24										0.09	0.10	
Aftermarket Parts	231720						10d										stock	stock	
6	130611	156.11					263.08					156.11		231.52		170.00	282.50	255.40	
MW Bus	231716	-					stock					5d		stock		14d	7w	stock	
2	120145	1.25															2.10	1.25	
Aftermarket Parts	231720	-															8w	min ord qty 25, need 10	
6	110136	68.89					82.92	69.58	129.35	75.45					68.89		110.57		
Vehicle Maintenance	231721	-					14d	stock	60d	stock					stock		7w		
1	130682	66.98															66.98		
Aftermarket Parts	231720	-															stock		
2	100129	4.90															5.55	4.90	
Muncie	231725	-															stock	30d	
1	120498	425.00	425.00																
Triangle Radiator	231729		3d																
5	100223	54.92			54.92								69.07	93.85		64.00	110.78		
Area Diesel	231728				stock								stock	90d		stock	6w		
4	100230	60.69			60.69									89.14			114.13	78.97	

Pace

RFQ# 420770

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

Sku

Winning bid

Triangle Radiator

Rome Truck - NO BID

Area Diesel

CBM

Interstate Power

Suburban Truck Parts

Prevost

Kirks

Gillig

MW Bus

Neopart

Coffman Truck

Vehicle Maintenance

Hydraulic Electric

Aftermarket Parts

Muncie

NO # of Bids

Area Diesel	231728			stock										stock			stock	stock
-	100238	-																
2	130794	41.14							41.14									46.00
Kirks	231727	-							stock									21d
8	1210003	19.09				19.90	19.90		19.88			26.37	21.87	19.09			39.60	21.47
Vehicle Maintenance	231721						20d	unapproved part	unapproved part				stock	7d	stock		7w	30d
4	1210009	34.64		866.11										34.64			45.57	42.15
Coffman Truck	231722			no lead time given										stock			7w	21d
-	1010005	-																
7	1010011	827.00			1,120.72				1,611.22	827.00			1,144.00	953.40			2,005.94	1,126.96
Kirks	231727	-		stock				60d	stock				10d	stock			4w	21d
6	1010012	1,204.00			1,809.36				1,204.00				1,459.05		1,260.00	2,837.97	2,164.56	
Kirks	231727	-		stock					stock				10d		14d	5w	21d	
1	1210016	632.18								632.18								
Gillig	231715	-								stock								
4	1010013	12.40			28.91								13.33	12.40			32.75	
Coffman Truck	231722	-		stock									stock	stock			stock	
4	1010014	3.50			7.89				3.50					7.60			9.18	
Kirks	231727	-		stock					stock					stock			stock	
6	1010015	919.00			1,162.00				919.00				1,236.60	978.00			1,603.45	1,009.10

