Pace

RFQ# 420769

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid |Rome Truck CBM Kirks Suburban P&G Prevost Gillig MW Bus - | Area Diesel | Vehicle Neopart | Hydraulic | Coffman | Aftermarket | Muncie
-NOBID Truck NO BID Maintenance Electric Truck Parts
NO # of Bids
- 81055 -
5 81083 8.15 8.67 8.15 8.44 10.93 9.99
Hydraulic Electric 231724 - stock 14d stock stock 30d
4 81089 4.00 4.16 4.00 5.56 4.79
no lead
Coffman Truck 231722 - time given stock stock 21d
4 81085 4.03 4.15 4.03 5.22 4.79
no lead
Coffman Truck 231722 time given stock stock 21d
6 81298 48.25 48.25 63.46 74.45 56.76 59.46 63.65
CBM 231726 - stock stock stock stock stock stock
2 81378 22.42 34.04 22.42
Muncie 231725 - stock stock
- 81423 -
5 81441 42.35 78.80 42.78 42.35 42.82 51.24
no lead
Hydraulic Electric 231724 - 60d time given 14d stock stock
5 81444 71.00 101.43 71.00 72.08 76.50 75.57
Gillig 231715 - stock stock 4w stock 60d
4 81516 8.28 8.28 8.98 11.33 9.49
Area Diesel 231728 stock stock stock stock
7 81519 55.64 58.72 55.64 99.09 89.73 77.00 113.21 77.95
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Sku Winning bid |Rome Truck CBM Kirks Suburban P&G Prevost Gillig MW Bus - | Area Diesel | Vehicle Neopart | Hydraulic | Coffman | Aftermarket | Muncie
-NOBID Truck NO BID Maintenance Electric Truck Parts
NO # of Bids
Kirks 231727 5w stock stock stock 7d 4w 30d
4 81528 2.11 2.11 2.13 2.90 2.54
Area Diesel 231728 stock stock stock 21d
6 81533 12.34 26.80 43.09 12.34 41.71 26.44 12.65
no lead
Vehicle Maintenance 231721 stock time given stock 5d stock stock
2 81534 32.89 37.50 32.89
Muncie 231725 - 2w 21d
3 810007 448.08 535.54 448.08 636.45
P&G 231713 stock stock 30d
4 810026 859.71 859.71 968.00 1,221.65 1,026.44
no lead
Coffman Truck 231722 time given 30d 4w 14d
4 810027 485.95 485.95 505.59 680.42 539.81
availability - no lead
Aftermarket Parts 231720 - time given 30d stock 14d
4 810030 2.34 2.37 2.34 2.88 2.79
Coffman Truck 231722 - stock stock stock 30d
4 810031 7.88 7.97 7.88 9.56 9.40
Coffman Truck 231722 - stock stock 4w 30d
6 810046 357.93 380.91 362.43 375.00 383.24 552.82 357.93
Muncie 231725 - stock stock 14d stock stock stock
5 810060 34.50 36.99 34.50 35.80 48.04 37.35
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Sku Winning bid |Rome Truck CBM Kirks Suburban P&G Prevost Gillig MW Bus - | Area Diesel | Vehicle Neopart | Hydraulic | Coffman | Aftermarket | Muncie
-NO BID Truck NO BID Maintenance Electric Truck Parts
NO # of Bids
Hydraulic Electric 231724 - stock 14d stock stock stock
4 810064 2,821.49 2,821.49 3,801.06 5,098.83 4,550.15
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 7w 30d
4 810071 629.98 629.98 645.29 1,052.54 766.90
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 9w 30d
4 810073 99.00 106.86 99.00 105.82 141.89
Hydraulic Electric 231724 - stock 14d stock 7w
5 810078 360.00 396.86 360.00 386.00 533.33 469.55
Hydraulic Electric 231724 - stock 21d stock 5w 30d
5 810079 380.00 396.86 380.00 386.00 612.53 469.50
no lead
Hydraulic Electric 231724 - time given stock stock 7w 30d
5 810084 624.49 624.49 645.00 736.96 1,337.66 1,051.65
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock stock 6w 45d
4 810086 75.36 75.36 79.50 98.50 86.75
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock stock 30d
7 810093 19.61 32.12 20.65 35.91 19.61 19.79 38.94 35.12
Vehicle Maintenance 231721 - stock stock stock stock 7d 7w 30d
5 810098 233.00 240.42 233.00 241.65 323.10 285.00
Hydraulic Electric 231724 - stock stock stock stock stock
3 810101 209.80 209.80 211.42 254.06
no lead
Coffman Truck 231722 - time given 30d stock
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Sku Winning bid |Rome Truck CBM Kirks Suburban P&G Prevost Gillig MW Bus - | Area Diesel | Vehicle Neopart | Hydraulic | Coffman | Aftermarket | Muncie
-NO BID Truck NO BID Maintenance Electric Truck Parts
NO # of Bids
810102 2.95 3.22 2.95 3.69 3.50
Coffman Truck 231722 - stock stock 5w 21d
810123 53.81 53.81 54.08 68.08
no lead
Coffman Truck 231722 - time given stock Sw
810127 50.82 50.82 51.01 65.49 60.60
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 5w 21d
810143 9.78 10.77 9.78 11.28 10.60
Coffman Truck 231722 - stock stock 3w 21d
810154 8.07 8.07 8.21 10.78 9.60
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 8w 21d
810166 -
810173 20.25 21.32 20.25 22.15 25.10 25.00
Hydraulic Electric 231724 - stock stock stock stock 21d
810180 6.04 6.04 6.05 7.63 7.20
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 6w 21d
810204 241.20 241.20 720.00 335.37 375.00
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 30d 21d
810209 17.75 17.75 19.00 23.00 21.00
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 5w 21d
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Sku Winning bid |Rome Truck CBM Kirks Suburban P&G Prevost Gillig MW Bus - | Area Diesel | Vehicle Neopart | Hydraulic | Coffman | Aftermarket | Muncie
-NO BID Truck NO BID Maintenance Electric Truck Parts
NO # of Bids
810213 50.56 63.05 52.00 50.56 66.33 64.04
Coffman Truck 231722 - stock 14d stock stock 21d
810220 403.97 403.97 404.30 580.74 480.00
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 5w 21d
810227 1,124.54 1,129.62 1,12454| 1,430.82| 1,300.00
no lead
Coffman Truck 231722 - time given 30d 5w stock
810230 3.03 3.03 3.42 4.02 3.61
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 5w 21d
810231 224.86 224.87 224.86 288.85 285.00
Coffman Truck 231722 - stock 30d stock 21d
810232 352.50 396.85 352.50 397.19 650.81 470.70
Neopart 231723 - stock stock stock 4w 21d
810245 210.00 241.49 210.00 220.55 275.85 249.49
Hydraulic Electric 231724 - stock 14d stock 7w 21d
810269 999.00 999.00 1,435.69 1,545.48 3,241.72 1,717.17
Availability - Area
Diesel 231728 - 1 stock stock stock 7w 21d
810277 28.83 36.93 28.83
Muncie 231725 - stock stock
810304 31.76 31.76 31.95 38.08
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock stock
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810305 156.72 156.72 157.52 210.61 186.00
no lead
Coffman Truck 231722 - time given stock stock 90d
810323 60.46 60.46 66.38 72.00
Area Diesel 231728 - stock stock 21d
810325 -
810326 -
810328 19.41 19.41 21.07 23.23
no lead
Coffman Truck 231722 - time given stock 21d
810327 2.31 2.35 2.31 3.07 2.80
Coffman Truck 231722 - stock stock 7w 21d
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