
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Eldorado CBM - NO 

BID
Interstate 

Power
IO Controls Suburban 

Truck
P&G Prevost Gillig Kirks MW Bus Aftermarket 

Parts
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Coffman Neopart Hydraulic 

Electric
Muncie Battery 

Service

                                    2 70781 187.57                  201.00         187.57 

Muncie 231725 -                  30d  30d 

                                    3 71733 82.65                      95.15           83.97           82.65 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  60d  4w  6w 

                                    2 71294 0.13                           0.67             0.13 

Muncie 231725 -                  stock  stock 

                                    1 72125 70.15                      70.15 

Eldorado 231711  stock 

                                    2 71287 0.20                           0.90             0.20 

Muncie 231725 -                  8w  stock 

                                    2 72102 76.40                    124.15           76.40 

Muncie 231725 -                  stock  30d 

                                    5 72121 31.51                      91.75           31.51           62.19           66.21           62.40 

Prevost 231714 -                  stock  60d  6w  5w  30d 

                                    4 70220 11.55                      32.35           15.25           17.41           11.55 

Muncie 231725 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 72059 398.80                  629.95         626.25         432.60         561.28         398.80 

Muncie 231725 -                  stock  60d  2w  5w  35d 

                                    6 72143 10.50                      21.55           13.28           11.25           10.50           10.62           10.93 

Aftermarket Parts 231720  stock  60d  stock  stock  7w  60d 

                                    2 71540 58.59                      58.59           61.67 

Eldorado 231711  4w 
 20 ONLY, 
need 30 

                                    2 70958 3.50                           3.50             4.45 

Eldorado 231711  2w stock

Pace RFQ# 420768



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Eldorado CBM - NO 

BID
Interstate 

Power
IO Controls Suburban 

Truck
P&G Prevost Gillig Kirks MW Bus Aftermarket 

Parts
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Coffman Neopart Hydraulic 

Electric
Muncie Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 420768

                                    4 70659 4.15                         12.09             4.15             8.58           13.19 

Aftermarket Parts 231720  60d  stock  stock  21d 

                                    2 71357 10.92                      15.07           10.92 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  1w  stock 

                                    1 71539 32.35                      32.35 

Eldorado 231711  stock 

                                    3 71179 0.38                           2.82             0.45             0.38 

Muncie 231725  10d  stock  stock 

                                    4 71442 5.50                         26.95             7.08             6.98             5.50 
Availability - 
Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  stock  stock  stock 

 2 ONLY, 
need 4 

                                    1 70730 0.64                           0.64 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  stock 

                                    2 70725 0.12                           0.29             0.12 

Muncie 231725 -                  stock  stock 

                                    4 72109 620.84                  620.84      1,121.75      1,121.76      1,365.90 

Eldorado 231711 -                  2w  12w  4w  10w 

                                    4 72156 21.46                      26.45           21.46           21.59           22.22 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  60d  stock  7w  60d 

                                    4 72162 32.32                      32.35           56.25           52.70           32.32 

Muncie 231725 -                  stock  60d  6w  stock 

                                    3 72167 37.36                      37.36           39.07           39.71 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  stock  stock  60d 

                                    3 72170 18.85                      18.85           39.46           33.23 

Eldorado 231711 -                  stock  8w  70d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Eldorado CBM - NO 

BID
Interstate 

Power
IO Controls Suburban 

Truck
P&G Prevost Gillig Kirks MW Bus Aftermarket 

Parts
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Coffman Neopart Hydraulic 

Electric
Muncie Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 420768

                                    4 72181 345.55                  345.55         588.87         730.00         716.19 

Eldorado 231711 -                  2w  12w  4w  14w 

                                    1 72190 26.95                      26.95 

Eldorado 231711 -                  6w 

                                    1 72191 48.55                      48.55 

Eldorado 231711 -                  6w 

                                    4 72184 5.39                         11.83             5.39             6.19             5.46 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    2 72208 115.59                  115.59         132.11 

Gillig 231715 -                  stock  stock 

                                    4 72216 151.00                  291.55         210.00         151.50         151.00 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 72222 18.85                      18.85 

Eldorado 231711 -                  stock 

                                    1 72239 26.95                      26.95 

Eldorado 231711 -                  6w 

                                    1 72248 2.65                           2.65 

Eldorado 231711 -                  stock 

                                    3 72255 12.78                      16.55           16.66           12.78 

Muncie 231725 -                  stock  stock  30d 

                                    3 72301 221.00                  221.00         312.96 254.00       

Suburban Truck 231712 -                  3w  5w 6w

                                    3 72301 221.00                  221.00         312.96 254.00       

Suburban Truck 231712 -                  3w  5w  6w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Eldorado CBM - NO 

BID
Interstate 

Power
IO Controls Suburban 

Truck
P&G Prevost Gillig Kirks MW Bus Aftermarket 

Parts
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Coffman Neopart Hydraulic 

Electric
Muncie Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 420768

                                    1 72334 16.15                      16.15 

Eldorado 231711 -                  6w 

                                    1 72386 8.59                           8.59 

Eldorado 231711 -                  stock 

                                    1 710021 43.15                      43.15 

Eldorado 231711 -                  stock 

                                    1 710022 10.21                      10.21 

Eldorado 231711 -                  stock 

                                    6 710046 32.32                      37.75           32.73           35.58           32.80           37.57           32.32 

Muncie 231725 -                  stock  stock  60d  9w  stock  30d 

                                    3 710049 73.73                    134.95           74.58           73.73 

Muncie 231725 -                  4w  stock  60d 

                                    3 710052 2,236.02            3,246.40      2,236.02      2,712.00 

P&G 231713 -                  3w  stock  3w 

                                    4 710057 45.00                      60.63           45.70           45.00           54.04 

Hydraulic Electric 231724 -                  stock  stock  14d  stock 

                                    3 710062 6.95                           6.95           11.40           11.35 

Gillig 231715 -                  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 710134 370.16                  386.91         432.32         370.16         454.25         499.47 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  stock  stock  stock  7d  21d 

                                    1 710157 33.20                      33.20 

Eldorado 231711 -                  stock 

                                     - 710190 -                 

-                 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Eldorado CBM - NO 

BID
Interstate 

Power
IO Controls Suburban 

Truck
P&G Prevost Gillig Kirks MW Bus Aftermarket 

Parts
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Coffman Neopart Hydraulic 

Electric
Muncie Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 420768

                                    3 710214 192.00                  192.00         342.33         291.84 

Eldorado 231711 -                  6w  12w  stock 

                                    2 710241 39.54                      44.50           39.54 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  4w  13w 

                                    3 710244 70.78                      82.19           70.78           71.53 

MW Bus 231716 -                  4w  14d  12w 

                                    1 710248 958.37                  958.37 

Eldorado 231711 -                  8w 

                                    1 710278 1,217.78            1,217.78 

Eldorado 231711 -                  8w 

                                    1 710297 177.56                  177.56 

Eldorado 231711 -                  4w 

                                     - 710299 -                 

-                 

                                    2 710313 27.19                      31.70           27.19 

Vehicle Maintenance 231721 -                  7w  stock 

                                    1 710335 63.65                      63.65 

Eldorado 231711 -                  6w 

                                    3 710358 7.32                           8.99             7.32             8.12 

Coffman 231722 -                  4w  stock  21d 

                                    1 710359 65.03                      65.03 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  6w 

                                    1 710360 53.60                      53.60 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  6w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Eldorado CBM - NO 

BID
Interstate 

Power
IO Controls Suburban 

Truck
P&G Prevost Gillig Kirks MW Bus Aftermarket 

Parts
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Coffman Neopart Hydraulic 

Electric
Muncie Battery 

Service

Pace RFQ# 420768

                                    4 710361 35.46                      37.99           38.12           35.46           35.92 

Neopart 231723 -                  3w  stock  7w  60d 

                                    1 710363 13.51                      13.51 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  stock 

                                    1 710364 5.81                           5.81 

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  11w 

                                    1 710362 26.57                      26.57     

Aftermarket Parts 231720 -                  stock 


	420768

