Pace RFQ# 420737
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . ! ' [ | | . | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Interstate Diesel Vehicle MW Bus - | Area Diesel Gillig Prevost CBM Kirks Neopart Rome |Aftermarket| Coffman | Hydraulic Muncie Eldorado
Power Emission |Maintenance | NO BID Truck - NO Parts Electric

NO # of Bids BID

4 130684 5.80 5.88 6.90 5.80 6.40
Coffman 231671 - 20d 8w stock 30d

4 120363 2.74 2.81 3.66 2.74 3.27
Coffman 231671 - stock 3w stock 21d

2 110100 2.23 2.25 2.23
Aftermarket Parts 231662 - stock stock

7 110136 75.50 81.29 129.35 75.50 251.80 111.24 79.60 99.00
Kirks 231672 MOoQ 60d stock 3w 7w 30d stock

5 130618 234.06 265.97 234.25 304.33 234.06 255.35
Coffman 231671 - stock stock stock stock stock

5 130618 234.06 265.97 234.25 304.33 234.06 255.35
Coffman 231671 - stock stock stock stock stock

1 140076 604.75 604.75
Eldorado 231666 - 4w

4 120540 47.94 47.94 58.71 48.50 57.45
Area Diesel 231670 - stock 5w stock 30d

4 120541 45.77 45.77 55.58 46.29 54.15
Area Diesel 231670 - stock 5w stock 30d

5 120548 1.64 1.64 2.28 3.14 2.24 2.65
Vehicle Mainenance 231660 stock stock stock stock 21d

1 1010005 279.18 279.18
Eldorado 231666 4w

8 | 1010011 828.90 1,542.00 1,126.60 1,611.22 924.00 | 1,144.00 1,257.18 828.90 1,126.99




Pace RFQ# 420737
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Interstate Diesel Vehicle MW Bus - | Area Diesel Gillig Prevost CBM Kirks Neopart Rome |Aftermarket| Coffman | Hydraulic Muncie Eldorado
Power Emission |Maintenance| NQ BID Truck - NO Parts Electric
NO # of Bids BID
Coffman 231671 stock stock stock stock stock 4w stock 21d
8 1010013 10.25 10.25 28.91 45.41 13.50 13.33 32.75 12.40 33.70
unapproved
Coffman 231671 part stock 60d stock stock stock stock 30d
7 1010015 923.00 1,583.00 1,208.75 923.00| 1,236.60 1,613.22 972.74 950.00
unapproved
Kirks 231672 - part stock stock stock 13w stock 45d
4 1010016 2,174.34 2,174.34 2,901.61| 2,218.12 2,679.00
Area Diesel 231670 stock 7w stock 30d
1 1310009 63.70 63.70
Eldorado 231666 Aw
7 1210033 23.77 26.44 23.77 42.07 27.00 28.98 24.44 27.99
Vehicle Mainenance 231660 - 14d stock 60d 2w stock 5d 30d
6 1010028 9.50 9.50 10.98 19.13 13.24 10.50 12.50
unapproved
Coffman 231671 - part stock 60d stock stock 30d
5 1010029 24.44 24.44 37.89 48.95 36.26 25.25
unapproved
Hydraulic Electric 231665 - part stock stock stock 14d
8 1010032 69.40 95.50 112.46 205.79 69.40 144.40 107.04 70.00 104.13
Neopart 231668 - stock stock 60d stock stock stock 14d stock
4 1010035 89.46 89.46 96.76 119.50 89.54
Area Diesel 231670 - stock 60d 7w stock
1 1210055 1.87 1.87
Eldorado 231666 - stock
1 1110002 41.51 41.51




Pace RFQ# 420737
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Interstate Diesel Vehicle MW Bus - | Area Diesel Gillig Prevost CBM Kirks Neopart Rome |Aftermarket| Coffman | Hydraulic Muncie Eldorado
Power Emission |Maintenance| NQ BID Truck - NO Parts Electric

NO # of Bids BID
Eldorado 231666 - Aw

1210070 44.75 60.95 50.75 54.15 56.33 45.66 44.75

unconfirmed

Hydraulic Electric 231665 - stock 60d lead time stock stock 21d

1210109 503.50 534.25 503.50
Coffman 231671 - stock stock

1210130 599.95 599.95
Eldorado 231666 - Aw

1010075 89.46 89.46 116.12 89.54
Area Diesel 231670 - stock 5w 5d

1010076 89.46 89.46 116.12 89.54
Area Diesel 231670 - stock 5w stock

1210135 406.67 433.72 406.67 450.00

unapproved

Area Diesel 231670 - stock part stock
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