Pace RFQ# 420736
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . . ! ' [ | | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Diesel Kirks Vehicle MW Bus - Gillig Neopart Prevost CBM Aftermarket | Area Diesel| Coffman Transit Hydraulic Muncie Eldorado Rome
Emissions Maintenance|  NO BID Parts Parts 101 | Electric Truck - NO
NO # of Bids BID
1 81297 43.15 43.15
Eldorado 231666 - 3w
5 81061 44.72 44.72 104.71 89.70 86.30 103.13
unapproved
Coffman 231671 - part stock stock stock 21d
5 81162 6.00 13.99 18.29 15.87 6.00 14.39
Hydraulic Electric 231665 - stock stock stock stock stock
4 81377 2.81 3.48 2.81 2.81 3.40
Area Diesel 231670 5w stock stock 21d
4 81397 529.26 730.64 529.26 542.80 647.72
Area Diesel 231670 - 5w stock stock 21d
5 81409 34.00 43.54 34.99 35.99 34.00 34.30
Hydraulic Electric 231665 - stock stock stock 14d 30d
5 81441 40.00 51.38 42.78 42.59 40.00 43.40
Hydraulic Electric 231665 - stock stock stock stock stock
5 81444 71.00 71.00 72.08 101.43 76.50 75.56
Gillig 231659 - stock 4w stock stock 30d
3 81465 92.00 132.70 92.00 103.11
Hydraulic Electric 231665 - stock 14d 30d
4 810026 968.57 1,229.05 968.57 989.68 1,103.27
Area Diesel 231670 4w 7d 14d 120d
4 810027 505.59 682.52 534.50 505.59 615.00
Coffman 231671 9w 7d stock 30d
5 810030 2.35 4.40 2.89 2.35 2.36 2.82




Pace RFQ# 420736
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . . ! ' [ | | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Diesel Kirks Vehicle MW Bus - Gillig Neopart Prevost CBM Aftermarket | Area Diesel| Coffman Transit Hydraulic Muncie Eldorado Rome
Emissions Maintenance|  NO BID Parts Parts 101 | Electric Truck - NO

NO # of Bids BID
Area Diesel 231670 60d stock stock stock 21d

810031 7.88 14.44 9.59 7.92 7.88 9.00
Coffman 231671 60d stock stock stock 21d

810045 276.34 276.34 360.00 710.62 538.50 526.40 632.21

unapproved

Neopart 231668 - part stock stock 7d stock 30d

810050 113.14 113.14 123.78 124.61
Aftermarket Parts 231662 7w 3w 6w

810051 125.90 125.90 130.00
Transit Parts 101 231663 3w 6w

810064 2,539.63 5,14593| 2,539.63| 3,801.06 4,600.00
Area Diesel 231670 - 7w stock stock 30d

810065 10.87 27.13 10.87 55.96 47.01 45.23 53.98
CBM 231642 - stock stock 5w stock stock 21d

810073 100.00 142.75 109.89 105.82 100.00 100.00
Hydraulic Electric 231665 - 7w stock stock 14d 45d

810078 350.00 420.00 368.85 800.68 536.60 417.75 386.00 350.00 470.00

no lead

Hydraulic Electric 231665 - stock stock 60d 5w 7d stock 21d given

810079 355.00 555.18 396.85 386.00 355.00 413.39
Hydraulic Electric 231665 - 7w stock stock stock stock

810084 645.00 645.00 1,151.50 645.71 736.96 680.94
Neopart 231668 - stock 6w stock stock stock

810086 75.36 99.72 75.36 81.04 87.68




Pace RFQ# 420736
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . . ! ' [ | | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Diesel Kirks Vehicle MW Bus - Gillig Neopart Prevost CBM Aftermarket | Area Diesel| Coffman Transit Hydraulic Muncie Eldorado Rome
Emissions Maintenance|  NO BID Parts Parts 101 | Electric Truck - NO
NO # of Bids BID
Area Diesel 231670 - stock stock stock 21d
810129 461.46 461.46
Eldorado 231666 - 6w
810130 379.19 582.98 391.72 379.19 455.62
Coffman 231671 - 5w stock 14d 30d
810164 1,400.00 1,400.00 2,722.95| 1,532.08| 1,549.66 1,475.00| 2,333.42
Hydraulic Electric 231665 - R&R 7w stock 5d 14d 30d
810187 8.08 10.07 8.08 8.57 9.29
Area Diesel 231670 - 4w stock stock 21d
810230 3.03 5.38 4.04 3.03 3.42 3.61
Area Diesel 231670 - 60d 5w stock stock 21d
810231 224.87 290.63 224.87 237.45 255.25
Area Diesel 231670 - stock 7d 14d 21d
810308 320.00 401.97 384.43 331.51 320.00 371.17
Hydraulic Electric 231665 - 6w 7d stock 14d 21d
810314 33.60 40.90 37.94 33.60 37.52
Coffman 231671 - 4w stock stock 21d
810324 96.84 96.84
Transit Parts 101 231663 - 3w
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