
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid P&G Kirks Gillig Vehicle 
Maintenance

MW Bus Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Coffman 
Truck

Transit 
Parts 101

Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

                                   2 71733 78.78                      95.15           78.78 

Aftermarket Parts 231662 -                 60d  2w 

                                   3 72057 3.37                          8.99             3.37             4.31 

Vehicle Maintenance 231660 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                   6 72143 10.50                      11.25           10.62           13.28           10.50           10.93           21.55 

Aftermarket Parts 231662 -                 10w  7w  60d  1w  60d  stock 

                                   2 71357 10.92                      10.92           15.07 

Aftermarket Parts 231662  stock  stock 

                                   1 72120 97.15                      97.15 

Eldorado 231666 -                 2w 

                                   1 70730 0.64                          0.64 

Aftermarket Parts 231662 -                 stock 

                                   1 72144 26.95                      26.95 

Eldorado 231666 -                 stock 

                                   1 72145 8.59                          8.59 

Eldorado 231666 -                 3w 

                                   4 72162 32.32                      56.25           54.01           32.32           32.35 

Muncie 231664 -                 60d  6w  stock  stock 

                                   4 72172 18.85                      38.50           43.57           33.45           18.85 

Transit Parts 101 231663  60d  7w  8w  BID LATE 

                                   1 72182 3.73                          3.73 

Pace RFQ# 420735



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid P&G Kirks Gillig Vehicle 
Maintenance

MW Bus Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Coffman 
Truck

Transit 
Parts 101

Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420735

Eldorado 231666  stock 

                                   1 72203 32.35                      32.35 

Eldorado 231666  stock 

                                   4 72216 151.50                 151.50        210.00        160.09        291.55 

Gillig 231659  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   1 72249 1.74                          1.74 

Eldorado 231666 -                 stock 

                                   2 72301 221.00                 221.00        314.84 

Suburban Truck 231661  5w  5w 

                                   6 72388 38.00                      38.00           63.15           78.80           52.37           65.00           63.00 

Gillig 231659  stock  7w  stock  9w  60d  stock 

                                   4 710026 450.00                 450.00        601.20        516.57        545.95 

Gillig 231659 -                 stock  60d  5w  stock 

                                   4 710057 43.98                      61.37           45.46           54.04           43.98 

Hydraulic Electric 231665 -                 stock  stock  stock  14d 

                                   1 710076 199.37                 199.37 

Eldorado 231666 -                 8w 

                                   2 710088 29.62                      29.62           53.95 

Vehicle Maintenance 231660 -                 stock  stock 

                                   8 710119 2,325.00          2,777.04     3,706.32     2,970.95     2,325.00     3,794.47     3,504.02     3,135.60     3,125.00 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid P&G Kirks Gillig Vehicle 
Maintenance

MW Bus Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Coffman 
Truck

Transit 
Parts 101

Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420735

P&G 231658 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 not quoting 

new  60d  stock  60d  14d 

                                   8 710120 381.17                 381.17        470.00        395.00        391.00        521.24        478.42        425.00        435.00 

P&G 231658 -                 stock  stock  5w  10d  stock  stock  30d  14d 

                                   1 710130 82.44                      82.44 

Eldorado 231666 -                 stock 

                                   4 710136 515.06                 515.06        960.00        828.34        564.09 

Gillig 231659 -                 stock  90d  9w  stock 

                                   4 710137 485.30                 525.00        630.00        485.30        599.94 

Aftermarket Parts 231662 -                 8w  90d  stock  1w 

                                   1 710141 21.55                      21.55 

Eldorado 231666 -                 4w 

                                   8 710168 406.39                 406.39        520.00        440.75        410.00        564.71        515.19        485.60        489.00 

P&G 231658 -                 stock  stock  2w  10d  60d  7w  30d  14d 

                                   9 710170 2,325.00          2,729.66     3,096.00     3,100.00     2,325.00     3,816.82     3,321.08     3,281.90     3,210.00     5,136.73 

P&G 231658 -                 stock  stock  2w 
 not quoting 

new  60d  10w  30d  14d  6w 

                                   3 710241 31.83                      31.83           38.55           39.57 

Gillig 231659 -                 stock  14d  stock 

                                   1 710310 452.22                 452.22 

Aftermarket Parts 231662 -                 13w 

                                   1 710357 5,184.00          5,184.00 

Eldorado 231666 -                 6w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid P&G Kirks Gillig Vehicle 
Maintenance

MW Bus Neopart Suburban 
Truck 

Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Rome Truck 
- NO BID

Coffman 
Truck

Transit 
Parts 101

Muncie Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420735

                                   3 710356 12.80                      17.66           12.80           15.75 

Hydraulic Electric 231665 -                 stock  MOQ  14d 


	420735

