
Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

2 60573 7.45                              9.69               7.45 

Kirk's Automotive 

231647 0 ON HAND  Stock  30 Days 

6 41131 48.52                     48.52             58.75            86.26          93.34        101.58          98.83 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231627 -                  Feb 29th  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

2 30375 45.54             DQ             45.74          45.54 

NFI Parts 231653 -                 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  Stock 

6 40106 2.05                             6.75             2.05               5.00               6.62             6.55             9.17 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231627  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 60 

Days 

1 60735 893.20                 893.20 

ElDorado 231644 -                 2-4 Weeks

2 20701 334.75                 334.75        462.82 

ElDorado 231644  Stock  11 Weeks 

6 10170 0.88                           0.88               1.72               1.52             1.57             1.95             1.81 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231627                     -    Stock 

 69 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  Stock 

 6 Stock 

Balance 60 

Days  Stock 

10 40798 95.77            100.57                119.00          133.53        95.77        119.40          100.25          105.90        117.22        143.80        103.80 

Midwest Bus 231648 -                 1 Week  Stock  2-4 Weeks  14 Days  Feb 8th  Stock  Stock 

 5 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  60 Days  Stock 

6 290028 12.70            12.70                        30.77          24.86             12.88          12.87          24.85 

Acme Truck Brake & 

Supply Co. 231639 -                 Stock  Stock  Feb 8th  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 290653 17.00                        18.00       17.00          33.23             20.35          18.32          23.25 

HECS 231646  Stock  14 Days  Feb 8th  21 Days  Stock  60 Days 

5 10193 14.27                     16.25             15.10          16.83          19.03          14.27 

Suburban Truck Parts 

231654

 2 Stock 

Balance 

Mar 22nd  90 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

4 290645 41.59                     59.35             56.25    46.50                41.59 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231655  Stock 

 6 Stock 

Only  Stock  Stock 

6 40036 40.33                     70.15             47.20          40.33             99.95          54.63        111.13 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231627  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

6 290537 158.88                   159.18     159.00          186.25          158.88        167.83        207.20 

Neopart 231652 -                  Stock  Stock  14 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

1 60499 3.40                             3.40 

Muncie 231651  Stock 

RFQ 420734 Due: 01/26/2021



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420734 Due: 01/26/2021

4 290658 102.51                   102.51          120.20        111.57        131.44 

Gillig 231645  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock 

9 41216 172.00                 192.00          185.00      172.00        242.82          234.06          428.50        194.89        263.70        192.82 

Midwest Bus 231648  Stock  Stock  7 Days  Feb 21st  21 Days  Stock 

 5 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  Stock  Stock 

9 41215 124.55          140.72                145.00          146.30        156.67          124.55          128.66        145.06        167.20        144.74 

Muncie 231651 -                 1 Week  Stock  2-4 Weeks  Feb 21st  Stock  Stock  5 Weeks  60 Days  Stock 

10 60745 41.09            65.67            91.24      46.36       95.46                         94.99        112.73             76.00          69.63        108.67  DQ                41.09 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231655 -                 1 Week Stock Stock  Stock  Stock  Feb 15th  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock 

3 290644 41.59                     59.35    46.50                41.59 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231655 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock 

8 41213 105.00                 105.00          120.00      118.25          155.97          230.55        109.84        133.09        105.00 

ElDorado 231644  Stock  7 Days  30 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 41169 33.84                     33.84             34.42          38.89 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231627

NORTH SHORE HAS 

0 ON HAND -                  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 290420 572.22                   599.00     685.00          671.90          572.22        652.94        633.60 

Neopart 231652 -                  2-4 Weeks  14 Days 

 1 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  2-3 Weeks  5 Weeks  60 Days 

7 40922 17.55            29.79                75.55             29.50          17.55             25.71            29.10          31.56 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231627   Stock  2-4 Weeks  4 Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 40162 0.32                           0.32               0.98               1.00             0.96             1.23             1.35 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231627 -                  Stock  Stock 

 Must be 

ordered in 

multiples of 

20 Stock  Stock 

 7 Stock 

Balance 60 

Days  Stock 

6 41132 48.52                     48.52             98.99            87.05          94.15        109.56          98.83 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231627 -                  Feb 5th  60 Days  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

1 151960 5.89                           5.89 

ElDorado 231644 -                  1 Week 

6 41240 80.36                        83.50          92.23             80.36            88.40          81.36        111.62 

Muncie 231651 -                  Stock  Feb 10th  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

1 30411 209.95                 209.95 

ElDorado 231644 -                  Stock 

1 20712 410.35                 410.35 

ElDorado 231644 -                  Stock 

1 152006 16.15                     16.15 

ElDorado 231644 -                  Stock 

7 41273 31.85                     43.15          37.96             36.20            31.85          35.25          38.48          36.15 

Neopart 231652 -                  1 Week  Feb 21st  30 Days  Stock  Stock  75 Days  Stock 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420734 Due: 01/26/2021

6 290674 165.00                 377.95          170.00     165.00          194.55        196.40        232.50 

HECS 231646 -                  3-4 Weeks  Stock  14 Days  21 Days  Stock  60 Days 

1 290675 59.35                     59.35 

ElDorado 231644 -                  2-4 Weeks 

1 10417 421.15                 421.15 

ElDorado 231644 -                  Stock 

4 290681 108.47                   108.47          118.99        109.70        131.44 

Gillig 231645 -                  Stock  21 Days  5 Weeks  60 Days 

4 290682 63.00                        63.00             71.32          70.70          78.12 

Gillig 231645 -                  Stock  21 Days 

 2 Stock 

Balance 4 

Weeks  60 Days 

5 250733 835.99                   836.04    875.69      855.00          835.99        918.00 

Neopart 231652

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND  1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days 

 2 Stock 

Balance 14 

Weeks 

5 41288 88.17                   248.35             88.17  DQ          104.96            91.54          98.70 

Gillig 231645 -                  1-2 Weeks  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  21 Days  4-6 Weeks  Stock 

1 60792 172.75                 172.75 

ElDorado 231644 -                  2-4 Weeks 

2 41294 1,395.00          1,396.45    1,395.00 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  13 Weeks 

 1 Stock 

Balance 4-

5 Weeks 

7 290690 496.50                 870.78          496.95     520.00          582.85          496.50        534.01        674.40 

Neopart 231652 -                  4 Weeks  Stock  Stock  21 Days  Stock  60 Days 

6 290694 85.00                        87.99       85.00             95.35            90.30        108.24        116.20 

HECS 231646 -                  Stock  14 Days 

 9 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

8 41332 282.79                 285.00          310.00      302.00        323.15          367.14          317.95        282.79        367.10 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  4-6 Weeks  2-4 Weeks  14 Days  Feb 21st  30 Days  2-3 Weeks 

 3 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  Stock 

3 290695 61.99                     91.75             61.99          62.80 

Muncie 231651 -                  Stock  45 Days  24 Weeks 

7 290696 8.80               8.80            10.10                37.75  DQ             23.23            10.80          11.49          15.33 

Autex Automotive 

Devices 231641 -                 1 Day Stock  4-6 Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  3-4 Weeks  5 Weeks  75 Days 

6 152074 10.38                     16.15             11.80       10.38          10.48          12.60          39.49 

HECS 231646 -                  4 Weeks  Stock  14 Days  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

4 290700 161.48                 248.35          163.40        161.48        205.56 

Muncie 231651 LOW STOCK -                  Stock 

 4 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  25 Weeks  130 Days 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420734 Due: 01/26/2021

4 290701 161.48                 248.35          163.40        161.48        205.56 

Muncie 231651 LOW STOCK -                  Stock  Stock  25 Weeks  130 Days 

1 30483 119.31                 119.31 

ElDorado 231644 -                  2-4 Weeks 

4 2510000 318.56                   475.52          597.57          318.56        525.22 

Neopart 231652 -                  Stock  42 Days  3-4 Weeks  Stock 

6 410001 789.38             1,100.00    1,275.00          790.38          789.38        790.38        970.34 

Neopart 231652

SOUTH HAS 5 

CORES -                  Stock  Feb 15th 

 302.50 Core 

Charge 30 

Days 

 300.00 

Core Charge 

Stock 

 275.00 

Core 

Charge 3 

Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks 

 275.00 

Core 

Charge 

6 410002 789.38             1,100.00    1,275.00          790.38          789.38        790.38        970.34 

Neopart 231652  (5) 

& NFI Parts 231653 

(7)

SOUTH HAS 5 

CORES & 7 NO 

CORES -                  Stock  Feb 15th 

 302.50 Core 

Charge 

(1092.88) 

30 Days 

 300.00 

Core Charge 

(1089.38) 

Stock 

 275.00 

Core 

Charge 

(1065.38) 

1 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks 

 275.00 

Core 

Charge 

(1245.34) 

6 410009 102.33                 134.95        103.00          127.30        102.33        155.32        127.54 

NFI Parts 231653  4 Weeks  Feb 10th  21 Days  Feb 15th  60 Days  Stock 

8 410010 125.50                 175.00          132.90      132.00  DQ          126.05          125.50        142.78        258.74        290.36 

Neopart 231652 -                  Stock  Stock  14 Days 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

3 2510006 67.83                        97.20          111.92          67.83 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  4 Weeks  35 Days  Stock 

1 210002 323.95                 323.95 

ElDorado 231644 -                  Stock 

1 110006 237.55                 237.55 

ElDorado 231644 -                  Stock 

1 110013 8.59                           8.59 

ElDorado 231644 -                  1 Week 

1 310009 131.91                 131.91 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  Stock 

6 610026 115.00          241.53         115.00           135.00  DQ          154.85          166.03        129.98 

HECS 231646

VERY LOW STOCK 

WEST HAS 6 CORES 

& HERITAGE HAS 4 

NO CORES -                 5 Weeks

 No Core 

Charge 

14 Days  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  3-4 Weeks 

 8 Pcs 3 

Weeks 

Balance 19 

Weeks 

3 2910007 36.20                     64.75             36.20          49.63 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  Stock  75 Days  Stock 

6 610028 40.99            67.08      DQ 40.99             DQ          82.89             49.12            60.12          87.66  DQ 

Coffman Truck Sales 

231643 -                 Stock

 Not an 

approved 

OEM Stock

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Feb 22nd  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420734 Due: 01/26/2021

1 110019 43.15                     43.15 

ElDorado 231644 -                  2 Weeks 

6 610033 650.00          689.62   697.54                   650.00    1,098.47          815.99        926.77 

Kirk's Automotive 

231647

NORTHWEST HAS 4 

CORES -                 

 230.00 

Core 

Charge 

Stock Stock

 20.00 Core 

Charge Stock  Feb 8th 

 253.00 Core 

Charge 21 

Days 

 230.00 

Core 

Charge 5 

Weeks 

5 310017 2.44                             3.25             2.58               2.97             2.44             3.33 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 410035 376.45                 389.80          383.75          376.45        435.92        479.69 

Neopart 231652 -                  15 Days  21 Days  3-4 Weeks  6 Weeks  60 Days 

5 410036 376.45                 389.80          383.75          376.45        435.92        479.69 

Neopart 231652 -                  15 Days  21 Days  3-4 Weeks 

 3 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks  60 Days 

2 210013 136.82                 136.82        350.06 

ElDorado 231644 -                  2 Weeks  90 Days 

2 2910015 14.64                     16.36          14.64 

ElDorado 231644 -                  2 Weeks  Mar 16th 

7 610050 19.61            26.42            20.45                36.86             26.23          29.69          41.54  DQ                19.61 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231655 -                 1 Week Stock

 1 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock 

1 410070 76.07                     76.07 

ElDorado 231644 -                  2 Weeks 

4 2510043 12.40                        13.24      21.80            12.40          13.97 

Neopart 231652 -                  1-2 Weeks  Stock  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 

1 110026 56.00                     56.00 

ElDorado 231644 -                  2 Weeks 

1 110027 1.06                           1.06 

ElDorado 231644 -                  1 Week 

5 2510044 3.96                             3.96         6.99          4.00               4.33             4.05 

Gillig 231645 -                  1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 

4 2510045 5.47                             6.22         8.49          5.47               5.48 

Midwest Bus 231648

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                  1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days 

5 2510047 40.87                        41.20      45.99        41.00            40.87          42.96 

Neopart 231652 -                  1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  Stock 

5 2510048 67.34                        67.34      83.51        69.21            67.34          82.45 

Gillig 231645 -                  1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  Stock 

5 2510064 31.28                        31.34      38.44        32.75            31.28          35.47 

Neopart 231652

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                  1-2 Weeks  10 Days  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 

4 610072 35.04            35.04      35.27             DQ             41.75          42.56 

Area Diesel Service 

231640 -                 Stock Stock

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  30 Days  Stock 

1 1510141 22.71                     22.71 

ElDorado 231644 -                  2 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420734 Due: 01/26/2021

1 610082 7.62                           7.62 

ElDorado 231644 -                  1-2 Weeks 

1 110040 321.92                 321.92 

ElDorado 231644 -                  4-6 Weeks 

4 110042 33.84                     33.84             40.45          38.89          40.91 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231627 -                 

 7 Stock 

Balance 

Feb 15th  30 Days  Stock  60 Days 

4 410083 89.88                     102.14          105.25            89.88        104.95 

Neopart 231652 -                  2-4 Weeks  30 Days  3-4 Weeks  7 Weeks 

1 1510172 88.82                     88.82 

ElDorado 231644 -                  4-6 Weeks 

1 110049 1.70                           1.70 

ElDorado 231644 -                  1 Week 

1 110051 1.90                           1.90 

ElDorado 231644 -                  1 Week 

1 110054 0.20                           0.20 

ElDorado 231644 -                  1 Week 

3 410103 33.33                     37.43          33.33         43.80 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  2-4 Weeks  5 Weeks  3 Weeks 

1 1510269 31.04                     31.04 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  Stock 

1 1510270 31.02                     31.02 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  Stock 

1 1510271 55.14                     55.14 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  7 Weeks 

1 610141 38.84                     38.84 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  Stock 

2 610142 48.55                        75.00          48.55 

NFI Parts 231653 -                  2-4 Weeks  Stock 

1 2910060 18.00                     18.00 

ElDorado 231644 -                  1 Week 

3 210031 3.15               3.15           DQ             6.28            6.81 

CBM 231642 -                 Stock

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  2 Weeks 


