
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
Power

Suburban 
Truck

Rex Sales Neopart 
Transit

Kirk's Auto CBM US MW Bus Area Diesel Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Muncie

                                  6 130613 2.78                        14.62           16.00           13.55           17.97 2.78           14.19         

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 stock  7d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 21d

                                  1 110138 5.89                          5.89 

Eldorado 231600 -                 stock 

                                  8 110136 68.89                      68.89           81.29           69.58           74.88           77.58        129.35        111.92 77.85         

Suburban Truck 231599 -                
 Min order 

qty  14d  stock  stock  5d  60d  7w 30d

                                  2 130745 13.89                      13.89           19.93 

Interstate Power 231613  stock  5w 

                                  8 100223 61.06                      70.50           65.90           95.39           64.00        159.16        111.08 61.06         94.98         

Hydraulic Electric 231606 -                 stock  stock  stock  2w  60d  6w 
 unapproved 

part 35d

                                  2 100225 199.99                 205.15        199.99 

Aftermarket Parts 231608 -                 stock  8w 

                                  3 120529 1,588.43          2,375.95     1,978.03 1,588.43    

Muncie 231611 -                 6w  11w 30d

                                  4 120531 49.83                      53.35           49.83           65.86 58.65         

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 stock  stock  7w 21d

                                  1 140076 604.75                 604.75 

Eldorado 231600 -                 stock 

                                  6 1010001 8.42                        10.11             8.59             8.42             9.00             9.14 9.75           

CBM US 231609  stock  stock  stock  stock  60d 30d

                                  2 1210006 57.32                   101.61           57.32 

Aftermarket Parts 231608  stock  5w 

                                  1 1010006 20.95                      20.95 

Eldorado 231600  stock 

                                  7 1010003 15.11                      27.56           27.88           26.00           59.75           37.90 15.11         32.80         

Hydraulic Electric 231606  stock  stock  2w  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 21d

Pace RFQ# 420707



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
Maintenance

Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Interstate 
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Suburban 
Truck

Rex Sales Neopart 
Transit

Kirk's Auto CBM US MW Bus Area Diesel Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Muncie

Pace RFQ# 420707

                                  9 1010011 885.00              1,175.00     1,410.84        885.00     1,114.24        968.61     1,611.22     1,264.76 1,055.00    1,127.15    

Kirk's Auto 231614 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  60d  4w 30d 21d

                                  6 1010012 1,213.00          1,375.00     1,488.76     1,213.00     1,766.32 1,244.90    1,955.39    

Kirk's Auto 231614 stock  3w  stock  stock stock 21d

                                  2 1210016 600.00                 640.00        600.00 

Eldorado 231600  stock  stock 

                                  9 1010014 3.75                          4.25             6.95             3.75             7.99             7.79           14.04             9.18 4.55           8.94           

Kirk's Auto 231614 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  60d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d 

                                  7 1010015 864.95              1,195.00     1,236.00        864.95     1,151.59     1,004.29 1,115.00    1,218.00    

Kirk's Auto 231614 -                 stock  10w  stock  stock  stock  2w 45d

                                  4 1010016 2,173.69          2,173.69     2,302.51     2,918.58 2,447.24    

Area Diesel 231615 -                 stock  stock  7w 21d

                                  3 1010018 17.50                      37.69           20.94 17.50         

Muncie 231611 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 1010024 55.69                      55.69           60.50           73.59 69.42         65.55         

Area Diesel 231615 -                 stock  stock  7w 2w 21d

                                  1 1010027 41.29                      41.29 

Eldorado 231600 -                 stock 

                                  4 1210038 1,969.69          1,969.69     2,076.46     2,885.13 2,160.04    

Area Diesel 231615 -                 stock  10d  10w 35d

                                  6 1010032 74.42                   110.18        109.92        205.79        145.28 74.42         104.13       

Muncie 231611 -                 stock  stock  60d  stock 
 unapproved 

part stock

                                  1 1210051 886.70                 886.70 

Eldorado 231600 -                 stock 

                                  5 1010035 87.54                      87.54           90.96           96.76        120.24 106.55       

Area Diesel 231615 -                 stock  stock  60d  7w  21d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
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Rome 
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Pace RFQ# 420707

                                  4 1010036 87.54                      87.54           90.96        120.24 106.55       

Area Diesel 231615 -                 stock  stock  7w 21d

                                  7 1010038 28.00                      28.24           28.00           47.31           28.50           28.25           58.00 55.05         

Kirk's Auto 231614 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  2w  stock 21d

                                  7 1210070 44.75                      56.76           46.66           44.75           50.75           56.51 50.96         57.55         

Hydraulic Electric 231606 -                 stock  stock  3w  60d  stock 4w stock

                                  5 1210071 191.03                 193.21        191.03        251.26 236.60       224.75       

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 stock  stock  5w 
 unapproved 

part 21d

                                   - 1210074 -                 NLA 

-                

                                  4 1010044 195.43                 201.13        205.64        297.16 195.43       

Muncie 231611 -                 stock  stock  5w 35d

                                  5 1110003 92.24                      92.24           93.27        127.68 119.69       114.20       

Area Diesel 231615 -                 stock  stock  stock 3w  stock 

                                  4 1210093 33.11                      33.11           33.48           44.26 37.45         

Area Diesel 231615 -                 stock  stock  7w 21d

                                  6 1210096 106.61              1,010.00        106.61        108.05        146.38 131.62       116.55       

Area Diesel 231615 -                
 no lead 

time given  stock  stock  7w stock stock

                                  3 1210097 10.16                      10.16           23.78 24.33         

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 5d  5w 21d

                                  1 1310016 2.22                          2.22 

Eldorado 231600 -                 1w 

                                  7 1010049 1,047.75          1,395.00     1,465.00     1,069.23     1,057.15     1,907.15 1,360.00    1,047.75    

Muncie 231611 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  60d stock 21d

                                  3 1010050 3,843.08          3,843.08     4,953.25 4,475.55    

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 5d  6w 21d



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
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Pace RFQ# 420707

                                  3 1010060 2,234.10          2,234.10     3,359.17 2,615.55    

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 stock  7w 21d

                                  8 1010061 888.00                 995.00     1,010.00        888.00     1,153.09        991.08     1,999.35 940.00       1,166.45    

Kirk's Auto 231614 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  9w stock 21d

                                  4 1010066 66.95                      70.53           66.95           88.03 79.25         

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 stock  stock  5w 21d

                                  5 1010070 303.43                 303.45        303.43        450.00        412.61 357.00       

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 stock  stock  2w  5w 21d

                                  7 1210119 948.68                 948.68     1,102.00     1,412.31     1,260.96     1,567.41 1,480.03    1,428.36    

Neopart Transit 231597 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  6w 2w 21d

1210130 600.00                 600.00 

Eldorado 231600 -                 stock 

                                  3 1010078 520.16                 521.91        520.16 579.95       

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 stock  10d 21d

                                  6 1010079 15.11                      22.96           38.13           37.69           48.43 15.11         17.50         

Muncie 231611 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  2 1010080 862.47                 862.47 957.88       

Coffman Truck 231612 -                 15d  21d 


	420707

