
Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotiv

e Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts and 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstat

e Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

5 290415 470.97                   470.97          556.72         492.48       514.68       590.00 

Gillig 231582  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

6 41236 138.48                   493.43       146.19          141.81         138.48       143.58       205.86 

Neopart 231587 -                 4 Weeks 

 3 Stock 

Balance 15 

Days  21 Days  2-3 Weeks  5 Weeks  60 Days 

6 40120 0.16                         0.20              0.16              1.63            0.32            2.02            1.83 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 8 Stock 

Balance 90 

Days  Stock 

5 60734 2.41                            4.10              2.61            6.17            2.53                  2.41 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231590

 4 Only 

Available  60 Days  Stock  Stock 

6 290616 113.89                   113.89    119.00          134.34         114.46       125.21       148.70 

Gillig 231582 -                Stock  Stock 

 4 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

6 40504 1.12                         1.12              1.35              1.59            1.44            1.76            1.53 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 QTY. 30  Stock 

 16 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days - 20 Pc 

Min 20 Pc 

Std Pk  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

5 290028 12.87                       31.49          24.36            12.88          12.87          24.85 

NFI Parts 231588                    -    Stock  Jan 25th  Stock  Stock  Stock 

7 41013 13.15                       13.15             29.00          14.20            13.98          15.59          17.70          15.84 

Gillig 231582 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

7 40174 1.52                         21.99            1.52            25.79            21.97          22.27          32.07          26.13 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 -                 Stock  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock 

 4 Stock 

Balance 60 

Days  Stock 

6 290537 159.18                   159.18    159.50          185.90         159.62       167.83       207.20 

Gillig 231582  Stock  Stock 

 5 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

7 40953 8.30                         13.75            8.30            14.23            31.93          11.77          18.10          30.69 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

4 290658 102.51                   102.51          120.26       112.20       131.44 

Gillig 231582  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock 

8 60745 41.09            42.09       95.46                       95.00       112.73            76.12          70.02       108.67  DQ                41.09 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231590 Stock

 5 Stock 

Balance 5 

Days  Stock  Feb 1st  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock 

7 290614 5.00              5.10           5.72                    5.40            13.95              6.70            5.00          12.86 

NFI Parts 231588 -                1 Day Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 290644 41.59                       59.35   46.50                41.59 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231590  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 290652 4.98                           4.99         4.98              6.81            6.18            7.98 

HECS 231583  Stock  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock 

RFQ 420704 Due: 01/12/2021



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotiv

e Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts and 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstat

e Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420704 Due: 01/12/2021

6 10405 121.80                   194.35          121.80       122.70          168.68       136.53       207.84 

Gillig 231582  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  Stock  120 Days 

7 40907 54.65                       73.75          54.65            68.30            77.16          80.78          97.19       254.20 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 -                

 13 Stock 

Balance 1-2 

Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

5 290428 8.75                      8.75              9.16              8.97          56.94          11.48 

HECS 231583 -                 Stock 

 51 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  2-3 Weeks 

 59 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks  60 Days 

8 40079 8.10                         12.99         8.25            8.10            12.75            13.99          13.22          16.66          30.40 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 -                 Stock  14 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

6 40922 17.55                       75.55            27.75          17.55            23.50            29.10          31.65 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585  1 Week  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 40185 17.75                       47.99          17.75            18.83            38.51          52.65          60.58 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 26 

Weeks  Stock 

6 10001 0.37                           1.30            0.37              1.22              1.21            1.06            1.52 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 QTY. 30 -                 Stock  Stock 

 4 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days 

 Stock Min. 

order Qty. 

50  Stock  Stock 

7 40842 5.04                           6.50            5.04              6.00              6.97            7.81            8.51            7.98 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585   Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 40162 0.32                         0.32              0.98              1.09            0.96            1.23 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 QTY. 26 -                 Stock  Stock 

 Stock Must 

order in 20s 

 5 Stock 

Balance 60 

Days 

5 60085 12.10                     12.10            12.52            99.92          12.70       106.92 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 40596 0.47                         0.47              0.55              1.45            1.52            2.09            2.29 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 QTY. 50 -                 Feb 22nd  Stock 

 3-4 Weeks 

Must order 

in 20s  Stock 

 14 Stock 

Balance 60 

Days  Stock 

4 60748 47.27                       59.35            47.27          53.92          64.67 

NFI Parts 231588 LOW STOCK -                 Stock  60 Days  Stock  Stock 

3 151975 935.04                1,576.75       935.04    1,156.25 

NFI Parts 231588

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                 Stock  2 Weeks  60 Days 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotiv

e Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts and 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstat

e Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420704 Due: 01/12/2021

5 10411 109.22                   151.15          110.99          109.22         110.07       112.40 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  3-5 Weeks  3 Weeks 

1 60770 59.35                       59.35 

ElDorado 231580 -                 2-4 Weeks 

1 152006 16.15                       16.15 

ElDorado 231580 -                 Stock 

1 60772 18.85                       18.85 

ElDorado 231580 -                 Stock 

5 290673 940.05                1,430.00          940.05      1,020.79       966.63    1,172.84 

Gillig 231582 -                 4 Weeks  2-4 Weeks  21 Days  Stock  90 Days 

1 290675 59.35                       59.35 

ElDorado 231580 -                 4 Weeks 

3 10416 367.15                   367.15       393.45       719.46 

ElDorado 231580 -                 Stock  7 Weeks  60 Days 

4 290681 109.71                   109.74          119.55       109.71       131.44 

NFI Parts 231588 -                 Stock  21 Days  5 Weeks  60 Days 

3 60790 538.52                   776.95          538.52       612.16 

Muncie 231586  4 Weeks  42 Days  8 Weeks 

1 60792 172.75                   172.75 

ElDorado 231580 -                 Stock 

1 152031 0.53                            0.53 

ElDorado 231580 -                 1 Week 

4 152033 126.99                   280.75          168.06          126.99       162.06 

Muncie 231586 -                 4 Weeks  6 Weeks  Stock  60 Days 

5 20727 215.51                   349.66          215.51          215.65       244.82       215.75 

Gillig 231582 -                 Stock  8-10 Weeks  49 Days  10 Weeks  75 Days 

4 60794 8.10                         13.99              8.10            10.24            8.17 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  30 Days  2-3 Weeks  5 Weeks 

2 41294 1,396.45            1,396.45    1,453.65 

ElDorado 231580 -                 13 Weeks 

 1 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks 

7 290690 496.95                   870.78          496.95    520.00          582.90         500.43       534.60       674.40 

Gillig 231582 -                 6 Weeks 

 8 Stock 

Balance 2 

Weeks  Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock 

 6 Stock 

Balance 3 

Weeks  60 Days 

7 290696 8.80              8.80           10.10                  37.75  DQ            23.23            10.50          11.80          15.33 

Autex Automotive 

Devices 231576 -                1 Day

 57 Stock 

Balance to 

be 

confirmed  6-8 Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  4-6 Weeks  5 Weeks 

 51 Stock 

Balance 60 

Days 

4 290700 161.48                   248.35          163.40       161.48       205.56 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  Stock  25 Weeks  130 Days 

4 290701 161.48                   248.35          163.40       161.48       205.56 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  Stock  25 Weeks  130 Days 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotiv

e Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts and 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstat

e Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420704 Due: 01/12/2021

4 2510000 318.56                   478.50          399.45         318.56       526.67 

Neopart 231587 -                 Stock  42 Days  2-3 Weeks  Stock 

2 2510001 1,123.25           1,234.49    1,123.25 

NFI Parts 231588 -                 8 Weeks  Stock 

2 2510002 1,025.39           1,234.49    1,025.39 

NFI Parts 231588 -                 8 Weeks  13 Weeks 

1 110004 119.31                   119.31 

ElDorado 231580 -                 2-4 Weeks 

5 410001 790.38                1,100.00    1,318.96          790.38         794.77       793.93  DQ 

Muncie 231586 WEST HAS 4 CORES -                 Stock  30 Days 

 302.50 

Core Charge 

2 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days 

 300.00 

Core Charge 

Stock  5 Weeks 

 Reman 

Only 

5 410002 790.38                1,100.00    1,318.96          790.38         794.77       793.93  DQ 

Muncie 231586 WEST HAS 4 CORES  Stock  30 Days 

 302.50 

Core Charge 

 300.00 

Core Charge 

Stock  Stock 

 Reman 

Only 

7 410006 135.00                   155.00          147.52  DQ          135.00         144.61       143.46       200.82       293.01 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  1-2 Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

6 410009 102.45                   134.95       102.45          127.30       103.44       155.32       127.54 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 -                 2 Weeks  Stock  21 Days  Feb 15th  60 Days  Stock 

7 410010 126.05                   175.00          126.50     133.25  DQ          126.05         153.09       143.59       258.74 

Muncie 231586 -                 4-6 Weeks  Stock  14 Days 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  2-3 Weeks  Stock  60 Days 

2 1510007 19.13                       26.95          19.13 

NFI Parts 231588 -                 Stock  Stock 

1 110013 8.59                            8.59 

ElDorado 231580 -                 1 Week 

1 610017 75.55                       75.55 

ElDorado 231580 -                 1 Week 

1 1510032 470.90                   470.90 

ElDorado 231580 -                 4-6 Weeks 

7 210003 232.99                   410.35          250.00          232.99         242.12       277.82       291.45       281.58 

Neopart 231587 -                 Stock  2-4 Weeks  90 Days  Stock  14 Weeks  105 Days  Stock 

8 610019 72.34            142.28   140.67                     94.00          72.34            72.62          72.72       102.10          79.35 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231585 -                Stock Stock  Stock  Stock  30 Days  7 Weeks  60 Days  Stock 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotiv

e Devices

CBM Chicago 

Parts and 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Illinois 

Auto 

Central

Interstat

e Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420704 Due: 01/12/2021

4 110014 106.00                   134.95          106.00         108.06       106.09 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  30 Days  4-6 Weeks  Stock 

4 310008 91.90                     140.35          190.45            91.90          95.73 

Neopart 231587 -                 Stock  30 Days  3-4 Weeks 

 5 Stock 

Balance 13 

Weeks 

8 610026 102.00          304.91   315.67            102.00           135.00  DQ          154.85         170.00       118.21       131.40 

HECS 231583 -                Stock  Stock  14 Days  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 610033 697.54          697.54                   750.00    1,182.47          815.99       929.53 

Kirk's Automotive 

231584 WEST HAS 0 CORES -                

 200.00 Core 

Charge 

(897.54) 

Stock 

 20.00 Core 

Charge 

(770.00) 

Stock  Jan 25th 

 253.00 

Core Charge 

30 Days  Stock 

1 610036 3,801.55            3,801.55 

ElDorado 231580 -                 Stock 

4 2510025 72.20                       72.20      90.20            74.57          86.62 

Gillig 231582 -                 1-2 Weeks  Stock  7-10 Days  Stock 

4 610049 5.90              5.95        5.90                           6.66            7.60 

Coffman Truck Sales 

231579

SOUTH HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

8 610050 19.61            104.86   20.45                36.36            26.23            34.92          29.85          41.54  DQ                19.61 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231590 LOW STOCK -                Stock Stock

 1 Stock 

Balance 14 

Days  Stock 

 3 Stock 

Balance 4-6 

Weeks  Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

apporved 

OEM.  Stock 

5 610052 4.00              4.00        4.33                           5.06            6.01                  4.25 

Area Diesel Service 

231575 -                Stock Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock 

4 610053 25.45            25.74     25.45            DQ            27.35          31.74 

Coffman Truck Sales 

231579 -                Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock 

 4 Stock 

Balance 7 

Weeks 

4 410049 72.00            94.63             96.00             72.00          102.00 

Kirk's Automotive 

231584 RIVER HAS 1 CORE -                1 Day  14 Days  Stock 

 68.75 Core 

Charge 21 

Days 

3 410053 54.43            54.43                   55.00            54.54 

Chicago Parts and 

Sound 231578 -                1 Day  Stock  21 Days 

4 610055 38.53            38.75     38.53            DQ            43.00          47.46  DQ 

Coffman Truck Sales 

231579 -                Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM. 

 14 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM. 

1 410070 76.07                       76.07 

ElDorado 231580 -                 2-4 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid
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Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420704 Due: 01/12/2021

1 610068 53.86                       53.86 

ElDorado 231580 -                 2 Weeks 

5 610072 35.04            35.04     35.90            DQ            39.99            45.54          42.67 

Area Diesel Service 

231575 -                Stock Stock

Not an 

approved 

OEM.  21 Days 

 1 Stock 

Balance 2-3 

Weeks  Stock 

5 610081 34.70            87.14     34.70       86.16            DQ          100.99       104.91  DQ 

CBM 231577 -                Stock Stock Stock

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  21 Days  6 Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM. 

4 2510067 918.50                   918.50    961.26         929.11       976.87 

Gillig 231582 -                 2 Weeks  Stock  7-10 Days  7 Weeks 

1 1510153 5.00                            5.00 

ElDorado 231580 -                 1 Week 

7 410080 268.62                   300.00          275.00     272.85  DQ          268.62       298.17       362.76       353.26 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  Stock  14 Days 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock 

 6 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  60 Days  Stock 

5 610088 35.72            104.86   37.10       103.68          DQ            35.72          60.43  DQ 

Muncie 231586

Did Not Award - 

Need to Confirm 

OEM Part Number -                Stock Stock Stock

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM. 

1 610089 10,000.00        10,000.00 

ElDorado 231580 OUT OF STOCK -                 Stock 

6 610097 234.97          269.29              245.00          239.25       258.75       306.00      234.97 

Transit Parts 101 

231589 -                

 2-3 

Weeks 

 2 Stock 

Balance 2-4 

Weeks 

 6 Stock 

Only  Stock  60 Days  2 Weeks 

1 610102 1,177.79            1,177.79 

ElDorado 231580 -                 4 Weeks 

2 2510117 538.10                   538.10       654.95 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  Stock 

5 410091 869.38                974.88          871.53         869.38    1,014.79    1,249.90 

Neopart 231587 -                 Feb 8th  30 Days  2-3 Weeks  6 Weeks  60 Days 

2 2910036 72.90                       72.90          75.28 

Muncie 231586 -                 Stock  5 Weeks 

3 610121 70.61            76.48     70.61                 127.23 

Coffman Truck Sales 

231579 -                Stock Stock  4 Weeks 

1 410102 89.41             DQ          89.41 

NFI Parts 231588 -                

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock 

1 1510227 172.75                   172.75 

ElDorado 231580 -                 4 Weeks 

1 1510273 197.76                   197.76 

ElDorado 231580 -                 4 Weeks 

1 1510274 81.31                       81.31 

ElDorado 231580 -                 2 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 
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Diesel 
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Parts and 

Sound

Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts
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Central

Interstat

e Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420704 Due: 01/12/2021

1 1510275 37.44                       37.44 

ElDorado 231580 -                 2 Weeks 

1 1510276 17.18                       17.18 

ElDorado 231580 -                 2 Weeks 

1 1510277 492.90                   492.90 

ElDorado 231580 -                 2-4 Weeks 

1 2910057 8.97                         8.97 

NFI Parts 231588 -                 Stock 

1 2910058 17.93                     17.93 

NFI Parts 231588 -                 Stock 

1 410118 145.51          DQ  DQ       145.51 

NFI Parts 231588 -                

 Not an 

approved 

OEM 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock 

1 410119 145.51          DQ  DQ       145.51 

NFI Parts 231588 -                

 Not an 

approved 

OEM 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock 

5 2910059 62.89                       83.55       66.00            62.89          63.50          66.77 

Neopart 231587 -                 4 Weeks  14 Days  2-3 Weeks  9 Weeks  60 Days 


