Pace RFQ# 420702
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ! ' ! | | | '/ [ | | | | [ | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle  |Rome Truck| Neopart | Suburban | CBMUS | MW Bus - Gillig Coffman | Kirks Auto -| Hydraulic Transit Eldorado Prevost |Area Diesel | Aftermarket | Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance | NO BID Truck NO BID Truck NO BID Electric | Parts 101 Parts Transit
NO # of Bids
6 80883 1.51 15.75 1.51 20.58 18.29 1.53 16.00
Hydraulic Electric 231606 - stock stock 60d stock stock 21d
1 81055 132.29 132.29
Eldorado 231600 - 6w
4 81311 89.05 89.05 92.74 112.23 105.99
Coffman Truck 231605 - stock stock 5w 21d
2 80971 37.75 37.75 51.54
Eldorado 231600 stock 7w
6 81066 41.99 80.75 98.88 96.74 74.52 42.84 41.99
Muncie Transit 231611 - stock stock stock stock stock stock
7 81298 48.25 48.25 58.76 63.45 74.45 60.18 64.92 66.06
CBM US 231609 - stock stock stock stock stock stock stock
8 81313 35.38 86.10 35.38 71.57 86.00 84.73 76.61 42.00 44.00
unapproved unapproved
CBM US 231609 - part stock stock 60d stock stock part stock
4 81347 4.22 4.30 4.22 6.65 5.15
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock stock 21d
4 81377 2.81 2.86 2.81 3.50 3.40
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 5w 21d
4 81378 18.89 75.55 34.11 18.89 22.41
5only,
Mohawk 231607 stock stock stock need 15
6 81402 10.26 10.26 26.42 25.99 33.75 33.25 30.60
Neopart 231597 stock stock stock stock 4w stock
1 81412 27.00 27.00
Eldorado 231600 stock
1 81423 43.15 43.15




Pace RFQ# 420702
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
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Sku Winning bid Vehicle  |Rome Truck| Neopart | Suburban | CBMUS | MW Bus - Gillig Coffman | Kirks Auto -| Hydraulic Transit Eldorado Prevost |Area Diesel | Aftermarket | Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance | NO BID Truck NO BID Truck NO BID Electric | Parts 101 Parts Transit
NO # of Bids
Eldorado 231600 stock
5 81430 282.55 287.29 282.55 358.30 368.58 341.00
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock Sw 3w 21d
1 81432 2,041.15 2,041.15
Eldorado 231600 6w
5 81431 750.00 811.39 850.00 750.00 1,359.23 1,285.00
Area Diesel 231604 stock 14d stock Sw 21d
6 81441 42.78 43.50 78.03 42.78 51.44 52.33 43.40
Area Diesel 231604 - stock 60d stock stock 3w stock
5 81444 57.00 71.00 101.43 76.50 57.00 75.56
Mohawk 231607 - stock stock stock stock stock
4 81518 5.29 5.83 5.29 7.11 6.40
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock stock 21d
2 81534 37.50 57.21 37.50
Aftermarket Parts 231608 - 6w 6w
1 810000 37.75 37.75
Eldorado 231600 - stock
4 810019 233.14 250.22 233.14 309.53 282.07
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock stock 21d
4 810026 920.14 989.68 920.14 1,236.55 1,113.27
Availability - Coffman no lead
Truck 231605 - stock time given 4w 120d
4 810027 507.88 516.41 507.88 585.68 615.00
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock stock 21d
6 810030 1.47 2.39 4.40 2.35 2.90 1.47 2.70
unapproved
Area Diesel 231604 - stock 60d stock stock part 21d
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Sku Winning bid Vehicle  |Rome Truck| Neopart | Suburban | CBMUS | MW Bus - Gillig Coffman | Kirks Auto -| Hydraulic Transit Eldorado Prevost |Area Diesel | Aftermarket | Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance | NO BID Truck NO BID Truck NO BID Electric | Parts 101 Parts Transit

NO # of Bids

6 810031 1.81 8.05 14.44 7.92 9.60 1.81 9.00

unapproved

Area Diesel 231604 - stock 60d stock 4w part 21d

4 810035 112.92 114.81 112.92 151.74 136.36
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 7w 21d

6 810046 360.00 387.30 360.00 741.93 380.91 555.33 379.76
Hydraulic Electric 231606 - stock 14d 60d stock 4w stock

2 810050 117.61 117.61 124.61
Transit Parts 101 231610 - 3w 12w

4 810060 34.30 36.57 35.97 48.33 34.30
Muncie Transit 231611 - stock stock stock 21d

4 810064 2,539.63 3,076.41 2,539.63 5,301.87 4,600.00
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 7w 21d

5 810073 100.00 108.67 100.00 106.87 143.63 100.00
Hydraulic Electric 231606 - stock 14d stock 7w 60d

7 810078 355.00 401.41 355.00 800.68 396.84 539.91 635.70 470.00
Hydraulic Electric 231606 - stock 14d 60d stock 5w 4w 21d

5 810079 355.00 401.41 355.00 396.84 634.93 399.30
Hydraulic Electric 231606 - stock 14d stock 7w stock

3 810083 55.33 61.90 55.33 74.34
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 6w

5 810084 645.00 645.00 764.99 645.71 1,246.46 690.94
Availability for TOTAL
of 31-Area Diesel 231604 - 4w stock stock 6w 12d

1 810090 54.61 54.61
Aftermarket Parts 231604 - 8w

4 810101 211.42 211.42 254.76 273.68 230.00
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WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
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Sku Winning bid Vehicle  |Rome Truck| Neopart | Suburban | CBMUS | MW Bus - Gillig Coffman | Kirks Auto -| Hydraulic Transit Eldorado Prevost |Area Diesel | Aftermarket | Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance | . NQO BID Truck NO BID Truck NO BID Electric | Parts 101 Parts Transit
NO # of Bids
Coffman Truck 231605 - stock 6w 5w 45d
4 810102 3.00 3.00 3.13 3.73 3.83
Coffman Truck 231605 - stock stock 5w 5w
3 810110 335.37 335.37 750.00 357.93
Coffman Truck 231605 - stock stock stock
3 810112 4.34 4.41 4.34 5.43
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 6w
5 810123 53.81 54.71 53.81 68.23 70.21 56.86
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock Sw 4w 45d
5 810125 42.00 80.47 99.41 91.49 122.95 42.00
unapproved
Neopart 231597 - stock stock stock 7w part
3 810127 50.82 51.67 50.82 65.87
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock Sw
3 810128 585.68 585.68 609.88 771.81
Coffman Truck 231605 - stock stock stock
3 810130 380.91 387.30 380.91 613.49
Availability - Coffman no lead
Truck 231605 - stock time given 5w
4 810132 110.12 111.97 110.12 142.60 142.47
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 8w 7w
5 810141 25.00 60.99 59.97 72.83 25.00 52.64
unapproved
Muncie Transit 231611 - stock stock 3w part stock
4 810154 8.07 8.20 8.07 10.84 9.61
unapproved
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 8w part
3 810157 56.82 57.77 56.82 73.27
Availability - Coffman no lead
Truck 231605 - stock time given stock
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Maintenance | . NQO BID Truck NO BID Truck NO BID Electric | Parts 101 Parts Transit
NO # of Bids
2 810165 1,090.83 1,092.00 1,090.83
Availability -
Eldorado 231600 - stock 11w
2 810166 9.61 48.55 9.61
unapproved
Eldorado 231600 - stock part
3 810180 6.04 6.14 6.04 7.99
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock stock
3 810183 1,194.11 1,194.11 1,308.41 1,494.58
no lead
Coffman Truck 231605 - stock time given 5w
4 810189 33.86 41.18 36.80 47.71 33.86
unapproved
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 5w part
1 810215 21.50 21.50
Eldorado 231600 - stock
4 810216 4.11 4.11 4.30 4.23 5.48
Vehicle Maintenance 231596 - stock stock stock Sw
3 810220 403.97 410.75 403.97 582.34
no lead
Coffman Truck 231605 - stock time given 5w
3 810223 401.19 407.93 401.19 539.15
no lead
Coffman Truck 231605 - stock time given 8w
3 810225 625.55 670.02 625.55 783.33
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 7w
3 810229 13.14 13.36 13.14 20.69
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock 7w
3 810230 3.03 3.42 3.03 4.06
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock Sw
3 810231 213.62 230.45 213.62 292.44




Pace RFQ# 420702
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ' ! ' ' [ . [ | | | ' | | | | | [
Sku Winning bid Vehicle  |Rome Truck| Neopart | Suburban | CBMUS | MW Bus - Gillig Coffman | Kirks Auto -| Hydraulic Transit Eldorado Prevost |Area Diesel | Aftermarket | Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance | NO BID Truck NO BID Truck NO BID Electric | Parts 101 Parts Transit
NO # of Bids
no lead

Coffman Truck 231605 - stock time given stock

810241 3.12 3.17 3.12 4.09
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock stock

810250 52.50 52.50 54.66 69.38
Coffman Truck 231605 - 5d stock 8w

810251 650.00 726.74 650.00 679.76 881.26
Hydraulic Electric 231606 - 5d 14d stock 5w

810254 3.98 4.04 3.98 5.84
Area Diesel 231604 - stock stock Sw

810297 262.42 266.83 262.42 352.66
Area Diesel 231604 - 5d stock 8w

810308 318.00 333.51 318.00 365.20 403.39
Hydraulic Electric 231606 - stock 14d stock 6w
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