
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G KEENE NEOPART GENFARE GILLIG MIDWEST 

BUS
JANEK 
CORP

KIRK'S HYDRAULIC 
ELECTRIC

GLOBAL 
PETROLEUM

LUMINATOR FILTER 
SERVICES

RILCO TRANSLITE ENT. TRANSIT 
PARTS 101

AREA DIESEL THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO.

PREVOST MUNCIE MOHAWK ELDORADO

                                   2 160605 18.88                                       18.88 19.45              
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 S S

                                   1 220335 37.75            37.75                

ELDORADO 231593 -                S

                                   3 620025 0.99                              0.99                              1.20 1.10                

GENFARE 231561 -                 45 D  8 W 30 D

                                   5 620055 4.00                              4.03             4.00                              5.14 4.50                5.65             

JANEK CORP. 231564  45 D  S  9 W 30 D 30 D

                                   4 200522 16.25                             25.56                            23.47 17.00              16.25           

MOHAWK 231581 -                 4 W  5 W 60 D S

                                   3 160356 35.46                                       35.46 50.92             45.79              
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 S S 35 D

                                   1 160590 12.91            12.91                

ELDORADO 231593 -                S

                                   4 160600 9.38                             9.50                              9.40 13.55             9.38                

MUNCIE 231574 -                 S  S 60 D 30 D

                                   3 210999 2.93                                           2.93 3.40                3.44             
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 S 21 D  3 W 

                                   6 220336 195.20                    200.75         211.25                          202.60 246.65           195.20            307.78              

MUNCIE 231574  4 W 7 D  S S 90 D S

                                   4 160787 102.45                                   141.71 122.20           102.45            183.55              

MUNCIE 231574  S 60 D S S

                                   5 170620 4.70                             8.99                              9.93 10.39             8.80                4.70             

MUNCIE 231574  S  S 60 D S

 S - OEM# 
NOT PACE 
APPROVED 

                                   2 910103 1.19                                   1.23                   1.19 

RILCO 231559  S  S 

                                   6 200611 43.45                          107.81             43.99                          112.54 105.89           109.83            43.45           

MOHAWK 231581 -                 4 W  S  S S S S

Pace RFQ# 420699 - 420714 CD



NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G KEENE NEOPART GENFARE GILLIG MIDWEST 

BUS
JANEK 
CORP

KIRK'S HYDRAULIC 
ELECTRIC

GLOBAL 
PETROLEUM

LUMINATOR FILTER 
SERVICES

RILCO TRANSLITE ENT. TRANSIT 
PARTS 101

AREA DIESEL THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO.

PREVOST MUNCIE MOHAWK ELDORADO

                                   3 160596 169.98                    170.00                          169.98 175.00            
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572  S  S 30 D

                                   4 170615 203.23                                   205.07 243.03           203.23            220.45              

MUNCIE 231574  S 60 D 42 D S

                                   2 210976 19.70            19.70           53.95                

MOHAWK 231581 -                S S

                                   2 910090 1.22                                   1.23                   1.22 

RILCO 231559 -                 S  S 

                                   6 620058 15.50                          27.13           15.50                    22.00                            22.55 30.79              27.25           

JANEK CORP. 231564 -                 45 D  S  S  S 30 D 30 D

                                   4 620092 23.00                               23.00                            68.56 65.70              23.20           

HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC 231566 -                 14 D  S 30 D S

                                   4 200506 1.08                                           3.44 2.99                1.08             6.43                  

MOHAWK 231581 -                 S 21 D S 12 W

                                   4 180661 47.46                        47.50                            47.46 112.13           195.50         
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 S  S S 21 D

                                   6 200919 20.49                               20.49                            23.45 23.90             20.49              20.64           32.35                

AVAIL./HYDRAULIC 
ELECTRIC 231566 -                 14 D  8 W 60 D 60 D

 S - OEM# 
NOT PACE 
APPROVED S

                                   6 200919 20.49                               20.49                            23.45 23.90             20.49              20.64           32.35                

AVAIL./HYDRAULIC 
ELECTRIC 231566 -                 14 D  8 W 60 D 60 D

 S - OEM# 
NOT PACE 
APPROVED S

                                   2 211046 171.19                                   171.19 259.15              
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 11 W S

                                   4 200949 810.00                     810.00                875.00                      1,201.68 1,095.55        

KIRK'S 231565 -                 S  10 D  8 W 30 D

                                   3 220390 745.90                    800.54                          883.13 745.90            

MUNCIE 231574 -                 S  S S

                                   1 220391 2,341.45      2,341.45          

ELDORADO 231593 -                12 W

                                   2 160894 0.33                             0.37 0.33               

PREVOST 231573 -                 S 60 D



NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G KEENE NEOPART GENFARE GILLIG MIDWEST 

BUS
JANEK 
CORP

KIRK'S HYDRAULIC 
ELECTRIC

GLOBAL 
PETROLEUM

LUMINATOR FILTER 
SERVICES

RILCO TRANSLITE ENT. TRANSIT 
PARTS 101

AREA DIESEL THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO.

PREVOST MUNCIE MOHAWK ELDORADO

                                   3 160913 36.22                        36.22                            39.77 37.65              

GILLIG 231562 -                 S  S 30 D

                                   4 160915 81.07                        81.07                            89.02 105.79           83.25              

GILLIG 231562 -                 6 W  S 90 D 30 D

                                   4 170715 620.48                                   620.48 740.95           652.00            621.88              
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 S 60 D 30 D S

                                   2 170716 650.00                    650.00 843.32              

GILLIG 231562 -                 4 W 12 W

                                   2 211124 3.00                                  3.00                            21.28 

FILTER SERVICES 231567 -                 14 D  5 W 

                                   6 220419 3.73                                 4.44                4.10              3.82                              4.18 5.16               3.73                
AVAIL./MIDWEST 
BUS 231563 -                 3 W  12 W  7 D  9 W 90 D 60 D

                                   5 170718 54.59                        75.00                            54.59 66.58             55.65              75.55                
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 4 W  S 60 D 21 D 6 W

                                   3 1710006 243.35                             243.35 339.26            2,500.00          

TRANSLITE ENT. 231568 -                 8 W 21 D 16 W

                                   5 1710014 18.80                        20.49                            20.58 21.64             18.80              43.15                

MUNCIE 231574 -                 S  S 60 D 21 D 12 W

                                   4 1710015 17.99                        17.99                            32.41 41.77             40.03                

GILLIG 231562 -                 4 W  5 W 60 D 12 W

                                   5 1810001 400.00                    400.00                          445.17 514.29           505.00            686.26         

GILLIG 231562  S  4 W 75 D 2 STK 2 W

                                   7 2010004 16.15                             30.31             35.50                            30.32 26.12             28.44              30.51           16.15                

ELDORADO 231593 -                 4 W  4 W  5 W 60 D 30 D 30 D S

                                   7 2010016 97.15                          152.14           185.00                          168.85 170.56           159.75            189.00         97.15                

ELDORADO 231593 -                 S  4 W  5 W S 30 D 30 D S

                                   3 1810016 390.00                    390.00                          393.55 467.43           

GILLIG 231562 -                 2 W  S 75 D

                                   6 2010021 32.20                          162.33           160.00                          183.86 146.26           169.65            32.20           

PREVOST 231573 -                 4 W  2 W  5 W S 30 D

 S - OEM# 
NOT PACE 
APPROVED 



NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G KEENE NEOPART GENFARE GILLIG MIDWEST 

BUS
JANEK 
CORP

KIRK'S HYDRAULIC 
ELECTRIC

GLOBAL 
PETROLEUM

LUMINATOR FILTER 
SERVICES

RILCO TRANSLITE ENT. TRANSIT 
PARTS 101

AREA DIESEL THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO.

PREVOST MUNCIE MOHAWK ELDORADO

                                   5 2210004 1,871.63             3,450.00                      3,404.24 4,246.76       3,545.00        1,871.63          

ELDORADO 231593 -                 6 W  7 W 120 D 165 D 12 W

                                   4 2210005 1,894.90             1,925.00                      1,942.83 2,314.00       1,894.90        
AVAIL./THE 
AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 6 W  2 W 60 D 165 D

                                   5 2110019 255.00                    272.50         255.00                          264.69 313.00            267.00         

MIDWEST BUS 231563 -                 S  7 D  S 14 D 2 W

                                   4 2110037 320.00                         320.00                      1,556.09 1,645.11        526.85         

P&G KEENE 231560 -                 S  9 W 14 D 3 W

                                   5 2110038 165.00                    210.00         165.00                          204.38 244.77            222.10         

MIDWEST BUS 231563 -                 S  7 D  S 21 D 2 W

                                   2 6210025 1.93                              1.93                              2.56 

GENFARE 231561 -                 45 D  5 W 

                                   6 2010037 422.55                        483.75                          565.36 422.55           503.22            459.89         496.75              

PREVOST 231573 -                 4 W  5 W 60 D 30 D 2 W S

                                   1 1810033 44.37            44.37                

ELDORADO 231593 -                S

                                   5 2010041 550.00                     550.00             2,000.00                      3,074.78 2,585.90        1,553.58     

KIRK'S 231565 -                 S  10 D  S 21 D

 2 W - OEM# 
NOT PACE 
APPROVED 

                                   4 1810036 96.00                      103.75                    96.00                          113.97 133.78           

HYDRAULIC ELECTRIC 231566 -                 6 W  S  16 W 75 D

                                   3 6210054 133.20                      133.20                          172.33 149.66            

GENFARE 231561 -                 45 D  10 W 30 D

                                   1 1610078 110.00                    110.00 

GILLIG 231562 -                 8 W 

                                   4 2110070 27.73                      98.00                            63.25 27.73           47.81                

MOHAWK 231581 -                 14 D  6 W 2 W S

                                   2 2110071 102.33                                   102.33 105.55            
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 7 W 14 D

                                   3 1810037 444.94                    445.78                          444.94 550.85           
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 8 W  4 W 75 D

                                   3 1810038 51.99                        51.99                            52.81 59.79             



NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G KEENE NEOPART GENFARE GILLIG MIDWEST 

BUS
JANEK 
CORP

KIRK'S HYDRAULIC 
ELECTRIC

GLOBAL 
PETROLEUM

LUMINATOR FILTER 
SERVICES

RILCO TRANSLITE ENT. TRANSIT 
PARTS 101

AREA DIESEL THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO.

PREVOST MUNCIE MOHAWK ELDORADO

GILLIG 231562 -                 6 W  2 W 90 D



NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G KEENE NEOPART GENFARE GILLIG MIDWEST 

BUS
JANEK 
CORP

KIRK'S HYDRAULIC 
ELECTRIC

GLOBAL 
PETROLEUM

LUMINATOR FILTER 
SERVICES

RILCO TRANSLITE ENT. TRANSIT 
PARTS 101

AREA DIESEL THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO.

PREVOST MUNCIE MOHAWK ELDORADO

                                   4 6710005 33.75                        33.75                35.00                            47.96 50.94                

GILLIG 231562 -                 4 W  S 6 W

                                   1 1610089 198.90                    198.90 

GILLIG 231562 -                 8 W 

                                   1 2110082 46.69            46.69                

ELDORADO 231593 -                S

                                   6 2210028 288.00                    310.00         295.00                          304.73 410.70           288.00            607.49              

MUNCIE 231574 -                 6 W  10 W  10 W 90 D 90 D 12 W

                                   6 2210030 124.52                    190.00         185.00                          182.40 220.20           178.99            124.52              

ELDORADO 231593 -                 6 W  8 W  10 W 90 D 60 D 12 W

                                   1 1610096 85.00                        85.00 

GILLIG 231562 -                 6 W 

                                   1 1810053 170.67                    170.67 

GILLIG 231562 -                 6 W 

                                   1 1810054 170.67                    170.67 

GILLIG 231562 -                 6 W 

                                   2 1610126 5.80                             6.99                              5.80 
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 6 W  S 

                                   2 1610127 52.50                        52.50 59.10              

GILLIG 231562 -                 6 W 70 D

                                   1 1610128 5.50                             5.50 

GILLIG 231562 -                 6 W 

                                    - 1610129 -                

NO BID -                

                                   2 2010064 103.55                     103.55 120.10              

TRANSIT PARTS 101 231569 -                 2 W 12 W

                                   3 1710086 207.98                             207.98                          245.84 371.66            

TRANSLITE ENT. 231568 -                 S  3 W 30 D

                                   1 2110142 21.89                                       21.89 
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 9 W 

                                   2 1810077 632.00                    632.00                          638.53 

GILLIG 231562 -                 6 W  11 W 



NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid P&G KEENE NEOPART GENFARE GILLIG MIDWEST 

BUS
JANEK 
CORP

KIRK'S HYDRAULIC 
ELECTRIC

GLOBAL 
PETROLEUM

LUMINATOR FILTER 
SERVICES

RILCO TRANSLITE ENT. TRANSIT 
PARTS 101

AREA DIESEL THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO.

PREVOST MUNCIE MOHAWK ELDORADO

                                   3 1710088 114.04                    120.00                          114.04 119.08            
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. 231572 -                 6 W  S 21 D

                                   3 1610160 65.29                        92.25                            77.83 65.29              

MUNCIE 231574 -                 4 W  10 W S

                                   1 1610161 69.46                        69.46 

GILLIG 231562 -                 4 W 

                                   2 2010065 22.48                              22.48 24.80              

AREA DIESEL 231570 -                 S 30 D

                                   3 2010068 9.89                                  9.89                            12.20 11.17              

AREA DIESEL 231570 -                 7 W 30 D

                                   4 2010079 2,500.00              2,653.00             2,500.00                      3,163.85 2,985.00        

AREA DIESEL 231570 -                 S  10 D  8 W 30 D

                                   1 1610175 220.00                    220.00 

GILLIG 231562 -                 6 W 

                                    - 170623 -                

NO BID -                

                                    - 1610172 -                

NO BID -                

                                   1 2110170 44.68                                       44.68 
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. -                 14 W 

                                   1 2110171 38.70                                       38.70 
THE AFTERMARKET 
PARTS CO. -                 9 W 


