
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

CBM USA MW Bus Kirk's Auto Prevost Rex Sales Area Diesel Rush Truck Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie 
Transit

Mohawk Eldorado

                                    7 130628 1.80                          3.45             2.02             2.98             3.04             4.33 3.32           1.80           

MW Bus 231523 -                 stock  5d  5d  stock  stock stock
 unapproved 

part 

                                    8 81080 9.50                        13.87           20.49           22.27           20.15           25.00           26.77 23.78         9.50           

Vehicle Maintenance 231511 -                 stock  stock  5d  stock  14d  8w 21d
 unapproved 

part 

                                    1 110135 32.35                      32.35 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                    6 130615 0.99                          1.15             0.99             1.01             1.49 1.11           1.14           

Rush Truck 231525  stock  5d  stock  stock 30d stock

                                    3 110100 2.25                          2.25             2.45 3.40           

Gillig 231519 -                 stock  stock stock

                                 10 110136 68.89                      68.89           69.58           74.88         129.35           73.89           73.88           98.20 79.62         140.00               113.44 

Vehicle Maintenance 231511 -                 stock  stock  stock  60d  5d  5d  7w  30d 30d  stock 

                                 10 110136 68.89                      68.89           69.58           74.88         129.35           73.89           73.88           98.20 79.62         140.00               113.44 

Vehicle Maintenance 231511 -                 stock  stock  stock  60d  5d  5d  7w 30d 30d  stock 

                                    9 130618 213.69                  259.59         335.00         213.69         228.35         235.00         228.00         306.21 249.16       236.44       

Rush Truck 231525 -                 stock  5d  5d  stock  stock  14d  stock stock stock

                                    8 81313 35.38                      35.38           86.00           84.73           61.64           82.90           77.05 44.00         42.00         

CBM USA 231514 -                 stock  60d  stock 
 unapproved 

part  5d  stock stock
 unapproved 

part 

                                    5 81376 1.54                          1.56             1.71             1.54             1.96 1.82           

Coffman Truck 231526  stock  5d  stock  5w 21d

                                    4 81378 18.89                      34.22 22.41         18.89                   75.55 

Mohawk 231521  stock 30d stock  stock 

                                    7 81431 740.00                  975.00         900.00         867.37     1,032.28         740.00     1,369.40 1,228.03   

Hydraulic Electric 231518  stock  stock 
 no lead 

time given  stock  14d  5w 21d

                                    7 81441 40.00                      42.80           46.51           41.86           40.00           51.52 43.40         55.38         

Hydraulic Electric 231518  stock 
 no lead 

time given  stock  stock  stock 30d
 unapproved 

part 

                                    6 81444 57.00                      72.08         101.43           71.25           76.50 75.55         57.00         

Pace RFQ# 420666



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

CBM USA MW Bus Kirk's Auto Prevost Rex Sales Area Diesel Rush Truck Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie 
Transit

Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420666

Mohawk 231521 -                 4w  stock  stock  stock stock stock

                                    2 81472 3.99                          4.19 3.99           

Muncie Transit 231520  stock 30d

                                    5 110152 130.00                  195.80         217.17         208.83         130.00 221.68       

Hydraulic Electric 231518  stock  stock  stock  14d  21d 

                                    7 81516 8.28                          9.00             8.28             9.15             8.72             9.96 9.70           11.84         

Area Diesel 231517 -                 stock  stock  5d  stock  stock  21d 4w

                                    9 81533 11.19                      25.87           12.89           76.10           41.81           24.90           40.68           26.61 12.67         11.19         

Mohawk 231521 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  10d  stock  stock  stock 1w

                                    3 81534 33.25                      33.25 38.00                   57.21 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 stock 21d  stock 

                                    5 810007 421.15                  523.00         437.43         443.57 588.11               421.15 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock  6w  26w 21d  stock 

                                    1 1210006 101.61                  101.61 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                    3 1010002 3.75                          6.50             3.75             3.75 

Hydraulic Electric 231518 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 1010005 279.18                  279.18 

Eldorado 231522 -                 8w 

                                    5 810026 859.71                  859.71         990.63         952.63     1,071.71 1,061.16   

Area Diesel 231517 -                 stock  5d  stock  4w 21d

                                    5 810027 481.91                  481.91         552.10         486.37         585.68 584.23       

Area Diesel 231517 -                 stock  5d  stock  stock 30d

                                    9 1010014 3.75                          3.75           14.04             4.75             7.67             8.33             7.46             9.23 8.94           4.92           

Kirks Auto 231524 -                 stock  60d  stock  stock  5d  stock  stock 21d
 unapproved 

part 

                                    8 1010015 867.41              1,236.60         923.00     1,295.00         867.41     1,191.89         937.14 1,148.83   1,048.90   

Area Diesel 231517 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  5d  stock 30d stock



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

CBM USA MW Bus Kirk's Auto Prevost Rex Sales Area Diesel Rush Truck Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie 
Transit

Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420666

                                    5 1010016 2,110.61          2,110.61     2,382.07     2,116.99     2,936.97 2,568.45   

Area Diesel 231517 -                 stock  5d  stock  7w 21d

                                    5 1010018 12.67                      12.67           36.07           19.99           21.06 17.50         

Muncie Transit 231520 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock stock

                                    2 1210022 124.15                  350.87         124.15 

Eldorado 231522 -                 13w  stock 

                                    3 810050 105.69                  209.29 141.75               105.69 

Eldorado 231522 -                 7w 30d  6w 

                                    3 810051 117.33                  212.50 147.45               117.33 

Eldorado 231522 -                 4w  30d  6w 

                                    7 810065 9.66                        10.87           45.09           12.07           43.88           55.53 49.55         9.66           

CBM USA 231514 -                 stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock  5w 21d
 unapproved 

part 

                                    6 810066 93.00                      95.82         162.73           93.00         168.43 140.00       104.83       

Hydraulic Electric 231518 -                 stock  stock  stock  6w 75d
 unapproved 

part 

                                    6 810070 854.59                  854.59         861.90         855.00     1,042.86 1,019.45   1,155.31   

Area Diesel 231517 -                 stock  stock  14d  7w 30d 3w

                                    7 810078 350.00                  737.15         359.19         368.00         350.00         546.13 449.95       576.84       

Hydraulic Electric 231518 -                 60d  stock  stock  14d  5w  21d 3w

                                    5 810079 359.19                  359.19         368.00         360.00         555.18 399.30       

Area Diesel 231517 -                 stock  stock  14d  7w  60d 

                                    5 1010025 5.91                          8.02             8.08           10.53 9.70           5.91           

Area Diesel 231517 -                 stock  stock  stock stock
 unapproved 

part 

                                    4 810082 31.50                      34.07           31.50           41.46 37.25         

Coffman Truck 231526 -                 stock  stock  7w 21d

                                    6 1210038 1,959.17          1,959.17     1,969.69     1,976.86     1,960.00     2,960.09 2,195.85   

Neopart Transit 231512 -                 stock  stock  5d  14d  10w  90d 

                                    5 810093 19.81                      19.81           35.91           20.65           39.17 27.75         



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

CBM USA MW Bus Kirk's Auto Prevost Rex Sales Area Diesel Rush Truck Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie 
Transit

Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420666

Vehicle Maintenance 231511 -                 stock  stock  stock  7w 21d

                                    4 810110 335.37                  660.97         335.37         367.74 370.45       

Coffman Truck 231526 -                 stock  stock  stock 21d

                                    4 810130 370.69                  371.19         370.69         541.27 438.70       

Coffman Truck 231526 -                 stock  stock  5w 21d

                                    1 1210069 156.55                  156.55 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                    6 1210070 42.90                      50.75           45.47           42.90           56.78 57.55         50.96         

Hydraulic Electric 231518 -                 60d  stock  21d  6w 21d  4w 

                                    6 810208 0.16                          1.31             1.57             0.18             1.54 1.45           0.16           

Hydraulic Electric 231518 -                 stock  stock  stock  5w 21d
 unapproved 

part 

                                    4 810224 179.52                  179.52         192.30         239.32 213.82       

Area Diesel 231517 -                 stock  stock  7w 21d

                                    5 810225 550.00                  550.00         594.13         648.06         786.67 718.35       

Neopart Transit 231512 -                 stock  stock  stock  7w 21d

                                    4 1010067 178.49                  182.12         178.49         251.96 211.00       

Coffman Truck 231526 -                 stock  stock  8w 21d

                                    2 1010069 365.17                  512.95 365.17       
Availability - 
Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 stock 65d

                                    6 810271 36.30                      37.43           82.95           74.00           36.30           96.87 82.00         

Hydraulic Electric 231518 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  4w 21d

                                    2 1110004 69.69                      80.83 69.69         

Muncie Transit 231520 -                 3w 21d

                                    5 810277 23.27                      23.27           36.93           41.79 28.83         53.10         
Availability - Vehicle 
Maintenance 231511 -                 10d  stock  7w  90d 21d

                                    1 810281 187.34                  187.34 

Eldorado 231522 -                 6w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Interstate 

Power
Vehicle 

Maintenance
Neopart 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

CBM USA MW Bus Kirk's Auto Prevost Rex Sales Area Diesel Rush Truck Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Muncie 
Transit

Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420666

                                    1 1210130 599.35                    599.35 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                    1 1210134 509.38                  509.38 

Eldorado 231522 -                 6w 


	420666

