
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I-O 

Controls
Battery 
Service

P&G Keene Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

CBM USA MW Bus Rome 
Truck

Kirks Auto Rush Truck Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Area Diesel Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Muncie 
Transit

Mohawk Eldorado

                                   4 71733 77.80                      95.15           77.80 94.21         78.98         

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 60d  stock 4w MOQ

                                   5 70797 3.52                          3.85             6.27             3.82 23.75                     3.52 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 stock  60d  stock 2w
 unapproved 

part 

                                   8 72079 192.67                 197.26        192.67        209.00        227.00        258.28        224.01 195.99       215.05       

Neopart Transit 231512 -                 stock  stock  5d  stock  stock  stock stock stock

                                   4 72102 76.40                      98.55           88.40 76.40                124.15 

Muncie Transit 231520  5d  7w 30d  stock 

                                   4 72121 62.19                      66.76 62.19         62.40                   91.75 

Gillig 231519 -                 5w 4w MOQ  stock 

                                   4 72057 3.37                          3.37             4.05             3.61           11.62 

Vehicle Maintenance 231511 -                 stock  5d  stock  stock 

                                   5 70659 2.69                          2.69           12.09             4.20 12.62                     4.65 

CBM USA 231514 -                 stock  stock  stock MOQ  stock 

                                   4 70583 12.50                      12.98           12.50 15.14                   15.00 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 60d  stock 30d  9w 

                                   4 71100 0.07                          0.36             0.07 0.07                       0.07 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 stock  stock stock  stock 

                                   6 72135 56.91                      59.38           72.05           56.91 56.99         61.10                   97.15 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 7w  60d  4w 8w 45d  8w 

                                   3 71964 1.94                          1.94 4.75           4.34           

Aftermarket Parts 231516  stock stock stock

                                   5 72058 3.83                          4.20             5.10 16.99                     3.83           97.15 

Vehicle Maintenance 231511  stock  stock stock
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                   5 71091 0.07                          0.42             0.54             0.18 0.09                       0.07 

Mohawk 231521  5d  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                   4 72055 118.75                 163.05        147.23 134.35              118.75 

Eldorado 231522 -                 60d  stock 37d  stock 

    72094 14.91                      14.91           21.10           19.25           15.05           20.68 21.20                   23.89           26.95 

Vehicle Maintenance 231511  stock  stock  5d  stock  stock 30d  4w  stock 

Pace RFQ# 420665



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I-O 

Controls
Battery 
Service

P&G Keene Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

CBM USA MW Bus Rome 
Truck

Kirks Auto Rush Truck Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Area Diesel Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Muncie 
Transit

Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420665

                                   5 71442 5.59                          7.06 7.08           5.59                       6.85           26.95 

Muncie Transit 231520  stock  stock 30d  stock  stock 

                                   4 70211 10.80                      12.96 18.45                   10.80           37.75 

Mohawk 231521 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   5 72109 620.84              1,083.82     1,249.17 967.25       1,204.25          620.84 

Eldorado 231522 -                 12w  10w  4w 90d  stock 

                                   1 72144 26.95                      26.95 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                   4 72156 21.46                      21.49           26.45           21.46 22.22         

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 7w  60d  2w  45d 

                                   5 72162 29.04                      56.25           55.40 29.04                   32.92           32.35 

Muncie Transit 231520 -                 60d  6w stock  4w  stock 

                                   3 72184 4.57                          4.57 5.47                     11.83 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 stock stock  stock 

                                   1 72203 32.35                      32.35 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                   1 72224 205.64                 205.64 

Eldorado 231522 -                 4w 

                                   4 72227 8.80                          8.80           43.01 40.34                   21.55 

Prevost 231515 -                 stock  8w 30d  stock 

                                   5 72240 1,054.69          1,285.20     2,186.38     1,054.69     1,055.83 1,559.12   

Area Diesel 231517 -                
 no lead 

time given  5w  stock  7d  30d 

                                   3 72264 345.55                 568.96        752.45        345.55 

Eldorado 231522 -                 12w  13w  8w 

                                   5 72295 25.90                      42.60           41.64 25.90                   25.91           32.35 

Muncie Transit 231520 -                 60d  stock 30d  stock  stock 

                                   4 72301 221.00                 249.95        221.00        256.99        320.60 

Suburban Truck 231513 -                 4w  5d  3d  5w 

                                   4 72301 221.00                 269.95        221.00        256.99        320.60 

Suburban Truck 231513 -                 4w  5d  3d  5w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I-O 

Controls
Battery 
Service

P&G Keene Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

CBM USA MW Bus Rome 
Truck

Kirks Auto Rush Truck Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Area Diesel Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Muncie 
Transit

Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420665

                                   1 710008 167.51                 167.51 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                   1 710021 43.15                      43.15 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                   6 710026 450.00                 601.20        519.64 450.00       469.00              469.83        545.95 

Gillig 231519 -                 60d  6w 4w  21d  4w  stock 

                                   1 710032 156.81                 156.81 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 stock 

                                   2 710039 34.00                      34.48 34.00         

Muncie Transit 231521 -                 stock 30d

                                   4 710052 2,236.02          2,236.02     2,814.00 2,535.43       2,420.04 

P&G Keene 231510 -                 stock  stock 60d  12w 

                                   7 710057 44.00                      49.65           53.64           44.01           44.00           44.69 50.50                   57.58 

Hydraulic Electric 231518 -                 stock  stock  stock  14d  stock stock  4w 

                                   4 710115 28.28                      28.28           43.97           29.00           48.84 

Vehicle Maintenance 231511 -                 stcok  12w  14d  stock 

                                   4 710116 28.28                      28.28           29.89           29.00           48.84 

Vehicle Maintenance 231511 -                 stock  5w  14d  stock 

                                   1 710157 33.20                      33.20 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                   2 710177 7.39                          7.39 7.46           

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 stock stock

                                   3 710178 2.70                          4.99 2.70                       8.59 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 stock MOQ  6w 

                                   3 710180 6.00                          6.54 6.00                       9.34 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 stock MOQ  stock 

                                    - 710198 -                

-                

                                   2 710199 26.95                      64.46           26.95 

Eldorado 231522 -                 12w  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid I-O 

Controls
Battery 
Service

P&G Keene Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

CBM USA MW Bus Rome 
Truck

Kirks Auto Rush Truck Prevost Aftermarket 
Parts

Area Diesel Hydraulic 
Electric

Coffman 
Truck

Gillig Muncie 
Transit

Mohawk Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420665

                                   1 710223 150.93                 150.93 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                   4 710260 395.04                 395.04        485.01 400.00       438.99       

I/O Controls 231509 -                 12w  10w 4w  60d 

                                   1 710278 1,196.59          1,196.59 

Eldorado 231522 -                 6w 

                                   3 710292 19.99                      19.99 20.15                   32.35 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 5w  30d  stock 

                                   1 710314 6.99                          6.99 

Aftermarket Parts 231516 -                 6w 

                                   1 710321 376.19                 376.19 

Eldorado 231522 -                 stock 

                                   1 710342 1,103.59          1,103.59 

Eldorado 231522 -                 6w 

                                   1 710343 3,893.94          3,893.94 

Eldorado 231522 -                 6w 

                                    - 710344 -                

-                

                                    - 710345 -                

-                


	420665

