
Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Rush 

Truck 

Center 

of 

Illinois

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

4 290415 473.04                   473.51          473.04        515.15        590.00 

 No 

Bid 

Neopart 231434  Stock 

 3 Stock 

Balance 2-3 

Weeks  Stock  Stock 

4 40932 0.50                           0.50               1.52             1.59             2.30 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231433 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

2 30376 43.67                   185.00          43.67 

NFI Parts 231435 -                  Jan 21st  Stock 

5 290537 159.00                   159.55     159.00          159.63        167.83        207.20 

HECS 231431  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 41216 174.99                 210.00          185.00      175.00          428.50        174.99        263.70 

NFI Parts 231435 -                 Stock Stock  5 Days  1-2 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

6 40869 46.54                        49.88          51.89            75.21          51.60          59.90                46.54 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231436  6-8 Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 41217 81.61                   161.95          102.51          86.41          81.61        149.40 

NFI Parts 231435                     -    3 Weeks  6 Weeks  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

4 30361 7.52                           8.43               7.64             7.52          11.08 

NFI Parts 231435 -                  Stock 

 Must be 

ordered in 

multiples of 

8 Stock  Stock  Stock 

4 40162 0.32                           0.32               0.97             0.97             1.23 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231433 -                  Stock  2-3 Weeks 

 100 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks 

 7 Stock 

Balance 45 

days 

5 40090 0.48                             0.57             0.92               0.54             0.48             0.67 

NFI Parts 231435  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  45 Days 

4 41132 48.52                     48.52            86.77          96.05        109.56 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231433  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

1 151960 8.37                           8.37 

ElDorado 231428  Stock 

5 41240 81.80                        83.99          91.23            88.40          81.80        111.62 

NFI Parts 231435  Stock  Dec 13th  3-4 Weeks  Stock  60 Days 

1 30411 209.95                 209.95 

ElDorado 231428 -                  Stock 

3 151975 935.04             1,576.75        935.04    1,156.25 

NFI Parts 231435  4-6 Weeks  6 Weeks  60 Days 

RFQ 420631 Due: 12/03/2020



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk 

Manufaturi

ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Rush 

Truck 

Center 

of 

Illinois

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420631 Due: 12/03/2020

2 151976 952.48             1,619.95        952.48 

NFI Parts 231435  Stock 

 1 Pc 3 

Weeks 

Balance 6 

Weeks 

3 30421 114.80                 161.95          114.80        116.24 

Gillig 231429  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 41270 29.95                     68.73             29.95          49.30            31.69          35.27          38.81 

Gillig 231429 -                  2 Weeks  Stock  Dec 16th  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

6 41271 29.95                     68.73             29.95          49.30            31.69          35.27          38.81 

Gillig 231429 -                  2 Weeks  Stock  Dec 16th  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

5 41273 31.75                     43.15          37.95            31.75          32.47          38.48 

Neopart 231434 -                  2 Weeks  Dec 30th  Stock  Stock  75 Days 

4 290673 890.00             1,300.00          890.00        972.19    1,172.84 

Gillig 231429  4-5 Weeks  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks  90 Days 

1 290675 59.35                     59.35 

ElDorado 231428 -                  Stock 

1 250709 53.95                     53.95 

ElDorado 231428 -                  2 Weeks 

4 290679 53.00                        56.00       53.00          56.85          72.34 

HECS 231431   2-4 Weeks  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

2 60790 612.16                 776.95        612.16 

NFI Parts 231435 -                  4-6 Weeks  8 Weeks 

4 41292 851.05                   852.59        894.00          851.05        966.47 

Neopart 231434 -                  Stock  Dec 16th  3-4 Weeks  6 Weeks 

7 41332 243.25                 280.00          317.95      243.25        323.38          287.43        287.69        367.10 

Midwest Bus 231432 -                  Stock  2 Weeks  7 Days  Dec 23rd  Stock 

 12 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  Stock 

3 290700 161.48                 248.35        161.48        205.56 

ElDorado 231428 LOW STOCK -                  Stock  25 Weeks  120 Days 

1 30483 119.31                 119.31 

ElDorado 231428 -                  Stock 

1 110003 237.55                 237.55 

ElDorado 231428 -                  Stock 

3 2510000 313.55                   479.99          313.55        529.01 

Neopart 231434

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                  Stock  3-4 Weeks  Stock 

6 410003 157.36                 323.95          165.00        169.09          157.36        173.13        235.00 

Neopart 231434 -                  4 Weeks  4 Weeks 

 3 Stock 

Balance 

Dec 23rd  3-4 Weeks  6 Weeks  60 Days 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 
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of 
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Parts 101
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Program

RFQ 420631 Due: 12/03/2020

5 410006 143.46                 157.00          147.52  DQ          147.29        143.46        200.82 

NFI Parts 231435 -                  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 1-2 

Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

5 410009 102.33                 134.95          126.50        102.34        102.33        155.32 

Mohawk 

Manufacturing 

231433 -                  2 Weeks  6 Weeks  Stock  8 Weeks  60 Days 

2 1510007 18.23                     26.95          18.23 

NFI Parts 231435 -                  Stock  Stock 

1 210002 323.95                 323.95 

ElDorado 231428 -                  Stock 

1 110006 237.55                 237.55 

ElDorado 231428 -                  Stock 

1 610017 75.55                     75.55 

ElDorado 231428  2 Weeks 

9 610026 105.01          172.81   236.36     306.96             110.00           137.00  DQ          227.76        115.25        502.18              105.01 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 231436 -                  Stock 

 3 Stock 

Balance 

within 10 

Weeks  Stock  14 Days  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock  4 Weeks  60 Days  Stock 

1 110019 43.15                     43.15 

ElDorado 231428 -                  Stock 

5 610031 27.15            27.15      37.52       27.36                     36.57          33.02 

Area Diesel Service 

231425 -                 Stock Stock  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 

Dec 30th  Stock 

1 610035 14.18                     14.18 

NFI Parts 231435 -                  Stock 

5 410034 206.91                   206.91        224.73          208.12        222.44        303.91 

Gillig 231429 -                 

 5 Stock 

Balance 2 

Weeks  Dec 30th  3-4 Weeks 

 17 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks  60 Days 

3 610049 5.62               5.73        5.62                          7.69 

Coffman Truck Sales 

231427 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 610050 20.45            99.72      20.45                36.26          30.54          41.54 

CBM 231426 -                 Stock Stock  Dec 23rd  Stock  Stock 

4 610053 17.35            24.97      24.36                  17.35  DQ          32.12 

HECS 231431 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock 

1 310022 1.29                           1.29 

ElDorado 231428 -                  2 Weeks 

3 610055 36.80            36.97      36.80             DQ          47.61 

Coffman Truck Sales 

231427 -                  Stock Stock

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 
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Automotive 
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Truck 
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Power 
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Lift -U 
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ng

Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Rush 

Truck 

Center 

of 

Illinois

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420631 Due: 12/03/2020

1 1510107 18.85                     18.85 

ElDorado 231428 -                  1 Week 

1 110026 52.00                     52.00 

ElDorado 231428 -                  2-4 Weeks 

1 110027 1.06                           1.06 

ElDorado 231428 -                  1 Week 

1 610068 53.86                     53.86 

ElDorado 231428

SOUTH HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                  1 Week 

3 610069 485.35                   500.00      486.00        485.35 

NFI Parts 231435 -                  2-4 Weeks  10 Days  5-6 Weeks 

1 1510136 147.50                 147.50 

ElDorado 231428  2-3 Weeks 

1 1510137 147.50                 147.50 

ElDorado 231428 -                  2-3 Weeks 

1 1510140 453.44                 453.44 

ElDorado 231428 -                  4 Weeks 

6 410080 268.00                 280.00          275.00      268.00  DQ          282.46        280.23        362.76 

Midwest Bus 231432 -                  Stock  Stock  7 Days 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  60 Days 

3 210022 4.99                             4.99             5.36             5.95 

Neopart 231434 -                  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

4 210023 545.21                 612.13          545.21        553.81        627.85 

Neopart 231434 -                  Dec 30th  5-7 Weeks  9 Weeks  90 Days 

1 210024 59.60                     59.60 

ElDorado 231428 -                  4 Weeks 

1 1510267 62.00                     62.00 

ElDorado 231428 -                  4 Weeks 

1 1510268 142.17                 142.17 

ElDorado 231428 -                  4 Weeks 


