
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Diesel 
Emission

CBM USA Interstate 
Power

Eldorado Rome Truck - 
NO BID

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Gillig Kirk's Auto Area Diesel Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck

Transit 
Parts 101

Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Coffman 

                                  1 810311 2.50                         2.50 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 20w 

                                  1 810312 2.50                         2.50 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 20w 

                                  7 140057 21.37                    35.99          44.68          38.81          43.15          37.46 37.60                  21.37 

Mohawk 231449 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                  6 81083 4.89                         8.41          11.01            8.71 9.69                      4.89            8.24 

Coffman Truck 231442  stock  stock  stock 30d
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  4 81311 85.49                    92.48        112.53 101.00               85.49 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  5w 30d  stock 

                                  6 110085 12.50                    81.95        103.52 91.05         60.00                  12.50          86.02 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock  stock  21d 14d
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  4 81286 92.10                    92.10        116.11 102.00               96.48 

Area Diesel 231453 -                stock  4w 21d  stock 

                                  9 110136 69.58                    81.29          99.00          74.00        129.35          99.31          69.58 79.65                136.50          73.88 

Suburban Truck 231446 -                 14d  stock  stock  60d  7w  stock 30d  4w  5d 

                                  5 130477 0.05                         0.34            0.09 0.05           0.14                      0.08 

Muncie Transit 231445 -                 stock  stock stock 14d  stock 

                                  7 81298 48.25                    48.25          61.28          53.40          61.00 66.45                  66.50          56.64 

CBM USA 231451  stock  stock  stock  stock stock  stock  stock 

                                  8 81343 7.75                       12.78            7.75          23.01            9.59          29.70 25.15                    9.70          12.50 

Kirk's Auto 231452
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock  4w 30d
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  4 81351 439.98                439.98        691.69 527.50             441.54 

Area Diesel 231453  stock  8w 30d  stock 

                                  1 81366 70.15                    70.15 

Eldorado 231440 stock

                                  4 81377 2.73                         2.73            3.52 3.23                      2.76 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                  1 130782 86.35                    86.35 

Pace RFQ # 420624



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Diesel 
Emission

CBM USA Interstate 
Power

Eldorado Rome Truck - 
NO BID

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Gillig Kirk's Auto Area Diesel Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck

Transit 
Parts 101

Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Coffman 

Pace RFQ # 420624

Eldorado 231440 -                 stock 

                                  2 120526 415.85                425.00        415.85 
Availability - Triangle 
Radiator 231450 -                 3d  7w 

                                  5 81397 530.69                530.69        736.71 625.00             758.15        531.39 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock  5w 30d  4w  stock 

                                  6 100230 54.29                    54.29          78.38        114.71 85.05                  58.09          86.68 

Mohawk 231449 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock stock  stock  stock 

                                  6 100232 55.40                    57.02          86.29        128.14 109.00               55.40          95.43 

Mohawk 231449 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 100234 26.95                    26.95 

Eldorado 231440 -                 4w 

                                  1 140076 604.75                604.75 

Eldorado 231440 -                 stock 

                                  5 81431 740.00                750.00     1,153.75 1,230.05   740.00             776.97 

Hydraulic Electric 231448 -                 stock  7w 30d 14d  stock 

                                  6 81441 41.64                    42.50          51.96 43.40         44.00                  52.38          41.64 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  stock stock  14d  4w  stock 

                                  6 81444 57.00                    71.50        101.43          76.50          72.08 75.57                  57.00 

Mohawk 231449 -                 stock  stock  stock  4w stock  stock 

                                  5 81503 12.33                    19.37          22.82 22.35                  12.33          18.86 

Mohawk 231449 -                 stock  stock stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 110150 19.86                    20.10          25.43 22.30                  19.86 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  5w 21d  stock 

                                  4 81518 5.24                         5.24            6.21 6.07                      6.06 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock  stock 21d  stock 

                                  4 81529 117.61                129.59        175.57 138.24             117.61 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  7w 120d  stock 

                                  3 81534 33.25                    57.21          33.25 38.05         

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 1w  stock  21d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Diesel 
Emission

CBM USA Interstate 
Power

Eldorado Rome Truck - 
NO BID

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Gillig Kirk's Auto Area Diesel Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck

Transit 
Parts 101

Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Coffman 

Pace RFQ # 420624

                                  6 1110000 34.10                    37.40          42.00          34.10          49.97          37.40 44.50         

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 14d  stock 
 minimum 
order qty  stock 

 unapproved 
part 21d

                                  2 1410000 657.14                669.55        657.14 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 4w  11w 

                                  1 1010005 279.18                279.18 

Eldorado 231440 -                 stock 

                                  8 1010012 1,214.00          1,638.96     1,214.00     1,766.33     2,529.48     1,432.52 1,399.70       1,244.90     1,828.67 

Kirk's Auto 231452 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  5w  10d  30d  stock  stock 

                                  4 810026 858.69                858.69     1,071.71 1,061.16          895.47 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock  4w  21d  stock 

                                  4 810027 484.94                484.94        585.68 584.23             486.50 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock  stock 21d  stock 

                                  7 1010013 11.40                    12.50          28.11          32.82          15.12 30.77                  11.40          15.00 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  stock 21d
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  3 1210022 124.15                124.15        360.51        282.65 

Eldorado 231440 -                4w  13w  30d 

                                  4 810049 101.91                102.72        132.01 120.41             101.91 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  5w stock  stock 

                                  4 810050 114.57                122.44        211.75        114.57 141.82      

Transit Parts 101 231454 -                 6w  7w  30d 30d

                                  4 810051 119.59                133.00        214.92        119.59 147.77      

Transit Parts 101 231454 -                 4w  4w  30d 30d

                                  6 810065 9.66                       12.26          45.09          56.18 49.66                    9.66          43.88 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  5w 21d
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  4 810071 628.89                628.89     1,048.62 745.59             630.82 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock  7w 21d  stock 

                                  5 810073 100.00                102.39        124.48 102.50      100.00             103.00 

Hydraulic Electric 231448 -                 stock  stock 60d 14d  stock 

                                  7 810078 350.00                374.31        737.15        546.13 449.95      350.00             576.84        368.00 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Diesel 
Emission

CBM USA Interstate 
Power

Eldorado Rome Truck - 
NO BID

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Gillig Kirk's Auto Area Diesel Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck

Transit 
Parts 101

Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Coffman 

Pace RFQ # 420624

Hydraulic Electric 231448 -                 stock  60d  5w 21d  14d  2w  stock 

                                  9 1010032 70.00                    94.90        108.09        189.80        125.91          70.23 104.13      70.00                  75.55        105.76 

Hydraulic Electric 231448 -                 stock  stock  60d  stock  stock 45d  14d 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  5 810102 2.89                         3.10            3.75 3.42                      3.83            2.89 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  5w 21d  2w  stock 

                                  4 810130 367.21                371.35        545.47 438.72             367.21 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  5w 21d  stock 

                                  6 1210070 45.47                    50.75          57.67 57.43         48.00                  57.16          45.47 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 60d  stock stock 14d  3w  stock 

                                  1 1210074 599.35                599.35 

Eldorado 231440 -                 6w 

                                  1 810170 6.51                         6.51 

Eldorado 231440 -                 2w 

                                  4 810180 5.91                         6.01            7.66 6.93                      5.91 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  stock stock  stock 

                                  4 810181 2.30                         2.35            3.03 2.57                      2.30 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  6w  21d  stock 

                                  1 810198 563.57                563.57 

Eldorado 231440 -                 6w 

                                  4 810203 2,439.86          2,561.69     3,894.64 2,947.71       2,439.86 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  5w 21d  stock 

                                  4 810204 242.69                245.27        499.49 285.87             242.69 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  5w 21d  stock 

                                  4 810212 229.06                857.68 269.33      620.00             229.06 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock 21d 14d  stock 

                                  1 810215 21.50                    21.50 

Eldorado 231440 -                 stock 

                                  3 810220 391.58                584.12 457.86             391.58 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 5w 21d  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Triangle 
Radiator

Diesel 
Emission

CBM USA Interstate 
Power

Eldorado Rome Truck - 
NO BID

MW Bus - 
NO BID

Gillig Kirk's Auto Area Diesel Prevost Vehicle 
Maintenance

Aftermarket 
Parts

Suburban 
Truck

Transit 
Parts 101

Neopart 
Transit

Muncie 
Transit

Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Coffman 

Pace RFQ # 420624

                                  5 1010058 28.13                    28.75          37.58 33.39         35.00                  28.13 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  stock 21d 14d  stock 

                                  4 810230 2.99                         2.99            3.59 3.47                      3.50 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock  5w 21d  stock 

                                  3 1010060 2,126.94          2,822.18 2,528.99       2,126.94 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 7w 21d  stock 

                                  8 1010061 887.00             1,120.47        887.00     1,149.68     1,671.53     1,012.00 989.97             948.00        941.84 

Kirk's Auto 231452 -                
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock  9w  10d 21d  21d  stock 

                                  3 1010068 445.98             1,493.29 445.98          1,031.58 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock 
 bid 1 only, 

need 2  stock 

                                  4 1010077 649.48                712.60        910.05 789.98             649.48 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  11w 21d  stock 

                                  4 810320 13.34                    13.34          17.56 14.81                  14.41 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock  11w 21d  stock 

                                  3 810321 6.01                         6.01 6.75                      6.57 

Area Diesel 231453 -                 stock 21d  stock 

                                  4 810322 5.76                         5.86            7.88 6.86                      5.76 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  11w 21d  stock 


	420624

