
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Battery Service 
Corp.

CBM USA - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Prevost Eldorado I/O 
Controls

Midwest 
Bus

Gillig Rome 
Truck

Coffman 
Truck

Neopart Area Diesel Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Muncie 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

P&G Keene Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Kirk's Auto

                                   6 72139 314.46                 357.34        425.00        382.18        314.46        392.62        343.05 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 stock  7d  2w  stock  stock  30d 

                                   4 71733 77.80                      95.15           94.21           77.80           78.98 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 60d  4w  stock  30d 

                                   1 72125 70.15                      70.15 

Eldorado 231440 -                 6w 

                                   5 71101 0.21                          1.30             0.26             0.27             0.23             0.21 

Mohawk 231449  5d  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   4 72057 3.37                          3.61             3.37             9.27           11.80 

Vehicle Maintenance 231444 -                 stock  stock  49d  stock 

                                   6 72059 401.34                 626.25        629.95        432.60        568.13        401.34        505.23 

Muncie Transit 231445 -                 60d  6w  4w  5w  35d 
 no lead 

given 

                                   1 72132 31.73                      31.73 

Eldorado 231440 -                 stock 

                                   6 72143 10.43                      13.28           21.55           10.75           10.62           10.43           10.93 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 60d  6w  stock  7w  2w  42d 

                                   4 72134 55.50                   107.95           55.50           55.94           69.76 

Gillig 231441 -                 2w  stock  stock  49d 

                                   3 71357 9.80                        15.07             9.80           11.40 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 1w  stock  21d 

                                   1 71874 82.17                      82.17 

Aftermarket Parts 231443  stock 

                                   1 72126 37.75                      37.75 

Eldorado 231440 2w

                                   1 71947 6.35                          6.35 

Aftermarket Parts 231443  stock 

                                   5 71091 0.07                          0.50             0.54             0.19             0.08             0.07 

Mohawk 231449 -                 5d  60d  stock  stock  stock 

                                   5 71179 0.29                          2.68             0.75             0.47             0.38             0.29 

Mohawk 231449  10d  stock  stock  stock  3w 

                                   4 71389 13.30                      91.75           27.41           26.75           13.30 

Pace RFQ # 420622



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Battery Service 
Corp.

CBM USA - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Prevost Eldorado I/O 
Controls

Midwest 
Bus

Gillig Rome 
Truck

Coffman 
Truck

Neopart Area Diesel Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Muncie 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

P&G Keene Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Kirk's Auto

Pace RFQ # 420622

Muncie Transit 231445 stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   5 71442 5.65                        26.95             7.08             7.14             5.65             7.32 

Muncie Transit 231445 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   1 72144 26.95                      26.95 

Eldorado 231440 -                 stock 

                                   5 72156 21.47                      26.45           21.99           21.49           21.47           22.22 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 60d  6w  7w  stock  42d 

                                   1 72163 431.95                 431.95 

Eldorado 231440 -                 2w 

                                   4 72164 1,050.00          1,150.14     1,050.00     1,368.27     1,306.98 

Gillig 231441 -                 12w  4w  14w  90d 

                                   4 72181 345.55                 345.55        568.96        750.00        718.14 

Eldorado 231440 -                 4w  12w  6w  11w 

                                   1 72191 48.55                      48.55 

Eldorado 231440 -                 4w 

                                   6 72194 69.99                      82.68        129.55           82.00           71.63           69.99           73.05 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 60d  4w  6w  7w  4w  42d 

                                   8 72202 26.63                      29.93           32.35           33.87           31.67           26.63           27.40           28.32           33.02 

Vehicle Maintenance 231444 -                 75d  4w  4w  8w  stock  30d  stock  stock 

                                   5 72255 12.78                      16.15           15.64           16.78           12.78           14.64 

Muncie Transit 231445 -                 stock  stock  stock  30d  90d 

                                   4 72264 345.55                 345.55        568.96        550.00        761.85 

Eldorado 231440 -                 4w  12w  6w  14w 

                                   1 72267 35.65                      35.65 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 stock 

                                   4 72301 193.29                 269.00        193.29        276.39        221.00 

Suburban Truck 231446 -                 3w 
 unapproved 

part  5w  3w 

                                    - 710003 -                

-                

                                   2 710004 21.50                      21.55 21.50         

Hydraulic Electric 231448 -                 2w 14d



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Battery Service 
Corp.

CBM USA - 
NO BID

Interstate 
Power

Prevost Eldorado I/O 
Controls

Midwest 
Bus

Gillig Rome 
Truck

Coffman 
Truck

Neopart Area Diesel Aftermarket 
Parts

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Muncie 
Transit

Suburban 
Truck

P&G Keene Hydraulic 
Electric

Mohawk Kirk's Auto

Pace RFQ # 420622

                                   1 710008 167.51                 167.51 

Eldorado 231440 -                 2w 

                                   6 710025 34.50                      87.85        124.15           70.89           34.65           34.50           35.25 

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 60d  4w  stock  stock  7w  42d 

                                   1 710029 64.75                      64.75 

Eldorado 231440 -                 2w 

                                   8 710043 256.04                 341.93        269.00        276.50        308.65        288.07 256.04              328.26        321.00 

P&G Keene 231447 -                 75d  14d  4w  15w  30d stock  3w  stock 

                                   1 710156 31.73                      31.73 

Eldorado 231440 -                 2w 

                                   1 710157 33.20                      33.20 

Eldorado 231440 -                 4w 

                                   6 710166 226.53                 392.54        226.53        227.70        286.97        238.45        290.44 

Coffman Truck 231442 -                 75d  stock  stock  stock  110d  4w 

                                    - 710198 -                

-                

                                    - 710314 -                

-                

                                   2 710338 2,677.54          2,677.54 3,010.00   

Aftermarket Parts 231443 -                 stock stock

                                   4 710339 10.99                      53.50           26.84           15.80           10.99 

Muncie Transit 231445 -                 stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                   1 710341 335.48                 335.48 

Eldorado 231440 -                 4w 


	420622

