Pace RFQ 420606 Due: 11/18/2020

TOTAL
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Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstate Kirk's Lift -U Midwest  Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush  Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts  Center Program
Winning Bidder & PO of
Number lllinois
5 290415 473.04 475.00 527.27 473.04 521.07 590.00
WEST HAS 0 ON
Neopart 231393 HAND Stock 21 Days Stock Stock Stock
5 41131 48.52 48.52 59.40 86.77 96.05 101.58
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231391 - Dec 8th Stock 3-4 Weeks | Stock 60 Days
7 60734 2.44 4.10 2.62 5.73 2.86 6.17 2.44 2.52
Bidding 4
Suburban Truck Parts [SOUTH HAS 0 ON only at this
231395 HAND - Stock price Stock | 2-3 Weeks | 11 Weeks | 60 Days Stock Stock
6 290536 75.00 77.61 75.00 86.10 77.11 80.99 92.63
HECS 231389 Stock 14 Days 21 Days Stock Stock 75 Days
5 250653 379.48 379.48 388.00 395.99 394.94 508.75
Gillig 231388 - Stock 10 Days Stock Stock Stock
6 10170 0.88 0.88 1.71 1.50 1.58 1.95 1.80
Must be
Mohawk 2 Stock ordered in 49 Stock
Manufacturing Balance 21 [mulitples of Balance 60
231391 QTY. 66 Stock Days 4 Stock Stock Days Stock
5 40504 1.12 1.12 1.27 1.60 1.23 1.76
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231391 - Stock Stock Stock Stock 60 Days
5 151457 166.60 302.35 166.67 166.60 191.30 216.52
Muncie 231392 - Stock Stock 21 Days Stock 60 Days
5 290645 43.57 59.35 56.75 70.39 46.50 43.57
Vehicle Maintenance
Program 231396 - Stock Stock 6 Weeks Stock Stock
6 290537 158.00 160.41 158.00 186.24 159.63 167.83 207.20
4 Stock
Balance 28
HECS 231389 Stock Stock Days Stock Stock Stock
8 40953 8.30 13.75 8.30 14.08 32.51 23.58 18.10 32.30 13.67
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231391 Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock
4 290643 11.17 18.85 13.10 15.50 11.17
Vehicle Maintenance
Program 231396 Stock 30 Days Stock Stock
4 290647 90.33 134.95 98.60 90.33 139.95
7-10
NFI Parts 231394 Stock 30 Days 6 Weeks Days
5 290644 43.57 59.35 59.39 48.45 46.50 43.57
Vehicle Maintenance
Program 231396 - Stock 30 Days Stock Stock Stock




Pace

White = No Bid

RFQ 420606 Due: 11/18/2020

TOTAL

Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstate Kirk's Lift -U Midwest  Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush  Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts  Center Program
Winning Bidder & PO of
Number lllinois
5 40171 0.25 0.28 0.26 0.35 0.25 0.27
Must be
ordered in
mulitples of
NFI Parts 231394 QTY. 10 Dec 1st Stock 50 Stock Stock Stock
1 20608 43.15 43.15
ElDorado 231387 2-3 Weeks
7 40165 3.20 9.25 3.20 4.25 9.49 9.25 13.70 14.81
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231391 Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock
7 41217 81.61 161.95 124.76 87.41 92.15 81.61 149.40 111.00
2 Stock
Balance 21
NFI Parts 231394 - 4 Weeks 6 Weeks Stock Days Stock 60 Days Stock
6 10405 121.80 194.35 121.80 123.70 166.27 137.67 207.84
2 Stock
Balance 30
Gillig 231388 - Stock 2-4 Weeks Stock Days Stock 120 Days
5 290428 8.75 8.75 9.50 9.09 57.63 11.48
3 Stock
Balance 2-
HECS 231389 - Stock Stock 2-3 Weeks |3 Weeks Stock
8 40922 17.05 75.55 27.99 17.05 17.82 23.50 29.10 31.83 42.78
WEST HAS 0 ON
Midwest Bus 231390 |HAND 4 Weeks Stock 14 Days Stock Stock 3-4 Weeks | Stock Stock
6 41205 0.75 3.27 3.26 0.75 0.75 1.09 0.83
NFI Parts 231394 - Stock Stock Stock Stock 60 Days Stock
8 60739 12.19 38.69 36.92 29.99 12.19 43.35 21.59 27.01 13.87
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231391 - Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock 5 Weeks Stock Stock
5 40162 0.32 0.32 0.99 0.97 0.98 1.23
Must be
Mohawk ordered in
Manufacturing multiples of
231391 QTY. 10 Stock Stock 20 Stock Stock Stock
7 10366 69.90 83.00 69.90 73.73 297.67 70.06 124.70 112.00
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231391 - Stock Stock Stock 6-8 Weeks | Stock 60 Days Stock




Pace

White = No Bid

RFQ 420606 Due: 11/18/2020
TOTAL

Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstate Kirk's Lift -U Midwest  Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush  Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance

Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts  Center Program
Winning Bidder & PO of
Number lllinois

5 41019 0.99 0.99 1.98 2.16 2.09 2.74

Must be

Mohawk ordered in
Manufacturing multiples of
231391 - Stock Stock 20 Stock Stock Stock

6 41132 48.52 48.52 98.63 86.77 96.62 109.56 98.50
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231391 - Stock 60 Days Stock Stock 60 Days Stock

1 290664 2.65 2.65 DQ

Not an
aprroved

ElDorado 231387 - Stock OEM.

4 10411 109.22 151.15 111.68 109.22 113.02
Muncie 231392 - Stock Stock 30 Days 13 Weeks

1 290670 3.19 3.19
ElDorado 231387 - Stock

1 60770 59.35 59.35
ElDorado 231387 - Stock

5 290673 890.00 1,199.00 890.00 1,022.00 983.49 | 1,172.84

1 Stock
Balance 6

Gillig 231388 - 4 Weeks 4-6 Weeks 21 Days Weeks 90 Days

1 152026 3.19 3.19

WEST HAS 0 ON

ElDorado 231387 HAND - 1 Week

5 250716 51.41 51.41 65.15 53.08 66.37 70.55
Gillig 231388 - Stock Stock Stock Stock 60 Days

4 250718 569.29 572.02 602.44 569.29 687.10
Neopart 231393 - 1-2 Weeks Stock 7-10 Days | Stock

1 41283 37.66 37.66
ElDorado 231387 - 2-4 Weeks

3 60790 535.75 776.95 535.75 627.47

NORTH HAS 0 ON

Muncie 231392 HAND - 2-4 Weeks 45 Days 8 Weeks

1 152031 0.53 0.53
ElDorado 231387 1-2 Days

1 290684 16.67 16.67
ElDorado 231387 - 1 Week

5 290686 5.00 5.50 5.00 5.65 5.48 6.46
HECS 231389 - Stock Stock 21 Days Stock 60 Days




Pace

White = No Bid

RFQ 420606 Due: 11/18/2020

TOTAL

Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstate Kirk's Lift -U Midwest  Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush  Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts  Center Program
Winning Bidder & PO of
Number lllinois
6 290690 496.75 870.78 496.75 582.90 500.43 535.48 674.40
2 Stock
Balance 21
Gillig 231388 - 4 Weeks Stock Days Stock Stock 60 Days
7 290696 8.80 8.80 10.10 37.75 DQ 23.23 10.80 534.01 15.33
Not an 3 Stock
Autex Automotive approved Balance 3
Devices 231384 - 1 Day Stock Stock OEM. Stock 3-4 Weeks |Weeks Stock
1 30483 119.30 119.30
SOUTH HAS LOW
ElDorado 231387 STOCK - Stock
7 410006 121.50 150.00 121.50 DQ 135.15 147.29 143.46 200.82 301.15
Not an
13 in Stock approved
Gillig 231388 - Stock at this price. OEM. Stock Stock Stock 60 Days Stock
6 410009 102.33 134.95 103.34 104.95 102.33 155.32 112.00
Mohawk
Manufacturing RIVER HAS 0 ON
231391 HAND - 2 Weeks Stock 21 Days 8 Weeks | 60 Days Stock
2 1510007 18.23 26.95 18.23
WEST HAS 0 ON
NFI Parts 231394 HAND - Stock Stock
3 1510008 12.49 13.60 12.50 12.49
NFI Parts 231394 - 1-2 Days Stock Stock
2 1510012 28.18 37.75 28.18
NFI Parts 231394 - Stock 5 Weeks
5 410023 55.09 55.42 55.09 55.09 68.32 61.43
1 Stock
Balance 60
Neopart 231393 - Stock Stock Stock Days Stock
5 410025 55.42 55.42 55.49 64.67 68.32 62.43
Muncie 231392 - Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock
4 2510012 211.93 233.31 211.93 223.24 235.59
1 Stock
Balance 45
Midwest Bus 231390 - Stock 10 Days Days Stock
3 610018 42.00 42.00 DQ 46.36 48.19
Not an 10 Stock
Coffman Truck Sales approved |Balance 30
231386 - Stock OEM. Days Stock
1 610017 75.55 75.55
ElDorado 231387 - 2-4 Weeks
7 610019 72.62 134.95 88.00 72.79 72.62 72.72 102.10 79.63
Muncie 231392 Stock Stock Stock 30 Days 7 Weeks | 60 Days Stock
3 110014 106.10 134.95 106.15 106.10
NFI Parts 231394 - Stock 60 Days Stock




Pace

White = No Bid

RFQ 420606 Due: 11/18/2020
TOTAL

Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstate Kirk's Lift -U Midwest  Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush  Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts  Center Program
Winning Bidder & PO of
Number lllinois
2 210004 162.03 269.95 162.03
NFI Parts 231394 - 8 Weeks Stock
3 310012 82.83 DQ 128.63 82.93 82.83
Not an
approved
NFI Parts 231394 - OEM. Stock Stock Stock
3 2910007 36.20 64.75 36.20 49.63
Muncie 231392 - Stock 30 Days Stock
6 610050 20.45 101.87 20.45 37.26 27.70 30.89 41.54
1 Stock
Balance 1 Stock
Within 8 Balance
CBM 231385 - Stock Weeks Dec. 1st Stock Stock Stock
4 610052 4.29 4.36 4.29 5.08 6.08
Coffman Truck Sales
231386 - Stock Stock 30 Days Stock
5 410066 131 16.21 1.31 15.01 13.60 15.00
Std Pk 10
Muncie 231392 - 12 Weeks |Stock Stock Stock Stock
5 2510034 1,285.00 1,305.60 1,285.00 1,315.45 1,305.23 | 1,634.92
Midwest Bus 231390 - 1-2 Weeks 10 Days 90 Days Stock Stock
1 1510106 583.00 583.00
ElDorado 231387 - 6 Weeks
1 310026 1,000.00 1,000.00
ElDorado 231387 - Stock
1 110027 1.06 1.06
ElDorado 231387 - 2 Weeks
1 410075 368.55 368.55
WEST HAS 0 ON
ElDorado 231387 HAND - 6 Weeks
1 1510112 18.77 18.77
ElDorado 231387 - 2 Weeks
1 1510113 20.64 20.64
ElDorado 231387 - 2 Weeks
1 1510136 147.50 147.50
ElDorado 231387 - 2-4 Weeks
1 1510137 156.55 156.55
ElDorado 231387 - 4 Weeks
1 2910024 22.69 22.69
NFI Parts 231394 - 5 Weeks




Pace RFQ 420606 Due: 11/18/2020
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Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstate Kirk's Lift -U Midwest  Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush  Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts  Center Program
Winning Bidder & PO of
Number lllinois
5 2510067 918.50 918.50 961.26 919.00 920.43 976.87
1 Stock
Balance 7
Gillig 231388 - 2 Weeks Stock 10 Days 7-10 Days |Weeks
1 610082 7.60 7.60
ElDorado 231387 - 1-2 Weeks
1 610083 637.98 637.98
ElDorado 231387 - 4 Weeks
8 410080 270.00 280.00 275.00 270.00 [ DQ 290.60 282.46 280.23 362.76 356.72
Not an 7 Stock
approved Balance 5
Midwest Bus 231390 - Stock Stock 14 Days |OEM. 21 Days Stock Weeks 60 Days Stock
5 2510084 6.75 6.75 13.14 6.86 6.80 8.10
WEST HAS 0 ON
Gillig 231388 HAND - 1-2 Weeks Stock 10 Days 7-10 Days | Stock
1 1510173 52.89 52.89
ElDorado 231387 - 2 Weeks
5 610098 2.42 4.81 2.56 2.42 2.64 2.56
Mohawk
Manufacturing LOW STOCK - RIVER
231391 HAS 0 ON HAND - 1 Week Stock 45 Days Stock Stock
2 610101 536.19 548.53 536.19
NFI Parts 231394 - 4 Weeks 11 Weeks
1 610108 1,112.01 1,112.01
NFI Parts 231394 - Stock
2 2910042 44.99 45.13 44.99
1 Stock
Balance 5
NFI Parts 231394 - 21 Days Weeks
1 410114 19.00 19.00
NFI Parts 231394 - Stock
1 410115 19.00 19.00
3 Stock
Balance 4
NFI Parts 231394 - Weeks
1 2510170 88.80 88.80
NFI Parts 231394 - 8 Weeks
2 610140 36.98 36.98 67.33
Muncie 231392 - Stock Stock




