BID TABULATION
DIESEL FUEL & UNLEADED GASOLINE IFB 420351 - 12/10/20 11:00am

Petroleum Blu l\gansfield O;l
Bidder Name: Traders Luke Oil Petroleum, | US Oil, Co. or.np an.y 0
. Gainseville,
Corporation Inc.
Inc.
Variable Pricing Method A for Three (3) Months plus Three (3) Three-Month Opti
PERIOD ITEM PRICING
1st
Qtr 2021
Diesel
ULSD OPIS $1.4104 $1.4104 $1.4104 $1.4104
UST TAX $0.0141 No Bid $0.0141 30.0141 30.0141
FREIGHT $0.0412 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0450 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0616 No Bid -$0.0298 -$0.0480 -$0.0187
UNIT COST $1.4041 No Bid $1.4422 $1.4215 $1.4058
QUANTITY 1,091,415.00 No Bid 1,091,415.00 1,091,415.00 1,091,415.00
TOTAL COST $ 1,532,455.80 No Bid| § 1,574,038.71 | $ 1,551,446.42 | $ 1,534,311.21
2nd
Qtr 2021
Diesel Option
ULSD OPIS $1.4104 $1.4104 $1.4104 $1.4104
UST TAX $0.0141 No Bid $0.0141 30.0141 30.0141
FREIGHT $0.0412 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0450 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0411 No Bid -$0.0298 -$0.0480 -$0.0019
UNIT COST $1.4246 No Bid $1.4422 $1.4215 $1.4226
QUANTITY 1,091,415.00 No Bid 1,091,415.00 1,091,415.00 1,091,415.00
TOTAL COST $ 1,554,829.81 $ 1,574,038.71 | $ 1,551,446.42 | $ 1,552,646.98
3rd
Qtr 2021

Diesel Option

ULSD OPIS $1.4104 No Bid $1.4104 $1.4104 $1.4104
UST TAX 30.0141 No Bid 30.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141
FREIGHT $0.0412 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0450 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0391 No Bid -$0.0298 -$0.0480 $0.0074
UNIT COST $1.4266 No Bid $1.4422 $1.4215 $1.4319
QUANTITY 1,091,415.00 No Bid 1,091,415.00 1,091,415.00 1,091,415.00
TOTAL COST $ 1,557,012.64 No Bid| $ 1,574,038.71 | $ 1,551,446.42 | $ 1,562,797.14




Mansfield Oil

Petroleum Blu C f
Bidder Name: Traders Luke Oil Petroleum, | US Oil, Co. or.np an.y 0
. Gainseville,
Corporation Inc.
Inc.
4th
Qtr 2021
Diesel Option
ULSD OPIS $1.4104 No Bid $1.4104 $1.4104 $1.4104
UST TAX 30.0141 No Bid 30.0141 30.0141 30.0141
FREIGHT $0.0412 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0450 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0341 No Bid -$0.0298 -$0.0480 -$0.0042
UNIT COST $1.43160 No Bid $1.4422 $1.4215 $1.4203
QUANTITY 1,091,415.00 No Bid 1,091,415.00 1,091,415.00 1,091,415.00
TOTAL COST $ 1,562,469.71 No Bid| $ 1,574,038.71 | $ 1,551,446.42 | $§ 1,550,136.72
VARIABLE METHOD A .
DIESEL TOTAL $ 6,206,767.96 |No Bid $ 6,296,154.84 | $ 6,205,785.68 | $§ 6,199,892.05
1st
Qtr 2021
Gasoline
ULSD OPIS $1.1817 No Bid $1.1817 $1.1817 $1.1817
UST TAX $0.0139 No Bid 30.0139 30.0139 30.0139
FREIGHT $0.0429 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0534 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0581 No Bid -$0.0298 -$0.0440 -$0.0549
UNIT COST $1.1804 No Bid $1.2133 $1.2050 $1.1407
QUANTITY 319,622.00 No Bid 319,622.00 319,622.00 319,622.00
TOTAL COST $ 377,281.81 NoBid| $ 387,797.37 | $§ 385,144.51 | $§ 364,592.82
2nd
Qtr 2021
Gasoline Option
ULSD OPIS $1.1817 No Bid $1.1817 $1.1817 $1.1817
UST TAX 30.0139 No Bid 30.0139 30.0139 30.0139
FREIGHT $0.0429 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0534 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0756 No Bid -$0.0298 -$0.0440 -$0.0515
UNIT COST $1.1629 No Bid $1.2133 $1.2050 $1.1441
QUANTITY 319,622.00 No Bid 319,622.00 319,622.00 319,622.00
TOTAL COST $ 371,688.42 NoBid| $ 387,797.37 | $§ 385,144.51 | $§ 365,679.53




Mansfield Oil

Petroleum Blu C f
Bidder Name: Traders Luke Oil Petroleum, | US Oil, Co. or.np an.y 0
. Gainseville,
Corporation Inc.
Inc.
3rd
Qtr 2021
Gasoline Option

ULSD OPIS $1.1817 No Bid $1.1817 $1.1817 $1.1817
UST TAX 30.0139 No Bid 30.0139 30.0139 30.0139
FREIGHT $0.0429 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0534 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0656 No Bid -$0.0298 -$0.0440 -$0.0367
UNIT COST $1.1729 No Bid $1.2133 $1.2050 $1.1589
QUANTITY 319,622.00 No Bid 319,622.00 319,622.00 319,622.00

TOTAL COST $ 374,884.64 NoBid| $ 387,797.37 | $ 385,14451 [ $ 370,409.94

4th
Qtr 2021
Gasoline Option
ULSD OPIS $1.1817 No Bid $1.1817 $1.1817 $1.1817
UST TAX 30.0139 No Bid 30.0139 $0.0139 $0.0139
FREIGHT $0.0429 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0534 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0581 No Bid -$0.0298 -$0.0440 -$0.0429
UNIT COST $1.1804 No Bid $1.2133 $1.2050 $1.1527
QUANTITY 319,622.00 No Bid 319,622.00 319,622.00 319,622.00
TOTAL COST $ 377,281.81 NoBid| $ 387,797.37 | $ 385,14451 [ $ 368,428.28
Vgggﬁﬁ;ggg;gg A $ 1,501,136.68 | No Bid $ 1,551,189.48 | $ 1,540,578.04 | $ 1,469,110.57
VARIABLE METHOD A
$ 7,707,904.64 |No Bid $ 7,847,344.32  § 7,746,363.72 | $ 7,669,002.62

GRAND TOTAL




Mansfield Oil

Petroleum Blu C f
Bidder Name: Traders Luke Oil Petroleum, | US Oil, Co. or.np an.y 0
. Gainseville,
Corporation Inc.
Inc.
Variable Pricing Method B for Six (6) Months plus One (1) Six-Month Option
PERIOD ITEM PRICING
1st & 2nd Quarter
2021 Diesel
ULSD OPIS $1.4104 No Bid $1.4104 $1.4104 $1.4104
UST TAX 30.0141 No Bid 30.0141 30.0141 30.0141
FREIGHT $0.0412 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0450 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0391 No Bid -$0.0391 -$0.0480 -$0.0112
UNIT COST $1.4266 No Bid $1.4329 $1.4215 $1.4133
QUANTITY 2,182,831.00 No Bid 2,182,831.00 2,182,831.00 2,182,831.00
TOTAL COST $ 3,114,026.70 No Bid| $ 3,127,778.54 | $ 3,102,894.27 | $ 3,084,995.05
3rd & 4th Quarter
2021 Diesel Option
ULSD OPIS $1.4104 No Bid $1.4104 $1.4104 $1.4104
UST TAX 30.0141 No Bid 30.0141 30.0141 30.0141
FREIGHT $0.0412 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0450 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0366 No Bid -$0.0391 -$0.0480 $0.0003
UNIT COST $1.4291 No Bid $1.4329 $1.4215 $1.4248
QUANTITY 2,182,831.00 No Bid 2,182,831.00 2,182,831.00 2,182,831.00
TOTAL COST $ 3,119,483.78 No Bid| $ 3,127,778.54 | $ 3,102,894.27 | $ 3,110,097.61
VAR;ﬁ;%i“;ging B $6,233,510.48 No Bid| $6,255,557.08| $6,205,788.54 $6,195,092.66
1st & 2nd Quarter
2021 Gasoline
ULSD OPIS $1.1817 No Bid $1.1817 $1.1817 $1.1817
UST TAX $0.0139 No Bid 30.0139 30.0139 30.0139
FREIGHT $0.0429 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0534 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0746 No Bid -$0.0391 -$0.0440 -$0.0532
UNIT COST $1.1639 No Bid $1.2040 $1.2050 $1.1424
QUANTITY 639,245.00 No Bid 639,245.00 639,245.00 639,245.00
TOTAL COST $ 744,017.26 NoBid[ $§ 769,65098 | $§ 770,290.23 [ $ 730,273.49




Bidder Name:

3rd & 4th Quarter
2021 Gasoline

Petroleum
Traders
Corporation

Luke Oil

Blu

Petroleum,

Inc.

US Oil, Co.

Mansfield Oil
Company of
Gainseville,

Inc.

Option

ULSD OPIS $1.1817 No Bid $1.1817 $1.1817 $1.1817
UST TAX 30.0139 No Bid 30.0139 $0.0139 $30.0139
FREIGHT $0.0429 No Bid $0.0475 $0.0534 $0.0000
MARGIN -$0.0656 No Bid -$0.0391 -$0.0440 -$0.0436
UNIT COST $1.1729 No Bid $1.2040 $1.2050 $1.1520
QUANTITY 639,245.00 No Bid 639,245.00 639,245.00 639,245.00
TOTAL COST $ 749,770.46 NoBid| § 769,650.98 | § 770,290.23 | $  736,410.24

V%ngi:;g?gﬁgg B $1,493,787.72(No Bid $1,539,301.96 $1,540,580.46] $1,466,683.73

VARIABLE METHOD B $7,727,298.20|No Bid $7,794,859.04| $7,746,369.001 $7,661,776.39

GRAND TOTAL




	BID SHEET

