Pace RFQ# 420319

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ! [/ J | [ | | [ | | | [ | | | [ |
Sku Winning bid | Battery Interstate Vehicle 1/0 MW Bus - | Neopart |Area Diesel| Suburban |P&G Keene| Hydraulic | Eldorado | Kirk's Auto Gillig Aftermarket |  Muncie Prevost Battery Mohawk | Coffman
NO # of Bids Service Power |Maintenance | controls NO BID Transit Truck Electric National Parts Co. Transit Systems Truck
5 72139 314.46 357.34 397.04 403.87 343.05 314.46
Coffman Truck 230980 - 10d stock stock stokc stock
4 71733 77.50 77.80 77.50 94.76 215.00
quantity
requirement
Aftermarket Parts 230976 - stock per line stock 7d
8 72079 192.67 192.67 193.39 228.00 196.75 227.83 216.96 258.28 240.40
Neopart Transit 230971 - stock stock stock stock stock stock stock 2w
6 71875 5.00 16.15 10.25 5.13 5.00 7.31 5.03
1 stock, no
lead on bal
Muncie Transit 230978 stock of 15 stock 30d 60d stock
3 71500 29.99 31.45 29.99 30.25
Gillig 230984 - stock stock stock
4 72121 62.00 91.75 62.19 68.66 62.00
Muncie Transit 230978 - stock 4w 5w 30d
5 71441 6.38 26.95 6.99 7.72 6.38 7.08
Muncie Transit 230978 - stock stock 5w 30d stock
5 70220 7.95 32.35 16.25 22.97 11.30 7.95
Mohawk 230979 - stock stock stock stock stock
6 72059 401.34 629.95 408.57 575.14 401.34 626.25 511.08
Muncie Transit 230978 - 3w 4w 5w stock 60d 4w
5 72143 10.43 21.55 10.50 10.43 10.93 13.28
Aftermarket Parts 230976 stock stock stock 45d 60d
1 70020 5.65 5.65
Prevost 230985 stock
4 71183 0.38 2.08 0.74 0.78 0.38
Mohawk 230979 stock stock stock stock
5 71100 0.07 0.90 0.07 0.07 0.36 0.07
Aftermarket Parts 230976 10d stock stock stock stock
6 72135 57.63 59.38 97.15 57.63 57.75 61.10 72.05
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Sku Winning bid | Battery Interstate Vehicle 1/0 MW Bus - | Neopart |Area Diesel| Suburban |P&G Keene| Hydraulic | Eldorado | Kirk's Auto Gillig Aftermarket |  Muncie Prevost Battery Mohawk | Coffman
NO # of Bids Service Power |Maintenance | controls NO BID Transit Truck Electric National Parts Co. Transit Systems Truck
Gillig 230984 - 7w stock 6w 2w 60d 60d
7 72056 13.41 21.12 42.51 26.05 20.25 21.21 13.41 42.27
unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 230976 stock stock stock stock 45d part stock
5 71442 5.65 26.95 7.10 7.57 5.65 7.15
Muncie Transit 230978 stock stock stock stock stock
5 72156 21.59 21.59 23.05 21.75 22.22 26.45
Neopart Transit 230971 - stock 6w 3w 45d 60d
1 72163 431.95 431.95
Eldorado National 230973 - stock
4 72164 1,000.00 1,150.14 1,000.00 1,050.00 | 1,417.13
Hydraulic Electric 230972 - 8w 14d Aw 14w
3 72184 4.60 11.83 4.60 5.46
Aftermarket Parts 230976 - stock stock stocck
1 72203 32.35 S2850)]
Eldorado National 230973 - 6w
4 72216 147.49 291.55 147.49 149.00 210.00
Gillig 230984 - stock stock stock 105d
1 72239 26.95 26.95
Eldorado National 230973 - 4w
2 72301 245.00 249.28 245.00
Battery Systems-AKA
Worldwide Battery 230986 - 3w 3w
1 710004 21.55 21.55
Eldorado National 230973 - 2w
6 710025 34.65 34.65 124.15 37.50 34.89 35.90 87.85
Neopart Transit 230971 - stock 6w 6w 7w 45d 60d
7 710033 12.88 14.86 13.38 18.83 16.50 12.88 14.64 15.92
Muncie Transit 230978 - stock stock stock stock stock 60d 5d
7 710043 256.04 256.04 310.00 276.50 319.80 289.00 341.93 318.26
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NO # of Bids Service Power |Maintenance | controls NO BID Transit Truck Electric National Parts Co. Transit Systems Truck
P&G Keene 230983 - stock stock Aw 14w 30d 60d 2w
6 710046 29.95 37.75 34.05 29.95 31.47 35.36 43.38
Muncie Transit 230978 - stock 9w 30d 60d 2w 5d
4 710052 2,201.63 2,201.63 3,246.40 2,815.72 2,562.00
P&G Keene 230983 - stock 3w stock 60d
2 710062 6.95 6.95 11.64
Gillig 230984 - stock stock
4 710115 31.25 31.50 31.25 48.84 44.77
Hydraulic Electric 230972 - stock 14d 4w 12w
4 710116 31.25 31.50 31.25 48.84 31.30
Hydraulic Electric 230972 - stock 14d Aw Sw
6 710120 373.70 373.70 449.00 383.00 434.00 415.25 521.24
P&G Keene 230983 - stock stock stock stock 30d 60d
5 710161 32.35 37885 53.57 32.50 56.25 47.10
Eldorado National 230973 - stock 9w 30d 60d Sw
5 710175 36.71 38.36 97.15 38.71 40.05 36.71
Muncie Transit 230978 - 7w 6w stock stock stock
1 710208 12.25 12.25
Eldorado National 230973 - 2w
1 710248 1,258.00 1,258.00
Eldorado National 230973 - 6w
4 710281 37.75 37.75 55.00 49.64 46.00
Eldorado National 230973 - stock Aw stock 21d
2 710285 1.10 1.10 38.46
Eldorado National 230973 - iw 7w
4 710315 21.55 37.10 21.55 40.75 31.50
Eldorado National 230973 - 14d 2w stock 30d
3 710316 21.55 37.10 21.55 34.50
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NO # of Bids Service Power |Maintenance | controls NO BID Transit Truck Electric National Parts Co. Transit Systems Truck
Eldorado National 230973 - 14d 2w 30d
1 710318 0.46 0.46
Eldorado National 230973 - 2w
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