
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Battery 
Service

P&G Keene Suburban 
Truck Parts

Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart 
Transit

Rome 
Truck Parts

CBM USA Kirks Auto MW Bus - 
NO BID

Area Diesel Prevost Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman 
Truck

Eldorado

                                  7 70797 3.24                       13.87            3.24            6.27          23.75            5.77 3.81           5.47           

CBM USA 231403 -                 stock  5w  60d  4w  stock stock stock

                                  1 72125 70.15                    70.15 

Eldorado 231410 -                 6w 

                                  5 71101 0.21                         1.30            0.26            0.23 0.27           0.21           

Mohawk 231408 -                 stock  stock  stock stock stock

                                  5 71441 6.32                         6.99            6.32 7.30           6.95                    26.95 

Muncie Transit 231406  stock  30d 5w stock  stock 

                                  6 70220 7.95                       18.88          15.50          12.25 21.44         7.95                    32.35 

Mohawk 231408 -                 16w  stock  stock 6w stock  stock 

                                  3 71357 9.05              9.05           11.40                  15.07 

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                 stock 
 unapproved 

part  2w 

                                  1 71539 32.35                    32.35 

Eldorado 231410 -                 2w 

                                  6 72135 56.92                    59.38          72.05          56.99          61.10 56.92                  97.15 

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                 7w  60d  8w  42d 2w  6w 

                                  5 71179 0.29                         2.68            0.75            0.38 0.49           0.29           

Mohawk 231408 -                 10d  stock  stock stock stock

                                  6 72056 10.55                    26.28          42.41          20.68 19.25         10.55                  41.83 

Mohawk 231408  stock  stock  42d 7w stock  stock 

                                  7 72094 14.91                    21.10          14.91          15.05          21.30 20.92         23.75                  26.95 

Vehicle Maintenance 231401  stock  stock  stock  30d stock 3w  2w 

                                  1 72120 97.15                    97.15 

Eldorado 231410  stock 

                                  2 70730 0.15              0.65           0.15           

Mohawk 231408 stock stock

                                   - 72144 -                

-                

                                  1 72145 8.59                         8.59 

Pace RFQ# 420604



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Battery 
Service

P&G Keene Suburban 
Truck Parts

Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart 
Transit

Rome 
Truck Parts

CBM USA Kirks Auto MW Bus - 
NO BID

Area Diesel Prevost Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman 
Truck

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420604

Eldorado 231410  stock 

                                  5 72156 21.49                    21.49          26.45          21.99          22.22 21.51         

Neopart Transit 231402  stock  60d  6w  42d  stock 

                                  1 72163 431.95                431.95 

Eldorado 231410 -                 stock 

                                  4 72167 37.36                    38.02          43.25          39.12 37.36         

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                 7w  6w  42d  3w 

                                  1 72191 48.55                    48.55 

Eldorado 231410 -                 6w 

                                  4 72184 4.57                         7.20            5.46 4.57                    11.83 

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                 16w  stock stock  stock 

                                  1 72204 18.85                    18.85 

Eldorado 231410 -                 stock 

                                  4 72216 147.09                210.00        164.17 147.09             291.55 

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                 120d  6w  stock  stock 

                                  5 72221 14.32                    17.05          14.61          14.50 14.32                  26.95 

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                 60d  stock  35d stock  6w 

                                  1 72239 26.95                    26.95 

Eldorado 231410 -                 6w 

                                  5 72255 11.58                    15.64          12.80 17.03         11.58                  16.15 

Mohawk 231408 -                 stock  30d stock stock  stock 

                                  1 72265 12.25           12.25         

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                stock

                                  4 72301 193.29                249.99        221.00        193.29 277.94      

Suburban Truck Parts 231400 -                 3w  4w 
 unapproved 

part 5w

                                  4 72301 193.29                249.99        221.00        193.29 277.94      

Suburban Truck Parts 231400 -                 3w  4w 
 unapproved 

part 5w

                                  1 72311 118.75                118.75 

Eldorado 231410 -                 4w 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 
Controls

Battery 
Service

P&G Keene Suburban 
Truck Parts

Interstate 
Power

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Neopart 
Transit

Rome 
Truck Parts

CBM USA Kirks Auto MW Bus - 
NO BID

Area Diesel Prevost Gillig Hydraulic 
Electric

Muncie 
Transit

Aftermarket 
Parts

Mohawk Coffman 
Truck

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420604

                                  7 72388 36.75                    63.15          78.80          38.50          66.44 52.37         36.75                  63.00 

Mohawk 231408 -                 7w  stock  stock  42d stock stock  stock 

                                  6 710026 450.00                601.20        450.00        469.64 527.18      496.23             545.95 

Gillig 231404 -                 60d  stock  21d 6w stock  2w 

                                  7 710043 256.04                256.04        322.00        341.93        276.50        288.70 312.28      328.26      

P&G Keene 231399 -                 stock  stock  75d  4w  30d  14w 3w

                                  6 710058 15.21                    15.45          27.00          18.40 54.80         54.71                  15.21 

Coffman Truck 231409 -                 stock  14d  30d stock  4w  stock 

                                  4 710115 29.50                    29.71          29.50 44.33                  48.84 

Hydraulic Electric 231405 -                 stock  14d 12w  stock 

                                  6 710120 373.70                373.70        450.00        521.24        395.68        415.22 426.84      

P&G Keene 231399 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  30d stock

                                  3 710131 3.75                         6.89            6.68 3.75           

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                 stock  60d  5w 

                                  5 710136 515.06                705.60        515.06        830.12 891.96             564.09 

Gillig 231404 -                 12w  stock  60d  9w  4w 

                                  3 710137 445.30                499.99 445.30             564.09 

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                 90d stock  4w 

                                  1 710156 31.73                    31.73 

Eldorado 231410 -                 stock 

                                  2 710193 33.99           33.99                165.31 

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                 7w  stock 

                                   - 710198 -                

-                

                                  1 710215 170.90         170.90      

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                stock

                                  1 710248 1,141.00          1,141.00 

Eldorado 231410 -                 6w 

                                  1 710278 1,290.00          1,290.00 
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0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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Eldorado 231410 -                 6w 

                                  1 710310 452.22         452.22      

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                2w

                                   - 710314 -                

-                

                                  1 710336 320.21         320.21      

Aftermarket Parts 231407 -                16w

                                  1 710337 222.35                222.35 

Eldorado 231410 -                 6w 

                                  1 710340 22.02                    22.02 

Muncie Transit 231406 -                 30d 


	420604

