
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Suburban 
Truck Parts

P&G Keene Midwest 
Bus

Kirks Auto Neopart 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Prevost CBM USA Rush Truck Hydraulic 
Electric

Area Diesel Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Eldorado

                                  1 120467 17.62                    17.62 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock 

                                  6 81138 4.98                         5.68            6.27            5.77            7.74 4.98                      6.38 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d 

                                  9 130611 170.00                256.67        172.00        225.86        221.44        170.00        287.37 280.00      213.79             246.26 

Hydraulic Electric 231326 -                 stock  5d  stock  1d  14d  stock 2w
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  7 140057 20.70                    37.63          44.68          46.11          39.81 36.99         20.70                  37.52 

Mohawk 231331  stock  stock  stock  stock stock stock  stock 

                                  5 81311 85.49                    85.49          94.98          92.51        113.49        101.12 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  stock  5w  21d 

                                10 110136 68.46                    68.46          81.29          69.58          73.88        129.36          73.89        101.62 146.93               79.33          99.00 

Suburban Truck Parts 231321 -                
 min order 
quantity  14d  stock  7d  60d  7d  7w 4w  30d  stock 

                                10 110136 68.46                    68.46          81.29          69.58          75.00          73.88        129.35          73.89        101.62 146.93               79.33          99.00 

Suburban Truck Parts 231321 -                
 min order 
quantity  14d  stock 

 11 only, 
need 20 7d  60d  7d  7w 4w  30d  stock 

                                  3 81285 817.23                817.23        817.47     1,117.95 

Aftermarket Parts 231327 -                 7w  60d  stock 

                                  1 120498 395.00                395.00 

Triangle Radiator 231337 -                 3d 

                                  7 81345 124.00                139.17        155.45        124.00        143.00        166.56 125.90             165.75 

Hydraulic Electric 231326  stock  1d  stock  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                  1 81366 70.15                    70.15 

Eldorado 231334  stock 

                                  4 81378 18.89                    34.41 18.89                  22.42          75.55 

Mohawk 231331  stock stock  30d  1w 

                                  2 120526 415.85                425.00        415.85 

Triangle Radiator 231337  3d 
 quoting new-need 

core reman 

                                  1 81423 43.15                    43.15 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock 

                                  1 140076 604.75                604.75 

Pace RFQ# 420575



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Suburban 
Truck Parts

P&G Keene Midwest 
Bus

Kirks Auto Neopart 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Prevost CBM USA Rush Truck Hydraulic 
Electric

Area Diesel Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420575

Eldorado 231334  2w 

                                  4 110144 40.89                    43.57          43.47          40.89          88.76 

Muncie Transit 231332  stock  1w  30d  6w 

                                  6 81437 4.66                       11.52          12.79          11.77          15.77 4.66                    12.98 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                  7 81441 41.86                    41.86          53.71          42.21          42.80          52.40 55.38                  43.40 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  60d  1d  stock  stock 4w  stock 

                                  5 81479 20.99                    20.99          23.20          21.21          35.19          25.07 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  stock  5w  21d 

                                  6 81516 8.31                         8.33            9.15            8.31          10.14 10.84                    9.73 

Area Diesel 231352 -                 stock  1d  stock  5w  4w  stock 

                                  1 120553 226.75                226.75 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock 

                                  3 81534 33.25                    33.25          38.02          57.21 

Aftermarket Parts 231327 -                 stock  21d  1w 

                                  5 810007 421.15                448.08        543.88        446.02        588.18        421.15 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock  stock  26w  21d  stock 

                                  4 1010002 3.75                         3.75            3.75            5.75            7.51 

Hydraulic Electric 231326 -                 stock  stock  21d  stock 

                                  5 810019 231.14                242.78        252.81        231.14        311.51        256.42 

Area Diesel 231352 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock  21d 

                                  1 1010005 279.81                279.81 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock 

                                  5 810023 44.69                    44.69          49.65          45.68          59.69          53.03 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  stock  5w  stock 

                                  6 810026 859.71                878.22        990.63        859.71     1,074.63 1,166.65       1,063.37 

Area Diesel 231352 -                 stock  1d  stock  4w 4w  stock 

                                  5 810027 485.93                486.50        552.10        485.93        585.68        584.23 

Area Diesel 231352 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock  21d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Suburban 
Truck Parts

P&G Keene Midwest 
Bus

Kirks Auto Neopart 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Prevost CBM USA Rush Truck Hydraulic 
Electric

Area Diesel Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420575

                                  4 810028 64.13                    78.96 64.13                106.82        134.95 

Gillig 231330 -                 4w stock  30d  2w 

                                  5 1010016 2,116.99          2,116.99     2,403.07     2,125.49     2,936.97     2,568.73 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  stock  7w  21d 

                                  5 1010018 17.70                    36.07          19.21          18.50          21.31          17.70 

Muncie Transit 231332 -                 stock  5d  14d  stock  stock 

                                  4 1210020 42.99                    45.08          43.00 42.99                  70.15 

Gillig 231330 -                 stock  1w 2w  stock 

                                  6 810060 30.79                    35.00          39.09          33.00          35.65          42.46 30.79         

Hydraulic Electric 231326 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  1 1310009 63.70                    63.70 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock 

                                  6 810076 105.40                113.52        117.09        105.40        144.28 137.10             124.99 

Area Diesel 231352 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock 30d  30d 

                                  7 810078 368.00                368.00        737.15        425.19        374.21        546.13 606.84             449.95 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  60d  1d  stock  5w 4w  30d 

                                  6 810079 365.00                368.00        425.19        365.00        374.21        564.54        403.89 

Hydraulic Electric 231326 -                 stock  1d  14d  stock  7w  42d 

                                  5 810080 41.07                    41.07          45.39          44.21          56.17          50.27 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  stock  7w  30d 

                                  9 1010032 73.05                    73.05        105.20        189.80        117.51          77.00        108.09        125.91 87.15                107.80 

Neopart Transit 231338 -                 stock  stock  stock  1d  stock  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  70d 

                                  8 810098 233.91                233.91        373.94        260.72        235.00        237.13        279.35 290.73             262.10 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  60d  1d  14d  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                  6 810110 272.33                333.37        272.33        699.49        413.00 460.00             370.50 

Rush Truck 231324 -                 stock  1d  stock  5w 4w  30d 

                                  7 1010038 28.50                    28.50          50.01          30.00          45.23          58.69 29.25                  53.35 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  14d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d 

                                  6 810125 42.00                    95.72          99.45          91.46        106.85 42.00                105.33 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Suburban 
Truck Parts

P&G Keene Midwest 
Bus

Kirks Auto Neopart 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Prevost CBM USA Rush Truck Hydraulic 
Electric

Area Diesel Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420575

Area Diesel 231352 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock 
 unapproved 

part  30d 

                                  6 810128 450.00                565.63        625.54        450.00        608.39        776.46        692.00 

Hydraulic Electric 231326 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock  stock  30d 

                                  4 810132 108.37                108.37        123.11        143.22 149.20      

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  8w 
 unapproved 

part 

                                  6 1210072 193.31                194.72        225.19        214.09        193.31        257.36        229.10 

Area Diesel 231352 -                 5d  stock  1d  stock  6w  30d 

                                   - 1210074 -                

-                

                                  5 1010044 185.33                185.35        197.40        185.33        448.73        216.80 

Area Diesel 231352 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock  50d 

                                  3 810167 45.95                    53.20 45.95                  63.96 

Gillig 231330 -                 stock stock  2w 

                                  8 810192 1,050.00          1,050.00     1,328.94     1,395.38     1,300.00     1,229.59     1,657.17 1,674.47       1,477.50 

Neopart Transit 231338 -                 stock  5d  1d  stock  stock  6w 4w  30d 

                                  4 1010060 2,156.50          2,156.50     2,388.54     2,822.18     2,528.99 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  7w  30d 

                                  6 810245 210.00                214.52        223.14        210.00        239.47        244.40        250.02 

Hydraulic Electric 231326 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock  7w  30d 

                                  5 1010068 445.98                681.86     1,146.13        689.64     1,557.29        445.98 

Muncie Transit 231332 -                 stock  1d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  5 1010070 189.19                189.19        323.61        292.49        425.32        354.25 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 stock  1d  stock  5w  30d 

                                  2 1110004 69.69                    86.22          69.69 

Muncie Transit 231332 -                 3w  30d 

                                  7 810280 949.99             1,026.24     1,221.72     1,137.99 949.99      955.20             955.53     1,160.00 

Gillig 231330 -                 4w  60d  stock 4w 4w  stokc  4w 

                                  6 810286 24.00                    24.11          26.78          24.00          24.39          31.25          28.34 

Hydraulic Electric 231326 -                 stock  1d  14d  stock  5w  21d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Rome 
Truck - NO 

BID

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Triangle 
Radiator

Interstate 
Power

Suburban 
Truck Parts

P&G Keene Midwest 
Bus

Kirks Auto Neopart 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Prevost CBM USA Rush Truck Hydraulic 
Electric

Area Diesel Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420575

                                  5 810287 1.47                         1.56            1.58            1.47            1.86            1.72 

Area Diesel 231352 -                 stock  1d  stock  4w  30d 

                                  1 1210130 637.15                637.15 

Eldorado 231334 -                 6w 

                                   - 810311 -                

-                

                                   - 810312 -                

-                

                                  5 810315 1,315.34          1,315.34     1,376.90     1,522.75     1,596.75     1,524.81 

Coffman Truck 231339 -                 5d  1d  stock  5w  30d 


	420575

