
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I-O 
Controls

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Interstate 
Power

Suburban 
Truck Parts

P&G Keene Rome 
Truck Parts

Midwest 
Bus

Coffman 
Truck

Kirks Auto Prevost Neopart 
Transit

Battery 
Service

CBM USA Rush Truck Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Eldorado

                                  6 71925 11.56                    17.25          11.56          17.25 15.75         11.58                  12.80 

Hydraulic Electric 231326 -                 16wk  stock  stock stock stock  30d 

                                  3 71733 77.80                    95.15          77.80          78.98 

Aftermarket Parts 231352 -                 stock  stock  30d 

                                  6 71294 0.13                         0.23            0.28            0.44            0.67 0.15                      0.13 

Muncie Transit 231332 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                  4 720074 4.81                         5.60            6.88 4.96                      4.81 

Muncie Transit 231332
 min 10, 
need 4  stock stock  stock 

                                   - 72125 -                

-                

                                  5 71287 0.20                         0.43            0.56            0.92 0.21                      0.20 

Muncie Transit 231332 -                 stock  5d  5w stock  stock 

                                  4 72121 62.19                    67.51 62.19                  63.75          91.75 

Gillig 231330 -                 5w stock
 min 5, 
need 2  stock 

                                  4 72054 22.13                    25.38          22.13          22.15          26.95 

Aftermarket Parts 231327 -                 60d  stock  45d  3w 

                                  7 72057 3.37                         3.37            4.70            9.44            6.76            3.61 7.15           11.98         

Vehicle Maintenance 231320 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock stock 5w

                                  2 72100 40.54                    42.81          40.54 

Aftermarket Parts 231327  stock  stock 

                                  6 72143 10.43                    13.28          10.62          10.43 11.00                  10.95          21.55 

Aftermarket Parts 231327  60d  7w  4w 2w  45d  4w 

                                  5 72136 41.34                    41.34 47.20         72.00                  57.00        207.85 

Aftermarket Parts 231327  stock stock 5w
 10 min, 
need 4  4w 

                                  7 70659 2.69                       12.09            2.69            9.99            4.40 16.92         4.65                    12.62 

CBM USA 231323  stock  stock  10d  stock 2w stock  21d 

                                  6 72135 56.99                    72.05          59.38          57.25 56.99                  61.10          97.15 

Gilig 231330 -                 60d  7w  5w 8w  45d  stock 

                                  6 72058 3.73                         4.71            4.68 16.99         3.73                      4.25        107.95 

Pace RFQ# 420573



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I-O 
Controls

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Interstate 
Power

Suburban 
Truck Parts

P&G Keene Rome 
Truck Parts

Midwest 
Bus

Coffman 
Truck

Kirks Auto Prevost Neopart 
Transit

Battery 
Service

CBM USA Rush Truck Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420573

Muncie Transit 231332  stock  stock stock
 unapproved 

part  stock  stock 

                                  3 71807 10.45                    12.76 54.69                  10.45 

Muncie Transit 231332  stock 30d  stock 

                                  6 71091 0.07                         0.50            0.54            0.43            0.20 0.07                      0.09 

Mohawk 231331 -                 5d  stock  1d  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 71179 0.30                         2.68            0.50 0.30                      0.38 

Mohawk 231331 -                 7d  stock stock  stock 

                                  4 72055 118.75                163.05        148.98        134.35        118.75 

Eldorado 231334 -                 60d  stock  45d  stock 

                                  1 72120 97.15                    97.15 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock 

                                  8 72078 1,761.68          1,761.68     2,059.00     2,584.94     2,209.05 1,975.00   2,693.87       2,089.08     3,464.93 

P&G Keene 231322 -                 stock  stock  60d  4w stock 4w  30d  3w 

                                  1 72144 26.95                    26.95 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock 

                                  5 72148 89.04                  132.93 117.55      89.04                153.00        292.42 

Mohawk 231331 -                 stock stock stock  50d  stock 

                                  5 72156 21.51                    26.45          21.59          21.51 21.99                  22.21 

Aftermarket Parts 231327 -                 60d  7w  4w 8w  45d 

                                  5 72162 29.15                    56.25          57.62 33.02                  29.15          32.35 

Muncie Transit 231332 -                 60d  6w 4w  stock  stock 

                                  1 72163 431.95                431.95 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock 

                                  3 72181 345.55                568.96        727.00        345.55 

Eldorado 231334 -                 12w  11w  4w 

                                  4 72216 147.09                210.00        147.09 152.75             291.55 

Aftermarket Parts 231327 -                 105d  4w 2w  stock 

                                   - 72239 -                

-                



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I-O 
Controls

Vehicle 
Maintenance

Interstate 
Power

Suburban 
Truck Parts

P&G Keene Rome 
Truck Parts

Midwest 
Bus

Coffman 
Truck

Kirks Auto Prevost Neopart 
Transit

Battery 
Service

CBM USA Rush Truck Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420573

                                  2 72264 345.55                598.96        345.55 

Eldorado 231334 -                 12w  6w 

                                  5 72295 25.91                    42.60          42.14 25.91                  26.76          32.35 

Mohawk 231331 -                 60d  stock stock  30d  stock 

                                  4 72301 221.00                221.00        249.95        252.00        279.51 

Suburban Truck Parts 231321 -                 stock  3w  5d  5w 

                                  3 72303 1.29                         1.29            1.36            1.29 

Eldorado 231334 -                 5w 
 6 ONLY, 
need 12  1w 

                                  3 72342 3.66                         6.64            7.39            3.66 

Eldorado 231334 -                 stock  30d  1w 

                                  7 72388 36.75                    78.80          65.49          52.37 38.50         36.75                  64.92          63.00 

Gillig - Availability 231330 -                 stock  7w  stock stock 4w  60d  stock 

                                  1 710004 21.55                    21.55 

Eldorado 231334 -                 1w 

                                  8 710007 14.76                    17.83          18.00          20.02          22.28          18.45          22.09 23.58                  14.76 

Muncie Transit 231332 -                 stock  stock  stock  4w  5d  stock 4w  stock 

                                  1 710008 167.51                167.51 

Eldorado 231334 -                 1w 

                                  4 710019 89.40                  117.78 89.40                111.18        118.75 

Mohawk 231331 -                 5w stock  21d  1w 

                                  1 710027 34.42                    34.42 

Aftermarket Parts 231327 -                 stock 

                                  1 710029 64.75                    64.75 

Eldorado 231334 -                 1w 

                                  4 710049 74.58                    74.58 75.00                  75.59        134.95 

Aftermarket Parts 231327 -                 stock 6w  60d  1w 

                                  1 710080 303.59                303.59 

Aftermarket Parts 231327 -                 5w 

                                  1 710130 82.44                    82.44 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I-O 
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Vehicle 
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Suburban 
Truck Parts

P&G Keene Rome 
Truck Parts

Midwest 
Bus

Coffman 
Truck

Kirks Auto Prevost Neopart 
Transit

Battery 
Service

CBM USA Rush Truck Hydraulic 
Electric

Aftermarket 
Parts

Gillig Mohawk Muncie 
Transit

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420573

Eldorado 231334 -                 4w 

                                  6 710134 370.16                371.44        433.85        433.11        491.00        370.16        467.72 

Aftermarket Parts 231327 -                 stock  7d  stock  60d  stock  21d 

                                  7 710149 308.30                415.00        314.46        308.30        320.00        397.13 387.50             342.74 

Rush Truck 231324 -                 7d  stock  5d  14d  stock 4w  30d 

                                   - 710198 -                

-                

                                  1 710206 146.02                146.02 

Eldorado 231334 -                 2w 

                                   - 710248 -                

-                

                                  4 710260 395.04                395.04        490.25 400.00             438.99 

I/O Controls 231319 -                 12w  10w 4w  60d 

                                   - 710278 -                

-                

                                  5 710291 61.22                  130.24        179.73 150.00             148.00          61.22 

Eldorado 231334 -                 12w  stock 4w  90d  4w 

                                   - 710314 -                

-                

                                   - 710333 -                

NLA -                

                                   - 710334 -                   

NLA -                

                                  1 710335 62.54                    62.54 

Eldorado 231334 -                 4w 


	420573

