Pace RFQ 420570 Due: 11/03/2020
TOTAL
White = No Bid
NN A A AN N A A S U I S R N R U U — U U " N
Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush Truck Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Center of Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number of Bids, Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts Illinois Program
Winning Bidder & PO
Number
3 290114 4.25 4.25 4.40 4.56
Gillig 231342 Stock Stock Stock
6 60734 2.41 4.06 2.62 2.90 2.70 2.44 2.41
4 Stock
Bidding 4
Vehicle Maintenance only at this
Program 231351 - Stock price 11 Weeks Stock Stock Stock
6 290536 74.00 78.46 74.00 86.25 77.11 81.21 92.63
HECS 231343 - Stock Stock 21 Days Stock Stock 75 Days
6 290616 113.89 113.89 117.00 132.25 114.55 125.92 148.70
Gillig 231342 Stock Stock 21 Days Stock Stock 60 Days
5 250583 434.09 434.09 455.02 445.00 439.71 493.46
Gillig 231342 - 1-2 Weeks Stock 10 Days 7-10 Days | 7 Weeks
6 30014 3.10 3.10 3.60 3.55 3.45 6.62 3.73
Mohawk 2 Stock
Manufacturing Balance 45
231345 Stock Stock Stock Stock Days 3-5 Days
3 290646 94.90 94.90 95.28 139.95
7-10
Muncie 231346 - 30 Days 6 Weeks Days
4 290590 8.00 8.00 15.82 10.00 13.99
Autex Automotive
Devices 231340 1 Day Stock 3-4 Weeks | Stock
2 30356 154.50 154.50 194.85
105 Days 10
NFI Parts 231348 QTy.3 - Pc Min. Stock
8 40174 1.52 22.54 1.52 25.21 21.78 23.13 32.07 6.18 26.58
Mohawk 4Stock
Manufacturing Balance 45
231345 Stock Stock 21 Days Stock Stock Days 3-5Days | Stock
6 290537 158.00 162.15 158.00 186.24 159.63 167.83 207.20
5 Stock
Balance 28
HECS 231343 Stock Stock Days Stock Stock Stock
3 290643 11.17 13.10 15.50 11.17
Vehicle Maintenance
Program 231351 30 Days Stock Stock
5 290658 102.51 102.51 117.90 122.96 113.49 131.44
Gillig 231342 Stock 21 Days 3-4 Weeks | Stock Stock
8 41215 68.69 135.99 147.67 124.60 128.74 132.03 167.20 68.69 142.20
Rush Truck Centers of
Illinois 231349 - Stock Nov 21st | Stock Stock 5 Weeks | 60 Days Stock Stock
8 290484 2.44 2.54 2.44 3.37 2.48 3.47 5.50 3.10 2.99
6 Stock
Balance 30
Muncie 231346 Stock Days Stock Stock 60 Days Stock Stock Stock
3 290647 90.33 99.74 90.33 139.95
1-2
NFI Parts 231348 30 Days Weeks




Pace RFQ 420570 Due: 11/03/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
NN A A AN N A A S U I S R N R U U — U U " N
Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush Truck Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Center of Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance

Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts Illinois Program
Winning Bidder & PO
Number

1 290654 28.22 28.22
Gillig 231342 Stock

4 290644 41.59 62.88 49.06 46.50 41.59
Vehicle Maintenance
Program 231351 - 21 Days Stock Stock Stock

8 41035 0.99 9.26 0.99 7.09 6.25 1.18 7.70 5.95 7.09
Mohawk 16 Stock
Manufacturing Balance 2
231345 - Weeks Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock 3-5Days | Stock

9 41227 13.75 25.25 40.77 13.75 23.40 41.60 29.95 34.10 29.95 34.12
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231345 - Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock 5 Weeks [ Stock Stock Stock

6 60380 8.36 8.36 59.98 29.71 11.63 72.05 21.43

2 Stock

Kirk's Automotive Balance 60
231344 Stock Nov 21st  [Days 6 Weeks 3-5Days | Stock

6 60561 41.27 112.54 116.52 41.27 130.22 147.07 122.34
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231345 - Stock Stock Stock 21 Days 5 Weeks 1 Day

3 41169 33.84 33.84 34.42 39.10
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231345 - Stock Stock Stock

9 10199 14.20 21.99 14.20 36.50 31.41 26.14 39.66 19.64 22.79 19.61
Mohawk 7 Stock
Manufacturing Balance 4
231345 Weeks Stock 21 Days Stock Stock 60 Days Stock Stock Stock

8 40907 54.65 74.73 54.65 68.30 78.54 80.90 97.19 268.14 251.68
Mohawk 10 Stock
Manufacturing Balance 1-2
231345 - Weeks Stock Stock Stock 60 Days 3-5Days | Stock

1 60612 37.22 37.22
NFI Parts 231348 - 10 Weeks

2 250621 30.36 35.50 30.36
NFI Parts 231348 - 6 Weeks 6 Weeks

7 40373 1.75 2.68 1.75 2.30 2.07 4.02 2.65 3.08
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231345 - Stock Stock Stock 2-3 Weeks | Stock Stock 3-5 Days

4 60017 0.18 0.18 0.20 0.47 2.92
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231345 - Stock Stock Stock Stock




Pace RFQ 420570 Due: 11/03/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
NN A A AN N A A S U I S R N R U U — U U " N
Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush Truck Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Center of Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts Illinois Program
Winning Bidder & PO
Number
6 290063 1.10 1.60 1.19 1.10 1.50 1.20 2.00
Min.
Qty. 25
Pcs.
Muncie 231346 QTyY. 15 - Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock
4 20535 42.20 52.25 42.20 73.70 46.54
Mohawk 3 Stock 5 Stock
Manufacturing Balance 2-4 Balance 35
231345 - Weeks Stock Days Stock
3 60748 44.63 63.10 44.63 64.67
10 Stock
Balance 1
NFI Parts 231348 - 60 Days Week 75 Days
2 151964 27.70 27.76 27.70
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock Stock
0 290664 - DQ
Not an
approve
- d OEM
0 20712 -
7 41266 904.21 904.21 969.70 931.91 954.88 | 1,322.15 1,042.72 | 1,020.06
Gillig 231342 - Stock Stock 3-4 Weeks | 6 Weeks | 60 Days 3-5Days | Stock
2 290671 18.46 18.46 24.50
Muncie 231346 - 30 Days Stock
0 60770 -
5 290674 170.00 170.00 170.00 195.87 201.25 196.63
Gillig 231342 - Stock Stock 21 Days Stock 60 Days
0 290675 -
0 41283 =
0 152031 -
5 60793 5.3 34.15 SL7E 37.37 40.67 35.07
Coffman Truck Sales
231341 - Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock
8 20724 716.25 813.93 891.31 870.45 716.25 728.43 930.20 857.15 832.78
Neopart 231347 - Stock Nov 24th | 21 Days Stock Stock 60 Days 3-5Days | Stock
1 41294 1,248.12 1,248.12
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
4 20728 10.99 15.51 13.31 10.99 12.61
10 Pc Must be
Min/10 Pc  |ordered in
Std Pk 21 multiples of
NFI Parts 231348 QTy.2 - Nov 24th |Days 10 Stock Stock




Pace RFQ 420570 Due: 11/03/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
N I [ N I S S A S I U E— U U R U I R U U S R S R
Winning Bid Acme Truck  Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS  Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFl Parts ~ Prevost Rome Rush Truck Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Center of Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts Illinois Program
Winning Bidder & PO
Number
1 30472 131.51 131.51
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
1 30473 131.51 131.51
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
2 290695 62.80 62.87 62.80
Muncie 231346 - 75 Days 52 Weeks
5 290696 8.80 8.80 DQ 23.23 10.80 12.64 15.33
Not an
Autex Automotive approved
Devices 231340 - 1 Day OEM. Stock 3-4 Weeks | Stock 60 Days
2 290697 14.97 15.00 14.97
NFI Parts 231348 - 90 Days Stock
3 290700 161.48 163.40 161.48 205.56
Muncie 231346 - Stock 25 Weeks | 120 Days
3 290701 163.00 163.40 163.00 205.56
Muncie 231346 - Stock 25 Weeks | 120 Days
0 30483 -
4 2510000 313.55 480.55 607.87 313.55 530.78
Neopart 231347 - Stock 45 Days 3-4 Weeks | Stock
2 2510002 1,025.63 1,025.63 1,139.18
1 Stock
NORTHWEST HAS 0 Balance 6
Gillig 231342 ON HAND - Weeks 13 Weeks
6 410003 157.36 165.00 181.09 162.26 157.36 173.73 235.00
Neopart 231347 - 4 Weeks Stock 21 Days 3-4 Weeks | 6 Weeks | 60 Days
7 410006 135.87 160.00 DQ 135.87 147.29 143.46 200.82 295.46 287.58
13 Stock Not an
Balance 2 approved
Muncie 231346 - Weeks OEM. Stock Stock Stock 60 Days 3-5Days | Stock
7 410007 106.05 111.03 DQ 114.13 111.52 128.76 143.42 106.05 123.13
Not an
Rush Truck Centers of approved
Illinois 231349 - Stock OEM. Stock Stock Stock 60 Days 3-5Days | Stock
7 410010 126.05 126.50 DQ 126.05 147.42 135.99 258.74 266.16 284.98
Not an
approved
Muncie 231346 - Stock OEM. Stock Stock Stock 60 Days 3-5Days | Stock
3 2510006 67.58 67.99 72.67 67.58
NFI Parts 231348 - 8 Weeks 35 Days Stock
2 1510008 12.50 12.50 12.50
HECS 231343 - Stock Stock




Pace RFQ 420570 Due: 11/03/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
NN A A AN N A A S U I S R N R U U — U U " N
Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush Truck Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Center of Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance

Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts Illinois Program
Winning Bidder & PO
Number

7 410017 858.90 860.00 924.88 889.91 858.90 978.11 | 1,083.30 1,122.39

3 Stock
Balance 3-4

Neopart 231347 - 2 Weeks Nov 24th | 21 Days Weeks 6 Weeks | 60 Days 3-5 Days

0 210002 -

2 110014 106.15 106.15 112.77

11 Stock
Balance 2

Muncie 231346 - Stock Weeks

1 310009 110.60 110.60
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock

5 610025 30.94 31.10 30.94 35.82 39.24 34.89

3 Stock

Coffman Truck Sales Balance 30
231341 - Stock Stock Days Stock Stock

9 610026 115.00 296.48 231.65 120.00 132.00 bQ 297.34 166.03 115.51 159.60 115.00

6 Stock Not an

Suburban Truck Parts Balance approved
231350 WEST HAS 0 CORES - Stock 60 Days Stock Stock OEM. Stock 3-4 Weeks | 10 Weeks 1 Day Stock

3 310014 76.95 184.03 85.92 76.95
NFI Parts 231348 - 30 Days Stock Stock

6 410034 208.12 208.99 235.73 216.11 208.12 224.92 303.91

5 Stock
Balance 2

Neopart 231347 - Weeks Nov 24th | 30 Days 3-4 Weeks | Stock 60 Days

7 410035 376.45 400.00 392.90 383.75 376.45 440.22 479.69 494.20
Neopart 231347 - 6 Weeks Nov 24th | 21 Days 3-4 Weeks | 6 Weeks | 60 Days 3-5 Days

5 2510025 72.20 72.20 79.38 75.15 73.21 87.70
Gillig 231342 - 1-2 Weeks Stock 10 Days 7-10 Days | Stock

1 310018 10.89 10.89
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock

1 2910015 14.64 14.64
NFI Parts 231348 - 18 Weeks

1 610061 4.11 4.11
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock

0 1510107 -

0 310026 -

0 110026 -

0 110027 -

0 1510112 -




Pace RFQ 420570 Due: 11/03/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
N I [ N I S S A S I U E— U U R U I R U U S R S R
Winning Bid Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Rush Truck Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Brake & Diesel Automotive Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufaturi Truck  Center of Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number of Bids, SKU Supply Co.  Service Devices Parts Systems ng Parts Illinois Program
Winning Bidder & PO
Number
0 1510113 -
4 2510067 918.50 918.50 961.26 920.43 976.87
Gillig 231342 - 2 Weeks Stock 7-10 Days | 7 Weeks
0 610083 -
5 110042 33.84 33.84 40.50 39.10 40.91 33.87
Mohawk
Manufacturing
231345 - Stock 30 Days Stock 60 Days Stock
1 2910030 407.95 407.95
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
1 2910031 271.54 271.54
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
5 2510141 75.52 75.52 82.41 78.60 79.47 88.00
Gillig 231342 - 1-2 Weeks Stock 10 Days 7-10 Days | Stock
2 610138 649.98 655.00 649.98
2Pc3
Weeks
Balance 11
NFI Parts 231348 - 6 Weeks Weeks
1 1510264 90.00 90.00
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
1 1510265 111.03 111.03
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
1 2910054 47.22 47.22
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
1 2910055 533.43 533.43
NFI Parts 231348 - 6 Weeks
1 2910056 1,108.98 1,108.98
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
1 1510266 1,344.15 1,344.15
NFI Parts 231348 - Stock
4 2510169 2.47 2.76 2.47 2.80 3.07
Muncie 231346 - 10 Days 21 Days Stock 60 Days




