
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Suburban 

Truck
CBM USA Vehicle 

Maintenance
Kirks Auto Interstate 

Power
Gillig MW Bus Neopart 

Transit
Prevost TP101 Area Diesel Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

                                    4 130684 5.57                          5.74             7.37             5.57             5.65 

Muncie Transit 231266 -                 20d  8w  21d  stock 

                                    1 110101 2.92                          2.92 

Aftermarket Parts 231263 -                 stock 

                                    5 81085 3.97                          4.10             4.16             5.26             4.56             3.97 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  stock  stock  21d  stock 

                                    4 110100 2.45                          2.50           21.95             2.45             2.69 

Aftermarket Parts 231263  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    9 110136 68.89                      69.58           68.89           75.00           81.29         112.90         129.35         101.62           84.48 100.00       

Suburban Truck 231261 -                 stock 
 quantity 

requirement  stock  20d  4w  60d  7w  30d stock

                                    5 130618 228.35                  259.49         369.00         322.53         249.42         228.35 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  7d  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 81361 444.59                  445.57     2,460.20         524.99         444.59 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  7w  30d  stock 

                                    3 81368 1.55                          1.55             1.81             1.70 

Area Diesel 231271 -                 stock  30d  stock 

                                    1 130782 86.35            86.35         

Eldorado 231268 -                stock

                                    4 81409 35.00                      35.96           43.79           35.84           35.00 

Coffman Truck 231272  stock  stock  60d  stock 

81417 21.55            21.55         

Eldorado 231268 2w

                                    4 81422 1.90                          1.95             2.46             2.25             1.90 

Coffman Truck 231272  stock  stock  30d  7d 

                                    5 81431 750.00                  961.00         750.00     1,180.90     1,233.44     1,032.28 

Pace RFQ# 420547



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Suburban 

Truck
CBM USA Vehicle 

Maintenance
Kirks Auto Interstate 

Power
Gillig MW Bus Neopart 

Transit
Prevost TP101 Area Diesel Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420547

Area Diesel 231271  stock  stock  7w  30d  stock 

                                    3 120535 134.00                  241.76         243.32         134.00 

Hydraulic Electric 231257 -                 11w  stock  14d 

                                    4 81444 71.50                      71.50         101.43           76.50           75.57 

Gillig 231258  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 120539 43.70                      56.30           51.41           43.70 

Coffman Truck 231272  5w  30d  stock 

                                    4 120541 44.72                      44.72           55.73           52.65           44.78 

Area Diesel 231271 -                 stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                    7 81533 11.50                      25.87           21.10           12.34           41.80           26.84           11.50           40.90 

Muncie Transit 231266 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 81534 33.25                      33.25           38.02 57.21         

Aftermarket Parts 231263 -                 6w  21d 2w

                                    2 1410000 657.14                  657.14 669.55       

Aftermarket Parts 231263 -                 11w 4w

                                    4 810008 56.68                      57.23           72.27           66.69           56.68 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  stock  30d  stock 

                                    4 810009 3.55                          3.55             4.77             4.45             3.59 

Area Diesel 231271 -                 stock  13w  21d  stock 

                                    5 810010 310.00                  310.00         514.25         376.45         627.27         532.69 

Kirks Auto 231255 -                 stock  stock  stock  21d  10d 

                                    4 810015 128.92                  130.25         180.08         152.48         128.92 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  7w  21d  stock 

                                    5 1010002 3.75                          6.51             3.75             5.75             3.99 7.51           

Aftermarket Parts 231263 -                 stock  stock  21d  stock stock



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Suburban 

Truck
CBM USA Vehicle 

Maintenance
Kirks Auto Interstate 

Power
Gillig MW Bus Neopart 

Transit
Prevost TP101 Area Diesel Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420547

                                    5 1010012 1,219.00           1,219.00     1,432.52     1,766.32     2,558.56     1,339.11 

Kirks Auto 231255 -                 stock  10d  stock  5w  21d 

                                    4 810027 486.50                  486.93         585.68         584.23         486.50 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  stock  21d  stock 

                                    5 810030 2.38                          4.40             2.41             2.91             2.79             2.38 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  stock  stock  21d  stock 

                                    5 810031 8.06                        14.44             8.11             9.66             8.87             8.06 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 60d  stock  4w  21d  stock 

                                    6 1010015 940.00                  940.00     1,236.60     1,163.68     1,657.15         950.00         942.26 

Kirks Auto 231255 -                 stock  stock  stock  4w  stock  stock 

                                    3 1210024 187.55                  193.80         187.55 237.55       

Aftermarket Parts 231263 -                 4w  14w stock

                                    4 810045 344.44                  344.44         480.47         417.95         353.46 

Area Diesel 231271 -                 stock  5w  21d  stock 

                                    6 810046 362.43                  362.43         372.95         558.49         406.55         368.72         370.00 

Neopart Transit 231270 -                 stock  stock  stock  21d  stock  14d 

                                    5 810071 628.89                  628.89     1,052.11         746.25         630.82         850.00 

Area Diesel 231271 -                 stock  7w  21d  stock  14d 

                                    4 1010024 54.10                      54.10           70.69           63.00           56.69 

Area Diesel 231271 -                 stock  7w  21d  stock 

                                    6 810078 360.00                  737.15         369.69         546.13         449.95         368.00         360.00 

Hydraulic Electric 231257 -                 60d  stock  5w  21d  stock  14d 

                                    5 810079 365.00                  369.69         564.54         403.89         368.00         365.00 

Hydraulic Electric 231257 -                 stock  7w  30d  stock  14d 

                                    4 810080 41.07                      44.21           58.17           50.86           41.07 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Suburban 

Truck
CBM USA Vehicle 

Maintenance
Kirks Auto Interstate 

Power
Gillig MW Bus Neopart 

Transit
Prevost TP101 Area Diesel Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420547

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  7w  21d  stock 

                                    5 1210038 1,969.69           2,100.57     1,969.69     2,977.00     2,208.25     1,976.86 

Area Diesel 231271 -                 stock  stock  10w  60d  7d 

                                    4 1010028 10.26                      10.45           13.30           11.92           10.26 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 1010029 25.56                      25.56           36.24           42.77           42.37           35.07 

Neopart Transit 231270 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    7 810093 20.70                      33.82           20.70           35.90           39.74           35.90           31.60           20.98 

Vehicle Maintenance 231254 -                 stock  stock  stock  7w  21d  5d  stock 

                                    3 810130 372.66                  549.13         439.05         372.66 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 5w  30d  stock 

                                    5 1210070 45.47                      50.75           62.96           59.29           57.50           45.47 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 60d  stock  6w  stock  stock 

                                    6 810141 54.40                1,050.00           59.89           73.88           54.40           59.00           55.00 

Muncie Transit 231266 -                
 bidding 4, 

need 6  stock  3w  stock  stock  14d 

                                    4 810152 494.86                  494.86         652.70         583.60         497.25 

Area Diesel 231271 -                 stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                    3 810167 45.95                      45.95           53.89 63.96         

Gillig 231258 -                 stock  stock 6w

                                    1 1010047 427.00          427.00       

Eldorado 231268 -                8w

                                    4 810180 5.90                          6.05             7.79             6.95             5.90 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 1210087 60.96                      62.36         103.26           72.30           60.96           70.00 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  7w  30d  stock  14d 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Suburban 

Truck
CBM USA Vehicle 

Maintenance
Kirks Auto Interstate 

Power
Gillig MW Bus Neopart 

Transit
Prevost TP101 Area Diesel Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420547

                                    5 810192 1,000.00           1,283.36     1,667.22     1,478.35     1,330.94     1,000.00 

Hydraulic Electric 231257 -                 stock  6w  30d  stock  stock 

                                    4 810197 136.98                  152.23         167.27         149.95         136.98 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  7w  30d  stock 

                                    4 1210091 826.60                  826.60     1,077.40     1,010.45         900.35 

Area Diesel 231271 -                 stock  4w  30d  stock 

                                    1 810215 21.50            21.50         

Eldorado 231268 -                6W

                                    4 810220 387.46                  390.36         587.48         457.99         387.46 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                    3 810231 231.01                  295.54         256.70         231.01 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  30d  stock 

                                    6 1010061 890.00                  894.00         984.40     1,143.86     1,680.97         890.00         916.66 

Kirks Auto 231255 -                 stock 
 bidding 1, 

need 2  stock  9w 
 bidding 1, 

need 2  stock 

                                    4 1210113 615.90                  616.17         871.44         729.80         615.90 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  4w  30d  5d 

                                    6 1210119 948.69              1,106.15         948.69     1,388.29     1,575.38     1,360.50     1,224.25 

Neopart Transit 231270 -                 stock  stock  stock  6w  30d  stock 

                                    4 1010075 87.99                      88.64         116.90         103.90           87.99 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  5w  30d  stock 

                                    4 1010076 87.99                      88.64         116.90         101.20           87.99 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  5w  stock  stock 

                                    3 1010077 659.90                  934.62         792.45         659.90 

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 7w  30d  stock 

                                    4 810314 34.57                      36.10           41.11           36.70           34.57 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Rome Truck - 

NO BID
Suburban 

Truck
CBM USA Vehicle 

Maintenance
Kirks Auto Interstate 

Power
Gillig MW Bus Neopart 

Transit
Prevost TP101 Area Diesel Aftermarket 

Parts
Muncie 
Transit

Coffman 
Truck

Hydraulic 
Electric

Eldorado

Pace RFQ# 420547

Coffman Truck 231272 -                 stock  4w  30d  stock 

                                    - 810311 -                

-                

                                    - 810312 -                

-                


	420547

