

Pace

RFQ# 420437

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Rome Truck Parts NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart Transit	Muncie Transit	Area Diesel	Suburban Truck Parts	Aftermarket Parts	Prevost	Midwest Bus - NO BID	Coffman Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Mohawk	Gillig	Eldorado	
NO # of Bids																		
Eldorado	231125																stock	
1	100235	18.85															18.85	
Eldorado	231125																stock	
6	81431	750.00				1,000.00	1,206.96	750.00		1,386.10			784.77	760.00				
Area Diesel	231126	-				bid 1 only, need 4	30d	stock		5w			stock	14d				
1	100238	494.29															494.29	
Eldorado	231125																2w	
4	81516	8.72					9.93			10.26			8.72		10.45			
Coffman Truck	231128						21d			5w			stock		28d			
3	1010002	3.75					5.75			3.75							7.51	
Aftermarket Parts	231120	-					21d			stock							3w	
4	810019	231.10					257.01	231.10		327.90			242.78					
Area Diesel	231126	-					30d	stock		stock			stock					
1	1010005	279.18															279.18	
Eldorado	231125	-															stock	
8	1010011	930.07				1,112.80	1,124.36	1,124.36	1,075.59	1,280.09	1,611.22		930.07		1,097.00			
Coffman Truck	231128	-				stock	21d	stock	stock	4w	60d		stock		stock			
6	810026	859.71					1,068.99	859.71		1,083.49			878.20	875.00	1,148.21			
Area Diesel	231126	-					stock	stock		4w			stock	14d	stock			
5	810027	485.00					584.25	486.94		585.68			486.50	485.00				
Hydraulic Electric	231122	-					30d	stock		stock			stock	14d				
6	810030	1.49					2.64	2.41		2.95	4.40		2.38		1.49			

Pace

RFQ# 420437

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Rome Truck Parts NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart Transit	Muncie Transit	Area Diesel	Suburban Truck Parts	Aftermarket Parts	Prevost	Midwest Bus - NO BID	Coffman Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Mohawk	Gillig	Eldorado	
NO # of Bids																		
Coffman Truck	231128	-					30d	stock		stock	stock		stock		unapproved part			
6	810031	1.81					8.87	8.11		9.82	14.44		8.06		1.81			
Coffman Truck	231128	-					30d	stock		4w	60d		stock		unapproved part			
3	1310008	40.79					79.25			40.79							62.58	
Aftermarket Parts	231120	-					21d			4w							stock	
5	810065	9.66					44.83	45.09		56.84			44.35		9.66			
Mohawk	231124	-					21d	stock		stock			stock		2w			
5	810071	630.82					747.00	634.74		1,056.79			630.82	850.00				
Coffman Truck	231128	-					21d	stock		7w			stock	14d				
4	810101	205.69					242.70	205.69		258.41			206.35					
Area Diesel	231126	-					stock	stock		stock			stock					
4	810125	42.00					105.45			107.14			94.72		42.00			
Coffman Truck	231128	-					21d			stock			stock		unapproved part			
3	810130	372.66					438.19			558.49			372.66					
Coffman Truck	231128	-					21d			5w			stock					
1	1210074	179.92															179.92	
Eldorado	231125	-															stock	
4	810143	9.32					10.27	10.48		11.50			9.32					
Coffman Truck	231128	-					21d	stock		3w			stock					
1	810166	48.55															48.55	
Eldorado	231125	-															stock	
4	1210087	60.96					72.85	63.69		111.87			60.96					
Coffman Truck	231128	-					21d	stock		7w			stock					

Pace

RFQ# 420437

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																	
	0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Rome Truck Parts NO BID	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart Transit	Muncie Transit	Area Diesel	Suburban Truck Parts	Aftermarket Parts	Prevost	Midwest Bus - NO BID	Coffman Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Mohawk	Gillig	Eldorado	
5	810302	22.37					26.46	22.75		29.72			22.37		27.67			
Coffman Truck	231128	-					21d	stock		stock			stock		stock			
5	810309	4.50					5.11	4.57		5.98			4.50		4.62			
Coffman Truck	231128	-					stock	stock		stock			stock		unapproved part			