

Pace

RFQ# 420436

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	IO Controls	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart Transit	P&G Keene	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck Parts - NO BID	Prevost	Midwest Bus Parts - NO BID	Kirks Auto	Battery Systems	Hydraulic Electric	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																			
4	71089	0.03	0.35					0.03	0.17									0.04	
Muncie Transit	231119	-	3d					stock	stock									stock	
3	71733	77.80						78.90	77.80			95.15							
Aftermarket Parts	231120	-						28d	stock			stock							
2	71500	29.75						29.75									29.99		
Muncie Transit	231119	-						37d									stock		
5	71441	6.38						6.38	7.50								6.99	6.99	26.95
Muncie Transit	231119							stock	stock								stock	stock	stock
4	72057	3.37			3.37				3.54								7.15	12.20	
Vehicle Maintenance	231117	-			stock				stock								stock	3w	
6	72143	10.43				10.62		11.05	10.43			13.28					10.50		21.55
Aftermarket Parts	231120	-				7w		42d	5w			60d					4w		4w
2	71540	58.59						61.67											58.59
Eldorado	231125	-						stock											stock
1	72126	37.75																	37.75
Eldorado	231125	-																	stock
6	72135	57.38				59.38		61.10	57.38			72.05					57.63		97.15
Aftermarket Parts	231120	-				7w		42d	stock			60d					6w		4w
4	72055	118.75						134.35	152.99			163.05							118.75
Eldorado	231125							37d	stock			60d							stock
5	71442	5.65						5.65	7.40								7.08	7.08	26.95
Muncie Transit	231119							30d	stock								stock	stock	4w
5	72109	620.84		1,083.82				1,205.50	1,257.57								975.00		620.84
Eldorado	231125			8w				90d	stock								2w		stock

Pace

RFQ# 420436

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	IO Controls	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart Transit	P&G Keene	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck Parts - NO BID	Prevost	Midwest Bus Parts - NO BID	Kirks Auto	Battery Systems	Hydraulic Electric	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado
NO # of Bids																			
5	72156	21.51				21.59		22.22	21.51			26.45					21.99		
	Aftermarket Parts	231120				7w		42d	9w			60d					6w		
5	72184	4.57						5.46	4.57							9.95	8.60		11.83
	Aftermarket Parts	231120	-					20d	stock							14d	6w		stock
9	72202	26.92			26.92	36.02		27.40	32.52	27.34		26.93					40.28	34.52	32.35
	Vehicle Maintenance	231117			stock	4w		30d	8w	stock		75d					4w	30d	stock
1	72204	18.85																	18.85
	Eldorado	231125																	stock
4	72216	147.25							148.34			210.00					147.25		291.55
	Gillig	231123	-						stock			105d					6w		stock
5	72238	1,417.45		1,736.50				1,950.10	2,396.37								1,525.00		1,417.45
	Eldorado	231125	-	8w				60d	14w								6w		stock
1	72239	26.95																	26.95
	Eldorado	231125	-																stock
5	72295	25.91						30.75	42.91			42.60						25.91	32.35
	Mohawk	231124	-					30d	stock			60d						stock	stock
1	72301	245.00													245.00				
	Battery Systems	231121	-												6w				
1	710004	21.55																	21.55
	Eldorado	231125	-																4w
7	710007	14.76			17.23	22.51		14.76	22.88	18.00		20.02						24.95	
	Muncie Transit	231119	-		stock	4w		stock	stock	stock		stock						3w	
7	710033	12.86			12.86	13.58		12.88	15.99	13.38		14.64						16.77	
	Vehicle Maintenance	231117	-		stock	stock		stock	stock	stock		60d						3w	



