

Pace

RFQ # 420393

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

		TOTAL																	
		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	Prevost	Vehicle Maintenance	MW Bus	Suburban Truck	Eldorado National	Neopart Transit	Rex Sales	Hydraulic Electric	Kirks Auto	Area Diesel	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman Truck	Gillig	Mohawk
1	1210074	367.89							367.89										
TBD		-							3w										
5	130684	5.57		5.74											5.57	7.58	5.65		5.68
Muncie Transit		-		20d											21d	8w	stock		4w
5	130756	577.96		577.96			612.00			1,209.60						1,538.60			953.63
Interstate Power		-		stock			7d			10d						stock			3w
9	110136	68.89		81.29	129.35	68.89		69.58	113.44				72.50		76.62	106.58	73.88		
Suburban Truck				45d	60d	qty change on bid		stock	14w				stock		30d	7w	5d		
3	110058	2.86													5.87	5.24			2.86
Mohawk		-													21d	stock			stock
6	100226	1,175.00									1,200.00			1,976.00	2,515.36	2,520.21	1,896.85		1,175.00
TBD - REBID		-									stock			stoc	21d	7w	stock		10d
7	100227	950.00								996.80	950.00			1,458.10	1,567.13	1,972.68	1,432.97		980.55
TBD - REBID		-							10d		stock			stock	21d	5w	stock		stock
4	120540	47.30												47.30	55.15	59.04	47.40		
Area Diesel		-												stock	21d	5w	stock		
1	120553	226.75							226.75										
Eldorado National		-							4w										
1	1010005	279.18							279.18										
Eldorado National									stock										
2	1210011	78.34							151.15							78.34			
Aftermarket Parts									stock							stock			
7	1010014	3.50									3.50		6.50	7.67	8.83	5.79	7.38		6.16
Rex Sales											stock		stock	stock	21d	stock	stock		unapproved part

Pace		RFQ # 420393																	
WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck - NO BID	Interstate Power	Prevost	Vehicle Maintenance	MW Bus	Suburban Truck	Eldorado National	Neopart Transit	Rex Sales	Hydraulic Electric	Kirks Auto	Area Diesel	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Coffman Truck	Gillig	Mohawk
7	1010015	894.00								1,236.60	1,295.00		894.00	1,163.85	1,700.00	1,657.15	962.75		1,040.00
	Kirks Auto									stock	stock		stock	stock	stock	4w	stock		2e
4	1010016	2,095.00												2,095.00	2,588.64	2,936.97	2,119.60		
	Area Diesel	-												stock	21d	7w	stock		
1	1210023	124.15							124.15										
	Eldorado National								stock										
4	1010025	8.08												8.22	9.72	10.66	8.08		
	Coffman Truck													stock	21d	stock	stock		
6	1010028	6.45										10.25		10.47	11.92	13.78	10.26		6.45
	Hydraulic Electric	-										14d		stock	stock	stock	stock		unapproved part
7	1010032	66.00								80.34			66.00	108.10	114.54	125.91	105.20		91.20
	Hydraulic Electric	-								stock		14d		stock	stock	stock	stock		unapproved part
4	1010035	87.55			94.93										103.05	115.50	87.55		
	Coffman Truck	-			60d										21d	7w	stock		
4	1010036	87.55			154.15										103.05	115.50	87.55		
	Coffman Truck	-			60d										21d	7w	stock		
4	1210078	339.44							567.68						339.89	339.44		375.00	
	Aftermarket Parts	-							stock						63d	stock		8w	
4	1010044	185.00												185.00	216.80	524.49	185.35		
	Area Diesel	-												stock	21d	5w	stock		
3	1010060	2,156.50													2,530.00	2,829.86	2,156.50		
	Coffman Truck	-													21d	7w	7d		
8	1010061	894.00								984.40	1,040.00		894.00	1,144.50	990.11	1,729.83	946.88		955.00
	Kirks Auto	-								stock	stock		stock	stock	21d	9w	stock		stock

