

Pace

RFQ# 420392

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck Parts - NO BID	P&G Keene	Rex Sales	CBM US	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado National	MW Bus - NO BID	Muncie Transit	Hydraulic Electric	Prevost	Area Diesel	Kirks Auto	Neopart - NO BID	Coffman Truck	Gillig	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts
6	80883	1.53								16.00	1.54	20.58					16.00	1.53	18.40
Mohawk		-								stock	stock	60d					stock	stock	stock
6	81089	1.52				3.95				4.63			4.15			4.05		1.52	5.84
CBM US		-				stock				21d			stock			stock		unapproved part	5w
3	81285	817.47						1,295.95		817.47									1,094.41
Muncie Transit		-						stock		60d									5w
9	81343	7.75			8.00		8.58			25.13		27.96	23.01	7.75		14.20		10.36	30.44
Kirks Auto					stock		stock			21d		60d	stock	stock		stock		unapproved part	4w
4	81377	2.75								3.25			2.80			2.75			3.57
Coffman Truck		-								21d			stock			stock			5w
4	81378	18.89						46.69		22.42								18.89	35.80
Mohawk		-						stock		stock								2w	stock
4	81384	5.22								6.16			5.28			5.22			7.17
Coffman Truck		-								21d			stock			stock			5w
6	81409	33.00								35.84	33.00		40.20			35.18		33.29	44.29
Hydraulic Electric		-								stock	14d		stock			stock		unapproved part	stock
1	81412	27.00						27.00											
Eldorado National		-						stock											
4	81430	279.36								325.65						279.36		290.44	360.43
Coffman Truck										21d						stock		3w	5w
2	81432	2,041.15						2,041.15											2,535.17
Eldorado National								6w											6w
5	81485	57.23								68.86			58.01			57.23		72.31	75.52
Coffman Truck										21d			stock			stock		3w	stock

		RFQ# 420392																	
Pace		TOTAL																	
WHITE=NO BID		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck Parts - NO BID	P&G Keene	Rex Sales	CBM US	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado National	MW Bus - NO BID	Muncie Transit	Hydraulic Electric	Prevost	Area Diesel	Kirks Auto	Neopart - NO BID	Coffman Truck	Gillig	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts
5	81507	2.73								5.67			5.11			5.03		2.73	6.76
	Coffman Truck									21d			stock			stock		unapproved part	7w
4	810005	40.66								98.72			88.91			83.53			40.66
	Aftermarket Parts									21d			stock			stock			7w
5	810007	421.15		448.08				421.15		588.68				543.88			425.00		
	Availability - P&G Keene			stock				4w		30d				2w			6w		
4	810026	859.71								1,070.65			859.71			878.22			1,086.47
	Area Diesel									21d			stock			stock			4w
4	810027	486.50								584.25			486.69			486.50			587.27
	Coffman Truck									21d			stock			stock			stock
6	810030	1.51								2.64		4.40	2.41			4.40		1.51	2.96
	Area Diesel									21d		stock	stock			stock		unapproved part	stock
4	810063	149.69								182.20			149.69	215.20					328.23
	Area Diesel									30d			stock	stock					7w
4	810064	2,838.92								4,540.00			3,099.00			2,838.92			5,572.27
	Coffman Truck									30d			stock			stock			7w
5	810073	102.49								102.50	103.00		104.05			102.49			124.48
	Coffman Truck									stock	14d		stock			stock			7w
7	810078	368.00								449.95	368.00	737.15	368.69			368.00		566.84	546.13
	Coffman Truck									21d	14d	60d	stock			stock		2w	stock
5	810079	369.00								449.95	370.00		369.69			369.00			570.96
	Coffman Truck									21d	14d		stock			stock			7w
7	810093	21.70								36.75	21.70		35.90			31.60			40.38
	Hydraulic Electric					stock	stock			21d	14d		stock			5d			7w

Pace

RFQ# 420392

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck Parts - NO BID	P&G Keene	Rex Sales	CBM US	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado National	MW Bus - NO BID	Muncie Transit	Hydraulic Electric	Prevost	Area Diesel	Kirks Auto	Neopart - NO BID	Coffman Truck	Gillig	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts
6	810098	235.90								262.10		373.94	236.41			235.90		288.88	279.35
	Coffman Truck	-								stock		60d	stock			stock		stock	stock
5	810101	207.00								242.75	207.00		284.65			207.44			261.41
	Hydraulic Electric	-								stock	14d		stock			stock			stock
5	810110	333.37								370.60			343.69			333.37		492.37	488.09
	Coffman Truck	-								30d			stock			stock		3w	stock
5	810125	42.00								105.50			91.49			94.72		42.00	107.38
	Area Diesel	-								30d			stock			stock		unapproved part	stock
3	810130	372.66								438.20						372.66			561.68
	Coffman Truck	-								30d						stock			5w
5	810141	25.86								54.40			59.99			59.00		25.86	74.74
	Muncie Transit	-								stock			stock			stock		unapproved part	3w
4	810142	53.31								62.95			57.09			53.31			67.97
	Coffman Truck	-								30d			stock			stock			stock
5	810154	7.97								9.45			8.05			7.97		10.51	9.56
	Coffman Truck	-								30d			stock			stock		unapproved part	stock
1	810166	48.55																	
	Eldorado National	-									4w								
2	810169	24.86									25.49								24.86
	Less lead time - Eldorado	-									3w								21w
1	810170	6.51									6.51								
	Eldorado National	-									3w								
5	810182	95.00								117.35	95.00		101.39			99.71			135.79
	Hydraulic Electric	-								stock	14d		stock			stock			stock

Pace

RFQ# 420392

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Rome Truck Parts - NO BID	P&G Keene	Rex Sales	CBM US	Vehicle Maintenance	Eldorado National	MW Bus - NO BID	Muncie Transit	Hydraulic Electric	Prevost	Area Diesel	Kirks Auto	Neopart - NO BID	Coffman Truck	Gillig	Mohawk	Aftermarket Parts
5	810206	9.81								11.50	23.99		11.15			9.81			12.85
	Coffman Truck	-								21d	14d		stock			stock			5w
4	810209	17.74								19.82			17.74			18.36			23.19
	Area Diesel	-								30d			stock			stock			5w
6	810218	4.02								5.38	4.10		4.63			4.60		4.02	6.05
	Hydraulic Electric	-								30d	14d		stock			stock		unapproved part	13w
3	810222	167.13								188.49						167.13			203.51
	Coffman Truck	-								30d						5d			5w
4	810225	599.16								718.49			599.16			646.06			796.04
	Area Diesel	-								30d			stock			stock			7w
5	810251	658.19								743.29	725.00		658.19			703.76			888.28
	Area Diesel	-								30d	14d		stock			stock			5w
5	810269	1,465.16								1,589.76			1,468.64	2,004.69		1,465.16			2,176.04
	Coffman Truck	-								stock			stock	stock		stock			7w
5	810272	59.36								66.35			60.35			59.36		78.72	82.91
	Coffman Truck	-								30d			stock			stock		3w	5w
5	810274	60.66								68.20			61.66			60.66		80.45	84.72
	Coffman Truck	-								stock			stock			stock		4w	5w
2	810301	450.33								536.80						450.33			
		-								45d						5d			